

## NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

BID TITLE: NCEPC CLASSROOM & OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT				BID NUMBER: 1529-N	
SPONSORING DISTRICT: Cajon Valley Union SD		CONTACT: Teri Svacina	EMAIL: svacinat@cajonvalley.net	PH: 619-588-3001	
DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)		MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00	CONTRACT PERIOD: <b>02/05/2020-12/31/2020</b>		
VENDOR NAME	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX NUMBERS	CONTACT NAME	CASH DISC	DVBE
ARENSON OFFICE FURNITURE	8185 CAMINO SANTA FE SAN DIEGO, CA 92121	Phone: 858.453.2411 Fax: 858.453.1607	Perry Arenson <a href="mailto:perry@arenson.com">Email Sales: perry@arenson.com</a> <a href="mailto:perry@arenson.com">Email Orders: perry@arenson.com</a>	NO	YES
CONCEPTS SCHOOL AND OFFICE FURNISHINGS	27480 COLT COURT TEMECULA, CA 92590	Phone: 951.296.5591 Fax: 951.296.5594	Patrick Flood <a href="mailto:pflood@concepts-furnishings.com">Email Sales: pflood@concepts-furnishings.com</a> <a href="mailto:stephanie@concepts-furnishings.com">Email Orders: stephanie@concepts-furnishings.com</a>	NO	YES
METEOR EDUCATION	690 NE 23rd AVENUE GAINESVILLE, FL 32609	Phone: 800.699.7516 Fax: 877.373.0622	<a href="mailto:sbolle@meteoreducation.com">Email Sales: sbolle@meteoreducation.com</a> <a href="mailto:orders@meteoreducation.com">Email Orders: orders@meteoreducation.com</a>	NO	YES
OFFICE & ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS, INC (OES)	8480 UTICA AVENUE RANCHO CUCAMONGA CA, 91730	Phone: 877.637.3678 Fax: 909.527.4647	Preston Evans <a href="mailto:preston@oesofficefurniture.com">Email Sales: preston@oesofficefurniture.com</a> <a href="mailto:penny@oesofficefurniture.com">Email Orders: penny@oesofficefurniture.com</a>	NO	YES
PARRON HALL	9655 GRANITE RIDGE DRIVE STE 100 SAN DIEGO, CA 93123	Phone: 800.239.0345 Fax: 858.292.7077	James Herr <a href="mailto:jherr@parronhall.com">Email Sales: jherr@parronhall.com</a> <a href="mailto:small@parronhall.com">Email Orders: small@parronhall.com</a>	NO	YES
SCHOOL SPECIALTY FURNITURE & EQUIPMENT	100 PARAGON PARKWAY MANSFIELD, OH 44903	Phone: 800.305.0174 x1656 Fax: 800.818.3337	Leonard Adkins <a href="mailto:leonard.adkins@schoolspecialty.com">Email Sales: leonard.adkins@schoolspecialty.com</a> <a href="mailto:orders@schoolspecialty.com">Email Orders: orders@schoolspecialty.com</a>	NO	YES
SIERRA SCHOOL EQUIPMENT COMPANY	1911 MINERAL COURT BAKERSFIELD, CA 93308	Phone: 661.399.2993 Fax: 661.399.0218	Greg McDermott <a href="mailto:sales@sseinc.com">Email Sales: sales@sseinc.com</a> <a href="mailto:sales@sseinc.com">Email Orders: sales@sseinc.com</a>	NO	YES
SOUTHWEST SCHOOL SUPPLY, INC.	3790 DE FOREST CIRCLE JURUPA VALLEY, CA 91752	Phone: 800.227.7159 Fax: 909.980.7159	Andrew Johnson <a href="mailto:andrew@southwestschool.com">Email Sales: andrew@southwestschool.com</a> <a href="mailto:biddesk@southwestschool.com">Email Orders: biddesk@southwestschool.com</a>	NO	YES
TOTAL LEARNING SPACE (TLS) CHOICE, INC.	1800 E. MCFADDEN AVE, #2 SANTA ANA, CA 92705	Phone: 714.922.3385 Fax: 714.660.7604	Brooks Berry <a href="mailto:brooks.berry@tlschoice.com">Email Sales: brooks.berry@tlschoice.com</a> <a href="mailto:brooks.berry@tlschoice.com">Email Orders: brooks.berry@tlschoice.com</a>	NO	NO
VIRCO MANUFACTURING, INC.	2027 HARPERS WAY TORRANCE, CA 90501	Phone: 800.448.4726 Fax: 800.258.7367	Mark Friesz <a href="mailto:markfriesz@virco.com">Email Sales: markfriesz@virco.com</a> <a href="mailto:orders@virco.com">Email Orders: orders@virco.com</a>	NO	YES

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
<b>CHAIRS, STUDENT</b>								
<b>Series 1</b>		CHAIR, student, stacking, one-piece plastic shell with chrome frame. ABC #7100, Discovery Series D10, Classroom Select Traditional Series OR APPROVED EQUAL						
1a	EA	17 1/2" height ABC #7107-C, Discovery Series, D10A, or CS 1357316 OR Alumni C-EXPL-18	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	CLASSROOM SELECT 1357316	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 29.74 \$ 29.74 \$ 29.74	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
1b	EA	15 1/2" height ABC #7105-C, Discover Series, D10B or CS 1357317 OR Alumni C-EXPL-16	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	CLASSROOM SELECT 1357317	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 27.76 \$ 27.76 \$ 27.76	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
1c	EA	13 1/2" height ABC #7103-C, Discover Series, D10C, or CS 1357318 OR Alumni C-EXPL-14	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	CLASSROOM SELECT 1357318	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 25.16 \$ 25.16 \$ 25.16	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
1d	EA	11 1/2" height ABC #7101-C, Discover Series, D10D, or CS 1357319 OR Alumni C-EXPL-12	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	CLASSROOM SELECT 1357319	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 25.62 \$ 25.62 \$ 25.62	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
<b>CHAIRS, TEACHER</b>								
2	EA	CHAIR, Teacher, with casters, one-piece polypropylene shell with flange opening in back. Chrome frame with 2" carpet casters ABC 7167-C, OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 7167	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 58.43 \$ 58.43 \$ 58.43	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
3	EA	CHAIR, Teacher, with casters, one-piece polypropylene shell with flange opening in back. Chrome frame with 2" carpet casters Artcobell D16AC, OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL D16A	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 53.21 \$ 53.21 \$ 53.21	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
<b>MISCELLANEOUS CHAIRS, STOOLS, &amp; SOFT SEATING</b>								
4	EA	CHAIR folding, 19-gauge 7/8" round tubular steel (rear legs: 22-gauge), 2 riveted cross braces powder coated, minimum 10-year warranty National Public Seating NPS-50 OR APPROVED EQUAL	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 50 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1364281	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 16.98 \$ 16.98 \$ 16.98	Y	10 YEAR
5	EA	CHAIR folding, 19-gauge 7/8" round tubular steel (rear legs: 22-gauge), 3 riveted cross braces, powder coated, padded seat, minimum 10-year warranty National Public Seating NPS1300 OR APPROVED EQUAL	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 1300 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1364290	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 24.93 \$ 24.93 \$ 24.93	Y	10 YEAR
6	EA	CHAIR folding, 19-gauge 7/8" round tubular steel (rear legs: 22-gauge), 2 riveted cross braces powder coated, padded seat, minimum 10-year warranty National Public Seating NPS1200 OR APPROVED EQUAL	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 1200 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1362374	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 24.49 \$ 24.49 \$ 24.49	Y	10 YEAR

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
7	EA	CHAIR TRUCK, for line items 4-6 National Public Seating NPS DY-50 OR APPROVED EQUAL	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS DY-50 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 677299	1-100	\$ 190.73	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 190.73		
					>501	\$ 190.73		
8	EA	CHAIR, Folding Poly Fan Back, all colors, 18-gauge 7/8" round tubular frame. National Public Seating, series 1100, OR APPROVED EQUAL.	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 1100 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 679323	1-100	\$ 26.16	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 26.16		
					>501	\$ 26.16		
9	EA	CHAIR RACK, vertical, 7-gauge main frame features channeled steel with tube in tube design at peak stress point of frame for added strength and stability. 14-gauge cross braces, 16-gauge hanging rods, Heavy duty caster to uphold a 325lb. weight capacity and measures 4" x 1 1/4", swivel wheels for easy gliding, dark brown powder coat finish, heavy duty casters, with 72 chair capacity. NPS #84W/EXT8, Virco HCT6072, OR APPROVED EQUAL.	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 84/EXT8 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1639998E	1-100	\$ 315.51	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 315.51		
					>501	\$ 315.51		
10	EA	CHAIR, Music, contoured plastic seat, 97 degree seat-to-back angle, 16-gauge metal tubing, minimum 5 year warranty NPS #8210 OR APPROVED EQUAL.	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 8210 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 678773	1-100	\$ 59.22	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 59.22		
					>501	\$ 59.22		
Series 11		CHAIR, task, highback,ergonomic with 9-function adjustments, height, tilt, sliding seat, and back control, carpet casters, 12-yr. warranty, Sit On It or Office Master OR APPROVED EQUAL						
11a	EA	Above chair Grade 1 or Grade A fabric. SIT ON IT #2723, OFFICE MASTER PT78 OR APPROVED EQUAL	ARENSON OFFICE	OFFICE MASTER PT78 GRADE 1	1-100	\$ 275.63	N	12 YEARS
					101-500	\$ 275.63		
					>501	\$ 275.63		
11b	EA	Above chair Grade B or Grade 2 fabric. SIT ON IT #2723, OFFICE MASTER PT78 OR APPROVED EQUAL	ARENSON OFFICE	OFFICE MASTER PT78 GRADE 2	1-100	\$ 284.23	N	12 YEARS
					101-500	\$ 284.23		
					>501	\$ 284.23		
11c	EA	T-Arms, adjustable height, adjustable width, for Line Items 11a & 11b SIT ON IT A142, OFFICE MASTER KR200 OR APPROVED EQUAL	ARENSON OFFICE	OFFICE MASTER KR-200	1-100	\$ 49.05	N	12 YEARS (Pads Excluded)
					101-500	\$ 49.05		
					>501	\$ 49.05		
12	EA	CHAIR, One-piece Polypropylene shell with Back, Tubular legs with glides, assorted seat colors and assorted leg finishes, 30% more surface area, 18" seat height Artcobell D10X (A+) OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL D10X	1-100	\$ 44.70	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 44.70		
					>501	\$ 44.70		

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
13	EA	STOOL, Polypropylene seat 13.25" in diameter, tubular legs with footrest and glides, assorted seat colors and assorted leg finishes Adjustable height 19" - 27.5" in 1" increments Artcobell 801 OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 801	1-100	\$ 82.27	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 82.27		
					>501	\$ 82.27		
Series 14		STOOL, One-piece Polypropylene Shell with Back, tubular legs with footrest and glides, assorted shell colors and assorted leg finishes, Artcobell AS4ST OR APPROVED EQUAL						
14a	EA	#AS4ST24 - 24" Seat Height	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL AS4ST24	1-100	\$ 114.17	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 114.17		
					>501	\$ 114.17		
14b	EA	#AS4ST30 - 30" Seat Height	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL AS4ST30	1-100	\$ 117.45	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 117.45		
					>501	\$ 117.45		
Series 15		STOOL, Heavy Duty Z leg design, 12 guage chrome plated steel frame, TPU glides, non skid grip on footring, available in 3 sizes, with or without backrest, National Public Seating OR APPROVED EQUAL						
15a	EA	24" NPS 6624	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 6624 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1366664	1-100	\$ 83.41	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 83.41		
					>501	\$ 83.41		
15b	EA	24" with back NPS 6624B	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 6624B SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1366667	1-100	\$ 112.24	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 112.24		
					>501	\$ 112.24		
15c	EA	22" NPS 6622	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 6622 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1366663	1-100	\$ 80.96	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 80.96		
					>501	\$ 80.96		
15d	EA	22" with back NPS 6622B	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 6622B SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1366666	1-100	\$ 109.38	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 109.38		
					>501	\$ 109.38		

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
15e	EA	18" NPS 6618	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 6618 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1366662	1-100	\$ 76.54	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 76.54		
					>501	\$ 76.54		
15f	EA	18" with back NPS 6618B	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS 6618B SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1366665	1-100	\$ 107.86	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 107.86		
					>501	\$ 107.86		
Series 16		WOBBLE Chair, seat measures 11" made of rugged plastic. Allows movement without tipping over Color Gray, Lakeshore OR APPROVED EQUAL						
16a	EA	12" in height, Lakeshore item #WC712	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
16b	EA	14" height, Lakeshore item #WC714	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
16c	EA	16" height, Lakeshore item #WC716	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
17	EA	WOBBLE Cushions, Flex Space, Vinyl, (3) Color Options Available Blue, Green and Orange, One side has Large Nubs and the other side has Small Nubs, Place on Floor or Chair for Flexible Seating Anywhere, 13-1/2" Diameter Lakeshore #LC511XX OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
18	EA	FLOOR Seats, Flex Space, Microfiber Cover, Removable and Machine Washable, Adjustable Cushioned Back Supports, Lay Flat for Storing, (3) Color Options Available Blue, Green and Orange, Seat Measures 22"W Lakeshore #LC405XX OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
Series 19		CHAIR, Stacking, Polypropylene Seats, Ergonomically Contoured Backs, Extra-Sturdy Steel Frame, Nylon Tips, Lakeshore OR APPROVED EQUAL						
19a	EA	11-1/2"H Lakeshore #DG511	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
19b	EA	13-1/2"H Lakeshore #DG513	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
20	EA	CHAIR, Flex Space, Comfy Vinyl Covered, (2) Color Options Available Blue or Green, Chair Measures 20"W X 20-1/2D X 25"H, Seat Height 14", Lakeshore #LC346XX OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			

**STUDENT DESKS**

21	EA	DESK, Triangular Shape, 28"X28"X36", Hard Plastic Top, Standard standard colors with 5" deep book box covering entire underneath side of desktop, back pack hook, adjustable height legs with caster on front leg. CH Equip #CH3BBBH OR APPROVED EQUAL	CONCEPTS	CH EQUIP #CH3BBBH	1-100	\$ 180.00	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 180.00		
					>501	\$ 180.00		

**CHAIR DESKS**

22	EA	CHAIR DESK, 17.5", Double-contoured shell seat with waterfall front 16-gauge tubular steel frame, high-pressure laminate work surface. Artco Bell, 7407C OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 7407-3 (current part number)	1-100	\$ 116.70	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 116.70		
					>501	\$ 116.70		
23	EA	CHAIR DESK, over-sized unit w/ A-Plus sized shell. Full-tube 16 ga. steel legs with one-piece polypropylene shell w/no exposed rivets. Chrome frame w/bookrack. Standard colors. To be Artco-Bell Corp.#7458-A-PLUS, & Discover Series A+ #D75A, OR APPROVED EQUAL.	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL D75A-3 (current part number)	1-100	\$ 133.52	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 133.52		
					>501	\$ 133.52		

**TEACHER & OFFICE DESKS**

24	EA	DESK, 30 x 60, double pedestal, center drawer with pencil tray; suspension file drawer, lockable, steel construction base with laminated texture top. Virco #546, HON 88962, OR APPROVED EQUAL.	ARENSON OFFICE	HON 88962	1-100	\$ 565.20	N	LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 565.20		
					>501	\$ 565.20		

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
<b>TABLES</b>								
<b>Series 25</b>		TABLE, activity, laminated plastic top with banded edges, adjustable, heights, color choices to include medium oak, minimum 10-year warranty. Virco #480000 series, or ABC 1200 series, OR APPROVED EQUAL						
25a	EA	TABLE, 24 x 36 Virco #482436, ABC1206, ABC 1277 NOR-RCE2436C	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
25b	EA	TABLE, 24 x 48 Virco #482448, ABC1210 NOR-RCE2448C	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1210	1-100	\$ 105.29	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 105.29		
					>501	\$ 105.29		
25c	EA	TABLE, 24 x 60 Virco #482460, ABC1235 NOR-RCE2460C	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1235	1-100	\$ 130.47	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 130.47		
					>501	\$ 130.47		
25d	EA	TABLE, 30 x 48 Virco #483048, ABC1220	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1220	1-100	\$ 110.85	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 110.85		
					>501	\$ 110.85		
25e	EA	TABLE, 30 x 72 Virco #483072, ABC1253	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1250 (1253 is obsolete part number)	1-100	\$ 151.20	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 151.20		
					>501	\$ 151.20		
25f	EA	TABLE, 30 x 60 Virco #483060, ABC1230 NOR-RCE3060C	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1230	1-100	\$ 134.97	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 134.97		
					>501	\$ 134.97		
25g	EA	TABLE, 36 x 60 Virco #483660, ABC1240	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1240	1-100	\$ 138.84	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 138.84		
					>501	\$ 138.84		
25h	EA	TABLE, 36 x 72 Virco #483672, ABC1260	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1260	1-100	\$ 155.04	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 155.04		
					>501	\$ 155.04		
25i	EA	TABLE, 48 x 72, kidney shaped Virco #48KID72, ABC1275, or Royal 2268E	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1275	1-100	\$ 263.88	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 263.88		
					>501	\$ 263.88		

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
25j	EA	TABLE, 30 x 30 x 60, Trapezoidal Virco #48TRAP60, ABC1290	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1290	1-100	\$ 152.97	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 152.97		
					>501	\$ 152.97		
25k	EA	TABLE, 60 x 66 horseshoe, Virco 48SHORES60LO or ABC 1277	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	ARTCOBELL 1277	1-100	\$ 296.90	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 296.90		
					>501	\$ 296.90		
Series 26		TABLE, folding, corrugated plastic inner core, lightweight ABS plastic and aluminum tip construction with tubular steel legs. Virco #61000 series, OR APPROVED EQUAL						
26a	EA	TABLE, 30 x 72 Virco #613072, NPS BT-3072	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS BT-3072 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 676050	1-100	\$ 72.55	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 72.55		
					>501	\$ 72.55		
26b	EA	TABLE, 30 x 96 Virco #613096, NPS BT-3096	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS BT-3096 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 676051	1-100	\$ 107.02	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 107.02		
					>501	\$ 107.02		
27	EA	TABLE, folding, 48" round, blow molded plastic, 2" top, scratch resistant, heavy steel legs, Norwood Commercial or NPS BT Series OR APPROVED EQUAL.	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS BT48R SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1333614	1-100	\$ 76.58	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 76.58		
					>501	\$ 76.58		
Series 28		TABLE, science, with chemical resistant tops, wood frame, with or without bookboxes, floor boots included, fixed 30" Height NPS OR APPROVED EQUAL						
28a	EA	24x48 NPS SLT2448	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS SLT2448 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1017250	1-100	\$ 269.64	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 269.64		
					>501	\$ 269.64		
28b	EA	24x54 NPS SLT2454	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS SLT2454 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1017251	1-100	\$ 293.15	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 293.15		
					>501	\$ 293.15		
28c	EA	30x60 NPS SLT3060	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NPS SLT3060 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1017254	1-100	\$ 366.51	Y	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 366.51		
					>501	\$ 366.51		
29	EA	RECTANGLE FLOOR TABLE, 60"wx30"d, wipe clean laminate top, vinyl edge banding rounded corners and 4 adjustable steel legs with nylon caps. Legs adjust from 11" to 16" high, Lakeshore item #LC758 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			



**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
30	EA	ROUND FLOOR TABLE, 48" diameter, wipe clean laminate top, vinyl edge banding rounded corners and 4 adjustable steel legs with nylon caps. Legs adjust from 11" to 16" high, Lakeshore item #LC678 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
31	EA	TABLE, CAFÉ STYLE, 42" Round Table Top with Black Edging ALL WILSONART HIGH GLOSS Laminate and 41"H Or 42"H Single Pole "X" Style Chrome Base with Adjustable Glides SpecialT Classix CLSX42, Virco Universal Top Series X-U42R with Virco Lunada Series Base 6613341CHRM OR APPROVED EQUAL	VIRCO	VIRCO U42RDE TOP / VIRCO 6613341CHRM BASE	1-100	\$ 469.47	N	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 469.47		
					>501	\$ 469.47		
32	EA	TABLE, (LOW), Rectangle, Heavy Duty Adjustable, 1-1/4" thick Tabletop, Steel Legs, Nylon Tips, Height Adjusts from 15" - 24", 30" x 60" Lakeshore #DG588 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
33	EA	TABLE, Rectangle, Heavy Duty Adjustable, 1-1/4" thick Tabletop, Steel Legs, Nylon Tips, Height Adjusts from 21" - 30", 30" x 60" Lakeshore #DG587 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
34	EA	Table, (LOW), Round, Heavy Duty Adjustable, 1-1/4" thick Tabletop, Steel Legs, Nylon Tips, Height Adjusts from 15" - 24", 42" Diameter Lakeshore #DG580 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
35	EA	Table, Round, Heavy Duty Adjustable, 1-1/4" thick Tabletop, Steel Legs, Nylon Tips, Height Adjusts from 21" - 30", 42" Diameter Lakeshore #DG579 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
Series 36		Table, Flip & Nest, Rectangle, Adjustable Height 25" - 32", Steel Square Legs, 1" HPS Top in ALL Wilsonart Dry Erase Laminate Colors, Black Band Edge, (4) Locking Casters, Fleetwood #FNPR OR APPROVED EQUAL						
36a	EA	24" X 48"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	FLEETWOOD FN.PR428K1BA G5 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1643065E	1-100	\$ 893.36	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 893.36		
					>501	\$ 893.36		
36b	EA	24" X 54"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	FLEETWOOD FN.PR528K1BA G5 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1643066E	1-100	\$ 906.54	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 906.54		
					>501	\$ 906.54		
36c	EA	24" X 60"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	FLEETWOOD FN.PR628K1BA G5 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1643067E	1-100	\$ 906.54	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 906.54		
					>501	\$ 906.54		

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
36d	EA	30" X 48"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	FLEETWOOD FN.PR438K1BA G5 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1643068E	1-100	\$ 906.54	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 906.54		
					>501	\$ 906.54		
36e	EA	30" X 54"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	FLEETWOOD FN.PR538K1BA G5 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1643069E	1-100	\$ 918.31	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 918.31		
					>501	\$ 918.31		
36f	EA	30" x 60"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	FLEETWOOD FN.PR638K1BA G5 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1643070E	1-100	\$ 930.26	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 930.26		
					>501	\$ 930.26		
Series 37		Table, Multi-purpose, Square 1-1/8" thick high-pressure lalminate top available in (4) colors), black edge band, 4-prong X-style black powder-coated painted steel base, leveling glides, OFM Series XT OR APPROVED EQUAL						
37a	EA	XT36SQ	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	OFM XT36SQ SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1642942E	1-100	\$ 171.95	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 171.95		
					>501	\$ 171.95		
37b	EA	XT42SQ	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	OFM XT42SQ SCHOOL SPECIALTY 1642943E	1-100	\$ 190.14	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 190.14		
					>501	\$ 190.14		
Series 38		Table, Multi-purpose, Square 1-1/8" thick high-pressure lalminate top available in (4) colors), black edge band, 4-prong chrome plated steel base, leveling glides, OFM Series LT OR APPROVED EQUAL						
38a	EA	LT36SQ	ARENSON OFFICE	OFM LT36SQ	1-100	\$ 196.25	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 196.25		
					>501	\$ 196.25		
38b	EA	LT42SQ	ARENSON OFFICE	OFM LT42SQ	1-100	\$ 226.65	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 226.65		
					>501	\$ 226.65		

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
<b>Series 39</b>		TABLE, PLANNER STUDIO, 1-1/4" Top in Mission Maple, Pewter Mesh and Whiteboard, Steel Frame and Legs, (4) Locking Casters, available frame colors Apple, Cerulean, Charcoal, Orange or Platinum Smith Systems OR APPROVED EQUAL						
39a	EA	48" X 60" X 29" #25242f	SIERRA SCHOOL	SMITH SYSTEMS 25242f	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 985.00 \$ 980.00 \$ 975.00	N	12 YEAR LIMITED
39b	EA	48" X 60" X 36" #25244f	SIERRA SCHOOL	SMITH SYSTEMS 25244f	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 1,008.00 \$ 998.00 \$ 988.00	N	12 YEAR LIMITED
39c	EA	48" X 60" X 40" #25246f	SIERRA SCHOOL	SMITH SYSTEMS 25246f	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 1,026.00 \$ 1,016.00 \$ 1,006.00	N	12 YEAR LIMITED
39d	EA	48" X 72" X 29" #25248f	SIERRA SCHOOL	SMITH SYSTEMS 25248f	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 1,082.00 \$ 1,072.00 \$ 1,062.00	N	12 YEAR LIMITED
39e	EA	48" X 72" X 36" #25250f	SIERRA SCHOOL	SMITH SYSTEMS 25250f	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 1,100.00 \$ 1,090.00 \$ 1,080.00	N	12 YEAR LIMITED
39f	EA	48" X 72" X 40" #25252f	SIERRA SCHOOL	SMITH SYSTEMS 25252f	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 1,120.00 \$ 1,110.00 \$ 1,100.00	N	12 YEAR LIMITED
<b>LUNCH &amp; PICNIC TABLES</b>								
<b>Series 40</b>		TABLE, Cafeteria, mobile folding, bench seating, 3-1 conversion, high pressure laminate, MDF core, center gravity lock bar, floating fold torsion bar, 14-gauge tube legs. SICO 3-1 convertible, American Table All-In-One OR APPROVED EQUAL						
40a	EA	6' Unit Sico T3A32F OR American Table ACB6-DR	SIERRA SCHOOL	SICO T3A32F	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 725.00 \$ 718.00 \$ 711.00	N	LIMITED LIFETIME 10 YEARS FOR CERTAIN PARTS
40b	EA	8' Unit Sico T3C32F OR American Table ACB8-DR	SIERRA SCHOOL	SICO T3C32F	1-100 101-500 >501	\$ 812.00 \$ 805.00 \$ 797.00	N	LIMITED LIFETIME 10 YEARS FOR CERTAIN PARTS

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
<b>MISCELLANEOUS</b>								
41	EA	MULTIMEDIA PRESENTATION CENTER, 18-gauge steel, extra large wood-grain finish surface, locking cabinet, adjustable or removable shelf, 20' power cord with cord winder, multiple surfaces to support multiple media devices, locking caser, minimum 5-year warranty. Oklahoma Sound PRC-450 OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OKLAHOMA SOUND PRC-450	1-100	\$ 458.06	N	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 458.06		
					>501	\$ 458.06		
42	EA	MULTIMEDIA PRESENTATION CENTER, 18-gauge steel, extra large MDF fiberboard surface, 20' power cord with cord winder, multiple surfaces to support multiple media devices, locking caser, minimum 5-year warranty. Oklahoma Sound PRC-400 OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OKLAHOMA SOUND PRC-400	1-100	\$ 372.17	N	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 372.17		
					>501	\$ 372.17		
43	EA	STORAGE, tote tray mobile unit, 30 bins, (19" Deep), open cabinet, casters 50"W x 24.125"D x 60"H Wisconsin Bench #SS2020-AC-NSL OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	WISCONSIN BENCH SS2020-AC-NSL	1-100	\$ 1,350.14	N	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 1,350.14		
					>501	\$ 1,350.14		
44	EA	STORAGE, paper mobile unit, 5-drawer, casters, 36"H x 48"W Wisconsin Bench #SS1010-AC-NSL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	WISCONSIN BENCH SS1010-AC-NSL	1-100	\$ 1,125.35	N	10 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 1,125.35		
					>501	\$ 1,125.35		
45	EA	STORAGE Center, Birch, (10) Compartments in various sizes and (5) Cubbies on top, Overall Dimension 47"W X 14"D X 30"H Lakeshore #JJ175 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
46	EA	STORAGE Unit, Birch, Transparent Acrylic Back, (3) Shelves and (8) Compartments, Overall Dimension 47"W X 11-3/4"D X 36"H Lakeshore #JJ923 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO BID	NO BID	1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
47	EA	STORAGE Bin, Mobile, Laminate, (3) Shelves Divided into (6) Compartments, 3" Locking Casters, Overall Dimension, 46"W X 14-1/2"D X 31-1/4"H Lakeshore #LC674 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
48	EA	READING Nook, Birch, Comfy Padded Vinyl Covered Seating with Angled Backrests, (4) Easy Access Compartments that hold approximately 75 books, Clear Acrylic Side Panels, Overall Dimension 47"W X 40-1/2"D X 34-1/2"H Lakeshore #HH844 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
49	EA	CUBBY, Birch, Mobile, Foldable, one side has (20) cubbies and the other side has (5) big compartments, hinged in the center with lockable catch, Lakeshore #DG236 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
50	EA	CUBBY & SHELVES, Birch, (6) cubbies on top and (2) shelves below, Lakeshore #JJ270 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
51	EA	WRITING CENTER, Space Saver, Birch, laminate top, shelves and cubbies, Lakeshore #JJ276 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
52	EA	Classroom Carpet, Natural Accents Leaves, 9' x 12' Lakeshore LC842 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
53	EA	Classroom Carpet, Shapes & Colors, Soft Soil Resistant Nylon, 9' x 12' Lakeshore #LL802 OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			

**SPECIALTY FURNITURE**

54	EA	Sofa, Modular, Single Right Arm Chair Section With Tungsten Laminate Tablet Installed, 33"H X 28"-39"W X 31"-36"D, Black Vinyl Fabric, Chrome Legs OFM Triumph Series #3001RT/PU606/#TG OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 3001RT-PU606-TG	1-100	\$ 322.56	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 322.56		
					>501	\$ 322.56		
55	EA	Sofa, Modular, Single Left Arm Chair Section With Tungsten Laminate Tablet Installed, 33"H X 28"-39"W X 31"-36"D, Black Vinyl Fabric, Chrome Legs OFM Triumph Series #3001LT/PU606/#TG OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 3001LT-PU606-TG	1-100	\$ 322.56	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 322.56		
					>501	\$ 322.56		
56	EA	Sofa, Modular, Armless Chair Section, 33"H X 22"W X 29"D, Black Vinyl Fabric, Chrome Legs OFM Triumph Series #3000/PU606/#TG OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 3000-PU606	1-100	\$ 263.29	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 263.29		
					>501	\$ 263.29		

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB:

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)  
 MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00  
 Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)

**Contract Term:**  
 February 5, 2020 to  
 December 31, 2020

**Bid Sponsor:** Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD  
**Email:** [svacinat@cajonvalley.net](mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net)  
**Phone:** 619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
57	EA	Chair, Triumph Series 90 Degree Corner, Armless, Black Vinyl Fabric, Chrome Legs OFM Triumph Series #3090 OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 3090-PU606	1-100	\$ 359.91	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 359.91		
					>501	\$ 359.91		
58	EA	Chair, Interplay Series With Tungsten Tablet Installed On The Right Arm, Black Vinyl Fabric, Includes (2) Casters OFM Interplay Series #821/PU606/#TG OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 821-PU606-TNGST WITH 82X FEET-TNGST	1-100	\$ 438.54	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 438.54		
					>501	\$ 438.54		
59	EA	Same as above with (4) locking chrome casters	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 821-PU606-TNGST	1-100	\$ 430.12	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 430.12		
					>501	\$ 430.12		
60	EA	CHAIR, Two-Arm, Vinyl Fabric available in (3) colors, Chrome Legs OFM Triumph Series #3002 OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 3002	1-100	\$ 371.95	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 371.95		
					>501	\$ 371.95		
61	EA	SAME AS ABOVE, with Tablet on Right Arm, tablet available in (2) laminate finishes OFM Triumph Series #3002T OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 3002T	1-100	\$ 412.20	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 412.20		
					>501	\$ 412.20		
62	EA	SOFA, Two-Arm, Vinyl available in (2) colors, (4) locking chrome casters OFM Interplay Series #822 OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 822NT	1-100	\$ 687.68	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 687.68		
					>501	\$ 687.68		
63	EA	SAME AS ABOVE, with (2) Tablets on Left & Right Arms, tablets available in (2) laminate finishes OFM Interplay Series #822T OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	OFM 822	1-100	\$ 687.68	N	LIMITED LIFETIME
					101-500	\$ 687.68		
					>501	\$ 687.68		
64	EA	Sofa, Flex Space, Comfy Vinyl Covered, (2) Color Options Available Blue or Green, Sofa Measures 50"W X 20-1/2D X 25"H, Seat Height 14" Lakeshore #LC347XX OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
65	EA	Soft Seating Bean Bag Chair, tapered design, 36:Wx30"Hx28"L (seat height 14") polystyrene bead filling, vinyl fabric all colors JAXX Juniper Series #17016 OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	JAXX 17016	1-100	\$ 185.23	N	1 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 185.23		
					>501	\$ 185.23		
66	EA	Soft Seating Bean Bag Chair, Juniper Jr. (JUJU) Series, tapered design, 26"Lx18"Wx19.5"H (seat height 9") with matching ottoman, 13"Lx18"Wx10"H, polystyrene bead filling, vinyl fabric, all colors JAXX Juniper Jr. Series #16847 OR APPROVED EQUAL	OFFICE AND ERGONOMIC SOLUTIONS	JAXX 16847	1-100	\$ 145.45	N	1 YEAR
					101-500	\$ 145.45		
					>501	\$ 145.45		

**NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM**

CommandB

**Bid No. 1529-N, NCEPC Classroom & Office Furniture and Equipment**

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 45 days (60 days June 15 - Aug 15)	<b>Contract Term:</b>	<b>Bid Sponsor:</b>	Teri Svacina, Cajon Valley USD
MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: \$150.00	February 5, 2020 to	<b>Email:</b>	<a href="mailto:svacinat@cajonvalley.net">svacinat@cajonvalley.net</a>
<b>Quickship 7 Days (Excludes June-August)</b>	December 31, 2020	<b>Phone:</b>	619-588-3001

LINE #	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION	AWARDED VENDOR	SPECIFY MFG. & MODEL & STOCK # IF BIDDING ALTERNATE	QTY	UNIT PRICE	QUICKSHIP Y/N	WARRANTY PERIOD
67	EA	Couch, Kid Sized, Wooden Frame with soft padding covered in vinyl, (2) Color Options available Blue or Red, Overall Dimension 36"W X 19-3/4"D X 20-1/2"H. Seat Measures 10"H. Lakeshore #FF683XX OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			
68	EA	Chair, Kid Sized, Wooden Frame with soft padding covered in vinyl, (2) Color Options available Blue or Red, Overall Dimension 25"W X 19-3/4"D X 20-1/2"H. Seat Measures 10"H. Lakeshore #FF682XX OR APPROVED EQUAL	NO AWARD		1-100			
					101-500			
					>501			

**BID 1529-N, NCEPC CLASSROOM & OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT  
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER LIST PRICE**

<b>MANUFACTURER</b>	<b>% OFF DISCOUNT</b>	<b>VENDOR</b>
2/90 SIGN SYSTEMS	13.0%	OES
3 DAY	NO BID	N/A
ACADEMIA FURNITURE	56.0%	SIERRA SCHOOL
ACCO	NO BID	N/A
AIS	NO BID	N/A
AMERICAN SEATING	NO BID	N/A
AMERICAN TABLE	50.0%	OES
AMNEON	NO BID	N/A
AMTAB	49.0%	OES
ARTCO BELL	52.0%	OES
BALT	45.0%	SOUTHWEST
BEST RITE	45.0%	SOUTHWEST
BILTMORE (RECOVERY COUCHES)	NO BID	N/A
BODY FURN	NO BID	N/A
BOSS	58.5%	ARENSON
C&H EQUIPMENT	35.0%	CONCEPTS
CALIFONE	34.0%	SCHOOL SPECIALTY
CAROLINA HOUSE	NO BID	N/A
CASE	NO BID	N/A
CEF-CUSTOM EDUCATIONAL FURNISHINGS	35.0%	METEOR SCHOOL SPECIALTY
CHILDCRAFT	63.0%	SCHOOL SPECIALTY
CHROMCRAFT (DISCONTINUED)	NO BID	N/A
COMPATICO	NO BID	N/A
DAR RAN	25.0%	PARRON HALL
DMI OFFICE (DISCONTINUED)	NO BID	N/A
DUCHARME SEATING	NO BID	N/A
EUROTECH	52.0%	ARENSON
FAIRFIELD	NO BID	N/A
FALCON	25.0%	PARRON HALL
FIXTURES	NO BID	N/A
GILLIS- LPI WIRE SHELVES/CARTS	NO BID	N/A
GILLIS- STAINLESS TABLES/SINKS	NO BID	N/A
GLOBAL INDUS.	49.0%	OES
GRESSCO	NO BID	N/A
HALE	NO BID	N/A
HASKELL	43.0%	OES
HERMAN MILLER	NO BID	N/A
HIRSH	NO BID	N/A
HOLMRIS	1.0%	METEOR
HOOKER	NO BID	N/A
HUMAN SCALE	25.0%	PARRON HALL
INCORCA	NO BID	N/A



**BID 1529-N, NCEPC CLASSROOM & OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT**

**PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER LIST PRICE**

<b>MANUFACTURER</b>	<b>% OFF DISCOUNT</b>	<b>VENDOR</b>
INWOOD	NO BID	N/A
IRWIN SEATING COMPANY	2.0%	SIERRA SCHOOL
ISE	NO BID	N/A
ISI	32.0%	SCHOOL SPECIALTY
IZZY	NO BID	N/A
JAXX	21.0%	OES
JONTICRAFT	35.0%	SOUTHWEST
KC BIN	28.0%	SCHOOL SPECIALTY
KI	NO BID	N/A
KORDEN (DISCONTINUED)	NO BID	N/A
LA STEELCRAFT	NO BID	N/A
LACASSE	40.0%	OES
LAKESHORE	NO AWARD	
LEGACY FURNITURE	NO BID	N/A
LEISURE CRAFT	18.0%	SOUTHWEST
LESRO	26.0%	OES
LSI	NO BID	N/A
MARTIN	NO BID	N/A
MIDWEST	NO BID	N/A
MIEN	List Price > \$5,000=42.5% List Price < or = \$5,000=20%	SIERRA SCHOOL
MITY LITE	28.0%	SCHOOL SPECIALTY
MUZO	1.0%	METEOR
NATIONAL PUBLIC SEATING	45.0%	SOUTHWEST
NATIONAL RECREATION SYSTEMS	NO BID	N/A
NORSONS	NO BID	N/A
NORVA NIVEL	5.0%	METEOR
OFFICES TOGO	47.0%	OES
PALADIN	NO BID	N/A
PARAGON	25.0%	SCHOOL SPECIALTY
PARENT METAL	NO BID	N/A
PLATINUM VISUALS	39.0%	OES
PS FURNITURE	10.0%	METEOR
S&K THEATRICAL DRAPERIES	6.0%	OES
SAFCO	43.0%	OES
SCM	NO BID	N/A
SICO	36.0%	SIERRA SCHOOL
SIS	NO BID	N/A
SISNEROS	28.0%	OES
SIT ON IT SEATING	59.0%	OES
SPARKEOLOGY	NO BID	N/A

**BID 1529-N, NCEPC CLASSROOM & OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT****PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER LIST PRICE**

<b>MANUFACTURER</b>	<b>% OFF DISCOUNT</b>	<b>VENDOR</b>
SUPERIOR SHADES	NO BID	N/A
SURFACE WORKS	NO BID	N/A
TEC EDUCATIONAL	NO BID	N/A
THONET	NO BID	N/A
TOPLINE	NO BID	N/A
TOTAL LEARNING SPACE	5.0%	TOTAL LEARNING SPACE
ULTRA PLAY SYSTEMS	NO BID	N/A
UNITED DESK	61.0%	CONCEPTS
UNITED STATIONERS (NOW ESSEDANT-ALERA)	46.0%	CONCEPTS
USA CAPITOL	9.0%	METEOR
VALENTINE	NO BID	N/A
WISCONSIN BENCH	53.0%	OES