NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE: Health & Athletic Supplies
BID NUMBER: 2024-001N
DELIVERY:15 Calendar days

CONTRACT PERIOD: 01/01/2024 through 12/31/2024
Minimum $ Amt for Free Freight: $50.00

SPONSORING DISTRICT: Vista Unified School District

DISTRICT CONTACT:

Jose Mata-Villa

PH: (760) 726-2170 Ext. 92642 FAX:

PHONE/FAX CATALOG DISCOUNT
VENDOR NAME | ADDRESS NUMBER CONTACT NAME
BSN Sports, LLC PO Box 7726 P: 800-959-1844 Martin Vizcaya 10% off catalog pricing

Dallas, TX 75209

F: 800-921-2515

mvizcaya@bsnsports.com

Medco Supply Co.

28100 Torch Parkway Ste
800
Warrenville, IL 60555

P: 800-556-3326
: 800-222-1934

T

Ann Sciandra
medcosalessupport@medcosupply.com

0-25% off catalog (materials and
supplies)

Med-X Surgical
Distribution

530 Commerce Ave. Ste D
Palmdale, CA 93551

P: 805-490-6087

Mark Petrosian
medxdistributionsd@gmail.com

0% off catalog pricing

Pyramid School
Products

6510 North 54 Street
Tampa, FL 33610

P: 800-792-2644

Bid Department
biddept@pyramidsp.com

10% off catalog pricing

School Health Corp

5600 Apollo Drive
Rolling Meadows, IL
60008

o

: 866-323-5465
: 800-235-1305

T

Contract Sales Specialist
bids@schoolhealth.com

10% off catalog prices (some
exclusions apply)

Note: The catalog discount percentages are not competitively bid and thus not to be used for over bid limit purchases.
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM BID FORM

HEALTH AND ATHLETIC

BID TITLE SUPPLIES SPONSORING DISTRICT: VISTA UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID NUMBER 2024-001N DISTRICT CONTACT: Jose Mata-Villa
CONTRACT PERIOD Ol/Ol/fgéélll'léngfUGH PH: 760-726-2170 x92642 Email: josematavilla@vistausd.org 12/6/2023
Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOM)
PART 1 - HEALTH SUPPLIES
Adhesive skin closures, 1/8" X 3", 250 (5
strips/envelope), 3M
Steri-Stri[p, dynarex D70-3521
1 43 [250/BOX 20720 Medco S 25.4400
Adhesive skin closures, 1/4"X3", 150 (3
strips/envelope), 3M
Steri-Strip, Dynarex D70-3523
2 64 [150/BOX 20740 Medco S 25.4400
Alcohol 70% Isopropyl Divina ZMX93, York
1209X395814, VilJon
BOTTLE 34001M, Vijon X395814
3 906 |16 oz 1039746 School Health | $§ 2.5400
Alcohol 70% Isopropyl, York Y-20-4004,
10328/MCC105B, Med
Chem M28-105B, Breen Labs X702217
4 68 |GALLON/1 No Bid
Alcohol Preps 1 1/8"X2 3/8", MBM GRA700,
MBMGRA700,
5 94 [200/Box ~ |Moore 68534, Dukal D22-0852 1040441 School Health | $ 1.8800
Applicator- 3" Single cotton tipped, non-sterile,
Solon ZAPQ2
6 369 [100/PKG  [22609-1CTM22-9610-1, Amsino A60-0030 99303, SH School Health | $ 0.5100




Item #

Estimated
Usage

Unit of
Measure
(UOM)

ITEM
DESCRIPTION

Vendor Catalog
Number

Proposed
Awarded
Vendor

Price (Per
uom)

80

100/PKG

Applicator- 6" Single cotton tipped, non-sterile,
Solon ZAPO1,
Amsino A60-0028

99306, SH

School Health

0.7300

57

1000/BOX

Applicator Stick- 6" Without cotton tip, CTM-22-
9605
Amsino 0026 A60-0026, Dukal D22-9000

90985, DUKAL

School Health

2.7500

401

100/PKG

Bags- Plastic- 4"X6" Zipper closure, Tapp 4X68Z,
TAPP BA64
X62, Medical Action G14-0406

21422, ELKAY

School Health

1.3300

10

97

100/PKG

Bags- Plastic- 6x8" Sandwich size, Zipper closure,
Tapp 6X8Z,
Gold Seal 6X8, Medical Action G14-0608 (8"x6")

29670

Medco

2.2000

11

170

100/PKG

Baggies - Plastic - 9"X6", zipper top, 21340 or
equal

21340, SH

School Health

4.0400

12

112

100/BOX

Bags- Plastic- 36"%32", Zipper closure, box/100,
Medical

Action G14-1012, Dukal Zip810 (Quart bag
8"x10")

29680

Medco

4.4500

13

69

11b/BOX

Baking Soda, A&H S-34-1131, A&H 1131SY-1131

1007625

School Health

1.4500

14

114

10/BOX

Bandages- 2"X4.5 yds Ace elastic, Dukal D22-
0502, QUDQ12-

335P50B, QMD E20-EB2, Tempo Medical 6602,
Tetra Medical G64520

260149

Medco

3.6300

15

441

10/BOX

Bandages- 3"X4.5 yds Ace elastic, Graham
FBR18143, MDQ12-

335P75B, QMD E20-Eb3, Tempo Medical 6603,
Tetra Medical G645300

260150

Medco

4.6300




Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Bandage-3"X4.5 yds, Ace elastic, Graham
FBR18143, QMDQ12-

16 85 |1 ROLL/BOX |335P75B, Cypress 83638 260144 Medco $ 0.4700
Bandages- 4"X4.5 yds, Ace elastic, Graham
FBR18144, QMDDQ
12335P100B, QMD 320-3B4, Tempo Medical

17 72 |10/BOX 6604, Tetra Medical G64540 260151 Medco $ 5.5000
Bandages- 6"X4.5 yds Ace elastic, Graham
FBR18144, QMDQ
12335P150B, QMD 320-3B6, Tempo Medical

18 68 |10/BOX 6606, Tetra Medical G64560 260152 Medco | $ 7.3200
Bandages- 1 1/2"X3/8" Butterfly closure Med.,
32025, NUTRA
MAX, White Cross W-16-1975, Care A22-1626,

19 75 |100/BOx ~ |Dynarex 3615 1970533/261833 Medco $ 1.7700
Bandages- 2 3/4"X1/2" Butterfly closure Irg.,
White Cross
W-16-1975, W/cross WC1975, Care A22-1628,

20 58 |100/BOX Dynarex 3616 32026, DYNAREX | School Health | $ 2.8200
Bandages- 2X10 Yards Cover-roll Stretch, BSN-
JOBST, BSN

21 34 |ROLL 63326, BSN-JOBST B22-Y5552 35140 Medco | $ 9.9800
Bandages- 1 3/4"X3" Digit coverlets, sheer Curad
or equal,
Swift S-60-90408, Swift S60-90408, Swift S60-

22 71 [s0/BOX 0088 1041347 School Health | $ 10.8900
Bandages- 3"X4.1 yds elastic, self-adhesive,
Dukal D-22-0603,
Dukal CP0300, QMD Q12-GBNS-3

23 47 112/BOX 27083 School Health | $§ 1.9800
Bandages- 1"X3"- Flexible fabric bandage, Latex
free, Care
Band #CBD4019 or equal, Tempo Medical
BAF013

24 354 |100/BOX 3 261838 Medco $ 2.4600




Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Bandages- 2"'%4-1/2" Flexible fabric adhesive
bandage (2x4)

25 158 |50/BOX 261840 Medco 3.2200
Bandages- 2=%4-#5"- Finger tip coverlets, sheer
Curad or
equal, PS-288, Swift, Nutramax 81886, A22-
4025, Conco 46210000-2 X 2.5

26 136 |100/BOX 555910 Medco 3.1600
Bandages- 3"X3" Four wing flexible fabric
adhesive bandage, Tetra

27 61 |50/BOX 32265, SH School Health 4.3800
Bandages- 1"X4.1 yds, gauze, flexible, non-
sterile, Conco
C-36-2510, 52304/PS010, Conco 64206, Hartman

28 72 |24/BAG 80100000 27501, FLEXLIGHT | School Health 3.7700
Bandages- 2"X4.1 yds, gauze rolls, conforming,
stretch,
non-sterile 12-ply, Dukal CP0200, QMD Q12-
GBNS2, Conco 80200000

29 62 |12/BAG 27082, FLEXLIGHT | School Health 2.0200
Bandages- 2"WX4.1 yds, gauze, elastic, sterile, 1
roll/box
QMD Q12-6BS2, QMD Q12-GBS2, Hartman

30 51 |1 ROLL/BOX |8020000 81920 Medco 0.3100
Bandages- 4"X4.1 yds, gauze, flexible, non-
sterile, Dukal
D-22-0604, 52307/PS013, QMD Q12-GBNS4

31 47 [12/BAG 27084 School Health 3.4200
Bandages- 4'"X4.1 yds, gauze, elastic, sterile, 1
roll/pack Conco

32 43 |1 RoLL/BOX |31922 QMD Q12-GBS4 81922 Medco 0.3700
Bandages- 4"X5 yds, Hartmann deluxe "480" LF
elastic

33 34 |10 ROLL/BX 31120 School Health 2.7900
Bandages- 6"X5 yds, Hartmann deluxe "480" LF

34 34 |10 ROLL/BX |elastic 4 31121 School Health 4.0200




Item #

Estimated
Usage

Unit of
Measure
(UOM)

ITEM
DESCRIPTION

Vendor Catalog
Number

Proposed
Awarded
Vendor

Price (Per
uom)

35

34

EACH

Bandages- 6"X11 yds, Hartmann deluxe LF
double length

36520

Medco

8.0500

36

113

100/BOX

Bandages- 1 1/2"X3" knuckle coverlets, sheer
Curad or equal
Acme WC310, Nutramax 72881

32230, SH

School Health

3.8800

37

114

100/BOX

Bandages- 1 1/2"X3" knuckle flexible fabric
adhesive bandage

261837

Medco

3.8300

38

882

50/BOX

Bandages- 3/4"X3", sheer adhesive band-aid
Curad or equal

Swift S-60-0045, Curad PS02LU, Care (ASO)A22-
2018-50,

32029, SH

School Health

1.3800

39

322

100/BOX

Bandages- 3/4"X3", sheer adhesive band-aid
Curad or equal,

latex free, ASO Corp 71465, Tempo Medical
BAP343

32029, SH

School Health

1.3800

40

44

1500/CASE

Bandages- 3/4"X3", sheer adhesive band-aid
Curad or equal,

Swift S600045-1500, Swift S60-0045-1500, Care
A22-2018-1500

32036, SH

School Health

16.7500

41

328

100/BOX

Bandages- 1"X3", sheer adhesive band-aid, with
non-adhesive
pad, Care A22-2019, Nutramax 85949

32028, SH

School Health

1.5600

42

1,224

50/BOX

Bandages- 1"X3", sheer adhesive band-aid, with
non-adhesive
pad, Curad or equal, Curad ZASO3A, Care (ASO)
A22-2019-50

21004M

Medco

1.3800

43

686

1500/CASE

Bandages- 1"X3" sheer adhesive band-aid, with
non-adhesive

pad, Curad or equal, MBM ZAS08LU, Care (ASO)
A22-2019-1500

32037, SH

School Health

21.1300




Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Bandages- 3/8"X1 1/2", sheer adhesive band-aid,
junior strips
Curad or equal, Curad ZAS01CU, CuradF20-3121,
Care22-2088,

44 319 |100/80x  |T€MPO Medical BAF3815 261847 Medco 0.9200
Bandages- 2"X4" sheer adhesive band-aid, extra
large Curad or
equal, Curad ZASO6WC, Care A22-2016, Moore

45 580 [50/BOX 68188 32251, SH School Health 2.9000
Bandages- 37"X37"X52" Approximately, triangle
bandage,
includes 2 saftey pins, QMD Q12-3651, Tempo

46 147 |1/BOX Medical BTS2 27549, SH School Health 0.6500
Calamine Lotion-Non-phenolated, Diving ZMX29,
Must have
current expire date and 1 year shelf life from
date of

47 381 |60z/bottle  [ShiPment. Swan X396374 261025 Medco 1.4700
Cold Pack - 4"X6" Instant Kwik Kold, PN-340,
Hosp Mktg 8950980

16/PK Nortech 80543,

48 502 |56/CASE 10768 Medco 35.8500
Cold Pack - Instant Kwik Kold, PN-380, Total
Resource T99-ICE62, 5-5~x6" - 4X6

49 136 |16/CASE 29480C Medco 11.4700
Cold Pack - Instant Kwik Kold 107 Senior, MBM
PN33316, Total

50 102 |16/case  |Resource T99-ICE63 37271, SH School Health 10.3400
Cold or hot pack- 3"X5" reusable, non-toxic, leak
proof Therma-
Kool or equal, Nortech TKOO1, Polar Pak M70-

51 107 |EACH 0500 37277 School Health 0.8200




Item #

Estimated
Usage

Unit of
Measure
(UOM)

ITEM
DESCRIPTION

Vendor Catalog
Number

Proposed
Awarded
Vendor

Price (Per
uom)

52

1,037

EACH

Cold or hot pack- 4"X6" reusable, non-toxic, leak
proof Therma-
Kool, NO SUBSTITUTE

263550

Medco

S 0.7200

53

546

EACH

Cold or hot pack- 4"X9" reusable, non-toxic, leak
proof Therma-

Kool or equal, Therma-Kool 37-023, Therma-Kool
N12-4950

37182, SH

School Health

$ 1.0000

54

715

EACH

Cold or hot pack- 6"X9" reusable, non-toxic, leak
proof Therma-

kool or equal, Jack Frost Moore 70922, Therma-
kool N12-6930

Total Resource T99-Gel476

263552

Medco

S 1.3000

55

68

EACH

Cold or hot pack- Finger-pack reusable, non-
toxic, leak proof

Therma-kool or equal, Therma-kool N12-FP50,
Nortech 80548

37019

School Health

S 1.6500

56

105

500/BOX

Cotton Balls- Medium- Sterile cotton only - no
rayon, American
Fiber 69544, Aaron Ind. 69544

No Bid

57

119

1000/BAG

Cotton Balls- Large- Non-sterile cotton only - no
rayon, Acme
ZCB07, Dukal D22-0802

30021

School Health

S 8.1900

58

153

200/BAG

Cotton Balls- Absorbent- Medium - Non-sterile -
500/bag
Kendall K10-2600

30020, SH

School Health

S 9.6700

59

1,056

100/SLEEVE

Cups - Paper, pleated 3 1/4 oz, Sweetheart M-12-
0450,
StraussZLP50, Sweetheart U12-0450

1039180

School Health

S 4.6700

60

102

100/BAG

Cup - Medicine - 1 oz plastic, graduated,
PPL4694, Cypress 81772

39002M

Medco

S 0.9300




Item #

Estimated
Usage

Unit of
Measure
(UOM)

ITEM
DESCRIPTION

Vendor Catalog
Number

Proposed
Awarded
Vendor

Price (Per
uom)

61

51

KIT

CPR mask kit - includes 1 child/1 adult mask, one-
way valve, as
spec G10-MTM, Dyromed G10-7007

No Bid

62

102

gl

Disinfectant, Control Ill Germacide, ready-to-use

No Bid

63

70

ea

Droppers, 4 inch, straight node, glass, PROFLEX#
G24-3509

No Bid

64

34

6PK
DOZEN

Eye cup - sterile - polyethylene flexible,
individually wrapped,
Vector V10-40151

7200916 (6pk)

Medco

S 0.9000

65

34

100/BAG

Eye cup - non-sterile flexible, bulk package,
Vector V10-40150

42000MC (144/bx)

Medco

S 494.4900

66

68

KIT

Foam cast cover, Cramer #061900; 1/2"X12"18",
2 sheets/kit,
Cramer C99-061900

081595248

Medco

S 25.3200

67

104

EACH

Forceps - 3 1/2" fine point, splinter, Myco M54-
0832

36242, SH

School Health

S 0.7700

68

102

EACH

Forceps - 4 1/2" fine point, splinter, Myco M54-
0833, Trans
Amer 52350

36228, SH

School Health

S 0.7600

69

1,700

100/BOX

Gloves - Latex exam - disposable hypoallergenic,
lightly

powdered, ambidextrous, non-sterile, small,
med/Irg.

Uniseal 023 A10-023 S, A10-023 MA10-023 L,
Cypress, Criterion,

Sempermed, District to specify size when
ordering.

LIFE GUARD #1260

MED-X

S 4.7900




Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Gloves - Latex exam - disposable hypoallergenic,
unpowdered,
ambidextrous, non-sterile, x-sm/sm/med/Irg,
MBM Abc06, District to specify size when
ordering GLL105F- (Specify

70 1,751 |100/80x  |CYPress, Shamrock 10000 Size-Case Qty only) | Pyramid 4.5900
Gloves - Vinyl, non-latex disposable,
ambiextrous, unpowdered
sm/med/Irg/x-Irg, Cypress. District to specify size
when ordering. LIFE GUARD #2390

71 6,919 |100/BOX (Specify Size) MED-X 1.9400
Gloves-Vinyl non-latex disposable, ambidextrous,
lightly
powdered, sm/med/Irg/x-Irg, Criterion
#1025329, Accutouch
MDS191075, Cypress. District to specify size
when ordering. LIFE GUARD #2390

72 1,713 [100/BOX (Specify Size) MED-X 1.9400
Gloves - Powdered vinyl synthetic examination
gloves, lightly
powdered, ambedextrous, beaded cuff, 1000/cs, LIFE GUARD
evergreen, DURASAFE
Shamrock. District to specify size when ordering | |Tenm#2320 (Specify

73 1,700 |1000/CASE size) MED-X 38.2000
Gloves - Nitrile, non-latex, disposable,
ambiextrous, unpowdered, sm/med/Irg/x-Irg.
District to specify size when ordering LIFE GUARD

SANITEX ITEM#6390

74 680 [100/BOX (Specify size) MED-X 3.4000
Gloves - Poly, non-latex, for Food Service,
disposable, ambiextrous, unpowdered,
sm/med/Irg. District to specify size when Safety Zone #GDPE-
ordering Specify size (Case

75 1,020 [100/BOX Qty. only) Pyramid 0.6900




Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Hand Sanitizer Purell Instant, 2 oz, Water Jel
22410M ABHC#17355 /

76 425 |EACH 242550 Medco 1.3900
Hand Sanitizer Purell , 8-ezbottle with pump
(1202)

77 1,743 |EACH 269601 Medco 4.6500
Hand Sanitizer Purell Waterless, 12 oz bottle
with pump, Purell
#9659-12, Purell 75358 - NO SUBSTITUTE

78 2,371 |EACH 269601 Medco 4.6500
Hand Sanitizer Purell, 28-ez, #47005 or equal,
Purell G99-3023 (1602) ABHC#17354 /

79 2,726 |EACH 262156 Medco 6.5800
Health mask, kid, earlap, multi color, Vaulmayx,
5610ECPG-
VAULMAX, #12003530 or equal

80 5,104 [50/BOX 1021016, VIDL LLC | School Health 3.2900
Health mask, adult, ear loops, MCK167822,
McKesson brand or equal

81 2,981 [50/BOX 1040216, VIDL LLC | School Health 3.2900
Heel and lace pads, Cramer or Mueller, 3"X3",
Cramer 28052M,

82 34 |2000/Box  |Cramer €99-082514 081595909 Medco 22.3000
KimWipes, Delicate task Kimtech science wipers
14 2/3" x 16 3/5", Kimtech# 34256

83 34 1140/pk 49074, NDC School Health 9.2700
Pad, gauze - 2"X2", 12-ply, sterile, ZGP02, Dukal
D22-1212,
Tempo Medical 2212

84 46 [100/BOX 35250 Medco 3.1800
Pad, gauze - 3"X3", 12-ply, sterile, ZGP04, Dukal
D22-1312

85 85 [100/BOX 27543, SH School Health 4.2300

10




Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Pad, gauze - 4"X4", 12-ply, sterile, Dukal D22-
1412

86 71 |100/BOX 27544, SH School Health 6.8400
Pad - Telfa - 2"X3" - Sterile non-adherent pad,
Swift S60-35023

87 46 1100/BOX 27531, SH School Health 4.0400
Pad - Telfa - 3"X4" - Sterile non-adherent pad,
Swift 5-60 25034 Medline# 25710 /

88 39 |100/80x  |MoOre 10776, Swift S60-35034 317388 Medco 5.7900
Pen light - Doctor's diagnostic light, disposable,
School Health
#90-071 or equal, Adlight A36-0351, Moore
81238

89 70 |6/BOX 48012 Medco 4.1100
Petroleum jelly, York 43047, Perrigo X36-0834

90 68 |3.750z/JAR 264866 Medco 1.3600
Petroleum jelly, ZMX68, Vi-Bon 73034, Major
Pharm. 86668

91 37 |130z/JAR 36014M Medco 2.6400
Petroleum jelly, Clay Park Moore, 7062/EFC
0053-51, Denison

92 242 |1 oz Labs Y293365, Denison Lab X293365 267663 Medco 0.8400
Phisoderm, W1573, Phisoderm X763124,
McKesson 68259

93 81 |60z/BOTTLE 54001M Medco 4.1000
Pins - Safety - No. 1, Grafco G24-1039, Mabis
52917, Grafco

94 36 |144/PKG  |624-3D39-1C 90024 School Health 1.9900
Pins - Safety - No. 2, Grafco G24-2039, Mabis
52918, Grafco
G24-3039-2C

95 38 |144/PKG 90025 School Health 1.9900
Pins - Safety - No. 3 Grafco G24-3039-3C, Mabis

96 65 |144/PKG 52919 90026 School Health 1.9900

11




Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Pins - Safety - Assorted Sizes 0-3, PRO04, Sona
U12-SP125

97 39 |125/PKG 90027 School Health 1.9900
Shears - Super Pro/Super Shears, chromed steel
9" long,

08 34 |EACH Medco 75270 75270 Medco 12.0100
Scissors - bandage stainless steel, 5 1/2", Myco
M54-0874,

99 39 |EACH Medco 48005M 48005M Medco 1.1500
Scissors - bandage stainless steel, 7 1/4" ZB507,
Myco M54-0875

100 34 |EACH 36224, SH School Health 2.4800
Skin Lube Ointment,; 25lb pail, Cramer #192542,
Cramer

101 34 [EACH 1341130, Cramer €39-192542 59180 Medco 152.1800
Skin Lube Ointment, 1lb jar, Cramer or equal

102 34 |EACH 081595883 Medco 6.8600
Soap, liquid, antibacterial, 7.5 oz, with pump,
Dial

103 448 EACH NO SUBSTITUTE 54037M Medco 3.6300
Soap, liquid, germicidal antibacterial for washing
hands and
wounds, Hibiclens X303750, Hibiclens 37892
Hibiclens only. NO SUBSTITUTE

104 102 |1 GALLON 69134 Medco 50.7000
Soap, liquid, antimicrobial, D12-1002, Dial brand
or equal

105 102 |1 GALLON 31140M Medco 8.1300
Specula, disposable pneumatic, operating and
consulting
otoscope, 4.0 mm, 34/tube, Welch Allyn G24-

106 68 |[34/TUBE >2434U 555857 Medco 1.5000

12




Item #

Estimated
Usage

Unit of
Measure
(UOM)

ITEM
DESCRIPTION

Vendor Catalog
Number

Proposed
Awarded
Vendor

Price (Per
uom)

107

58

12/PKG

Splints, 12", cardboard with foam, United U10-
0012

No Bid

108

47

12/PKG

Splints, 18", cardboard with foam, United U10-
0018

No Bid

109

34

200/BAG

Sponges, gauze, 2"X2", 12-ply, non-sterile,
Hermitage ZGP321,
Dukal D22-8506

267669

Medco

S 1.2000

110

124

200/BAG

Sponges, gauze, 3"X3", 12-ply, non-sterile,
Hermitage ZGP331,
Dukal D22-8508

27534, SH

School Health

$ 2.5500

111

34

200/BAG

Sponges, gauze, 4"X4", 12-ply, non-sterile,
Hermitage ZGP341,
Dukal D22-8510

27533, SH

School Health

S 4.2200

112

40

12 ROLL/CS

Table paper roll, examination table, 18"X225 ft,
smooth,
12 roll/cs, Avalon A20-513

14442

Medco

S 49.2700

113

162

ROLL

Table paper roll, examination table 18"X225 ft,
School Health

Supply #34-234, 21-038 or equal, Avalon A20-
513

21038, SH

School Health

S 3.3500

114

102

ROLL

Table paper roll, examination table, 21"X225 ft,
Strauss CA8018,
Avalon A20-517

21161

School Health

S 4.0500

115

82

ROLL

Tape, adhesive, 1/2"X5yds waterproof, plastic
cartridge,

Tape-0 ZSTO06, Tape-0 6988418, Tape-O T30-
5360

32017M

Medco

S 0.6400

116

90

ROLL

Tape, adhesive, 1"X5 yds waterproof, plastic
cartridge, ZST07,
Tape-0 6985919, Tape-O T30-5210

32019M

Medco

$ 1.0800
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Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Tape, adhesive, 1/2"X10 yds, waterproof, plastic
cartridge,
ZST10, Tape-O 6984725, Tape-O T30-0190

117 77 |ROLL 32018M Medco S 1.1000
Tape, adhesive, 1"X10 yds, waterproof, plastic
cartridge, ZST11
Tape-O T30-0126, Tape-O 698-4003

118 85 |ROLL No Bid
Tape, adherent spray, 8oz, aerosol can, Mission
S.T.A.
Mission M62-y80, Cramer QDA

119 34 |EACH No Bid
Tape, adherent/pre-tape spray, 100z., Mueller or

120 34 |EACH equal 081679877 Medco S 8.1000
Tape, Dermalite Paper, 1"X10 yds with
dispenser, 3MTM 15301
3M M52-1535-1

121 41 [12/BOX 28497 School Health | S 6.0400
Tape, Leukotape P 1 1/2"X15 yds, (BSN-JOBST),
leukotape
B22-76168

122 34 |ROLL 081171230 Medco S 7.2900
Tape, non-woven dressing retention tape, 4"X10

123 36 |EACH yd 28256 School Health | $§ 4.4100
Tape, Zonas Porous 1", Johnson & Johnson

124 34 112/BOX 240912 Medco S 52.0500
Tape, Zonas Porous 1/2", Johnson & Johnson,
Dynarex Porous Tape, D70-3586

125 34 [24/BOX 081613934 Medco S 26.3700
Tape, Zonas Porous 1/2"X10 yds, 12 boxes/cs; 24
rools/bx,
Johnson & Johnson #5103, J&J 26226, J&J J18-

— 34 |12 Bx/cs 5103 (District specify quantity) -
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Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Thermometer probe covers, Steritemp S44-
D1002, fits digital
thermometer 012-101MC, Sanitherm M12-D100-

127 68 [100/BOX 21289, SH School Health | § 2.4300
Thermometer probe covers, Therm PLK, T40-
PC800, Welch Allyn
Thermoscan 678-2442 Thermoscan - NO

128 68 [200/BOX SUBSTITUTE No Bid
Thermometer probe covers, W. Allyn Moore,
Welch Allyn T40-
05031, Welch Allyn 840-2661, Welch Sure Temp-
NO SUBSTITUTE

129 108 |1000/BOX 21394 School Health | S 40.3100
Thermometer, Tempa-dot single use, fhrenheit,
sterile,
Tmpadot OR002, Nex Temp M40-1112

130 68 [100/BOX 13052 School Health | S 32.0400
Thermometer, Vera-temp, Non-contact, DET-

131 104 |EACH 306 7103017 Medco $ 20.0100
Tongue depressors, junior size, 500/bx, Moore
69616, Amsino

132 107 |500/BOX A60-0020 04221 Medco S 6.5800
Tongue Depressors, wood senior size, Solon S30-
F322, Moore
69617, Amsino A60-0019

133 271 |1500/BOX 04220 Medco S 7.0000
Vomit Bags, School Nurse #13477 or equiv

134 68 [20/bx 1002657 School Health | S$ 17.5900
Wipes, baby, unscented, non-toxic, Huggies or
equal PDI
P38-132EO, PDI P38-233XT

135 926 |80/PKG 1040442, SH School Health | S 2.0100
Wipes, disinfecting, any scent, Clorox only - NO
SUBSTITUTE

136 6,528 |75/PKG 49788 School Health | S 6.5400
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Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Wipe towelettes, cleansing, antiseptic,
benzalkonium, Triad

137 926 |100/B0X 31964-PS135, Triad 68535, Moore 68535 317543 Medco 8 2 7500
Calamine Lotion-Non-phenolated, Must have
current expire date and 1 year shelf life from
date of
shipment. School Health 43394

138 51 |60z btl 1034910 School Health | § 2.5700
Calagel, anti-itch gel, 60z, 37995M

139 61 |60z btl 37995M Medco S 4.7800
AED Pads, Adult G5 plus

140 77 |ea 55950 School Health | $§ 72.6900
AED Battery Lithium G3 plus, 54235

141 17 |ea 54235 School Health | $ 338.3500
AED Battery Lithium G5 plus, 55858

142 17 |ea 55858 School Health | $§ 349.6000
Reusable/Washable Masks

143 1,743 |ea No Bid
Protective Procedure Adult Gown, Disposable,

144 357 |16/bag CYPRESS EXIGSP4001 21047 (50/Case) | School Health | $ 25.0800
Face Shield, Anti-fog, Market Lab # 7044

145 1,037 ea ACS FS-020-01 Pyramid S 1.9900
Clear Mouth Masks, Youth

146 425 |5/bag 1020168 School Health | $ 11.9900
Clear Mouth Mask, Adult

147 425 |5/bag No Bid
ZOLL Powerheart G5 Intellisense Pediatric
Electrode Pads (XELAEDOO3C). SH Item #55951

148 50 |ea 55951 School Health | $ 100.6300
Tooth Saver Treasure Chest 200/package. Item
#90404

149 20 |200/PKG 16 90404 School Health | $§ 9.0900




Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)
Sharps Disposal By mail System - 1 Gallon.
ltem#1003725
150 20 |GALLON/1 1041153 School Health | S 62.4600
Green Soap Germicidal - 1 Gallon. Item #34045
151 10 |GALLON/1 34045 School Health | S 17.3100
Disinfectant Wipe Clorox Health Care Hydrogen
Peroxide Disinfectant Cleaner Wipes. Alcohol
Free. 155 Wipes per Tub. 6 Tubs/Case. Item #
170145. No Substitutes.
152 3,000 [1/TUB Clorox #CLO30825 Pyramid S 7.9900
Cloth Drape for Faceshields
153 ea No Bid
PART 2 - ATHLETIC TRAINING SUPPLIES
Adhesive foam rubber 1/4"X6"X72", Arrowhead
A48-PFIYA,
Aetna A30-953096, Moore 09237
1 34 [ROLL 29003, SH School Health | S 11.8400
Bottle, plastic with squirt top, 4 oz, G18-0086,
Medco 21100,
2 49 |EACH United G18-0086 21100 Medco $ 0.9600
Bottle, wide mouth, 1 quart squeeze with
push/pull lids,
Gatorade38081 or equal, Mueller M99-020601,
3 34 [6/CASE Cramer 21090, Bottles only 1379307-6 BSN $ 18.2400
Crutches, aluminum, light weight quick-fit rubber
tips, hand grip
sand arm pads, X-lg adult size, Temco G24-3611,
Nova N18-3611
4 34 |PAIR 45004 School Health | $§ 24.2700
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Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)

Flex wrap, with handle, Cramer 236106 or equal,
cramerPF-
236106, Flex-I-Wrap C99-236106, Cramer C99-
236106

5 39 |6 ROLL/CS 081243179 Medco 43.3400
Flex wrap, without handle, Cramer 2361047 or
equal, Cramer

6 39 |6 ROLL/CS [C99-236107 081243187 Medco 44.3200
Moleskin, 2"X25 yds, andover ARRM 520,
Andover 6815072,041-020-250-024

7 34 [ROLL 7021285 Medco 18.8300
Scissors, Clauss Bandage, A&K AP503, Chanby
3788958

8 34 |EACH 75270 Medco 12.0100
Tape cutter shark, or equal, Shark PF304, Shark
C99-20080

9 34 |EACH 081571678 Medco 9.8600
Tape cutter, zip cut, SH 36-067, Zip Cut 262500

10 34 |EACH 76420 Medco 1.1000
Tape, bike conform Il 7482, 2"X7 1/2 yds,
adhesive elastic
athletic stretch tape, Liteguard 28-128, A48-
LG200, Tape-O-Lite
T30-LWT2, Medco 85295

11 38 [24 ROLL/CS 85295 Medco 48.1900
Tape, bike conform Il 7483, 3"X7 1/2 yds, elastic
athletic tape,
Liteguard A48-LG300, Tape-O-Lite T30-LWTS3,
Medco 85290

12 36 [16 ROLL/CS 85290 Medco 48.1900
Tape, Elastikon, J&J 5172, 1"X2.5 yds, 5 yds
stretched, 12 rolls/bx,
15172, )& 118-5172

13 36 [12 BOX/CS 28034 School Health 23.9200
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Unit of Proposed
Estimated Measure ITEM Vendor Catalog Awarded Price (Per
Item # Usage (UOM) DESCRIPTION Number Vendor UOoOM)
Tape, Elastikon, J&J 5174, 2"X2.5 yds, 5 yds
6/BX stretched, 6 rolls/bx,

14 36 [12Box/cs [/&))18-5174 7103256 Medco 22.8800
Tape, Elsatikon, J&J 5175, 3"X2.5 yds, 5 yds
stretched, 4 roll/bx,
J&J J18-5175

15 36 |12 BOX/CS 28036 School Health 23.9200
Tape, Coach, J&J5188, 1 1/2"X15 yds, NO

16 36 |32/case |PUBSTITUTE 28026 School Health 86.5700
Tape, pre-tape underwrap, Cramer or equal,
Cramer PF0OO1,
Cramer C99-214592

17 34 |48/CASE 28500 School Health 55.4100
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