NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

AWARDED VENDOR LIST

Page 1of1

BID TITLE: Office and Classroom Supplies

BID NUMBER: 1314-104N

CONTRACT PERIOD: 01/01/14 — 12/31/14

SPONSORING DISTRICT: Bonsall Union School District
DISTRICT CONTACT: Jessica Kinder

PH: (760) 631-5200 ext. 1007 FAX: (760) 631-5366

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 7 DAYS

MIN QTY FOR FREE FREIGHT: $50.00

E-Mail: jessica.kinder@bonsallusd.com

VENDOR NAME ADDRESS PHONE/FAX NUMBERS CONTACT NAME CASH disc | M/W/DVBE
. 260 Ryan Ave. Phone: (800) 631-1621 Sylvia Clark n/a n/a
Elgin School Supply Co., Inc
Chico, CA 95973 Fax:  (530) 894-6338 Elgin260@hotmail.com
. 1505 E. McFadden Ave. Phone: (800) 925-0054 Sita Beasley
Lamination Depot, Inc.
Santa Ana, CA 92705 Fax: (800) 616-5543 sita@laminationdepot.com n/a n/a
, 6170 Cornerstone Ct. East Phone: (858) 352-0479 Michael Stechel
Office Depot
Suite 180 Fax: (858) 352-0489 Mike.stechel@officedepot.com n/a n/a
San Diego, CA 92121
) W6316 Design Drive Phone: (888) 388-3224 Shirley MacKenzie
School Specialty, Inc.
Greenville, WI 54942 Fax:  (888)388-6344 bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com | n/a n/a
(reference bid #7775471812)
) 2251 Foster Ave. Phone: (800) 870-1315 Herb Ross
Standard Stationery Supply
Co. Wheeling, IL 60090 Fax:  (847) 870-1338 hross@bestschoolbuys.com n/a n/a
805 N. Barrington Ave Phone: (800) 227-7159 Travis Harris
Southwest School and Office g (800)
Supply Ontario, CA 91764 biddesk@southwestschool.com n/a n/a

Fax:  (909) 980-7159




———— AMENDMENT NO. 1
Date: February 5, 2014

To: Members
Associate Members
Sandy Beare — Escondido Union School District
Sita Beasley — Lamination
Travis Harris — Southwest School and Office Supply
Christopher Duffy — School Specialty
Mike Stechel — Office Depot
Sylvia Clark — Elgin School Supply Co.
Herb Ross — Standard Stationery Supply

From: Jessica Kinder
Bid Administrator

Subject: Office & Classroom Supply
Bid #1314-104N

The following is a listing of the change(s) in the bid award:

Item #: Page # Description:

Vendor Page Reference Bid #7775471812 on orders for School Specialty

Vendor Page Contract Period: 01/01/14-12/31/14

Vendor Page Correct Spelling of REP’s name from Lamination Depot: Sita
Beasley

Vendor Page Correct mailing address for Lamination Depot: 1505 E

McFadden Avenue

52 7 School Specialty did not bid correct unit of measure. Re-
Award to next low bidder.

69 8 School Specialty did not bid correct unit of measure. Re-
Award to next low bidder.
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Amendment #1 Bid #1314-104N continued...

ltem #:

96

105

128

164

221

228

231

Page #

Description:

11

13

16

20

26

27

27

School Specialty did not bid correct unit of measure. Re-
Award to next low bidder.

School Specialty did not bid correct unit of measure. NO-BID
Line.

School Specialty did not bid correct unit of measure. Re-
Award to next low bidder.

School Specialty did not bid correct unit of measure. Re-
Award to next low bidder.

Item bid by Standard Stationery Supply did not meet
required standard “or equal’. Re-Award to next low bidder.

Item bid by Standard Stationery Supply did not meet
required standard “or equal’. Re-Award to next low bidder.

Item discontinued by Manufacturer — NO BID line

Please exchange the enclosed for those in your file.

All changes are indicated in bold and have bold ***** at the item number column.

Please copy and distribute to your internal staff.
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
1 1o "o
379 | Bag |Bands. rubber, vilb. Bag, 232" long x 1/16" wide, #16, EXPOO613, | cr,\paRp STATIONERS GENERAL 16 3695 $ 0.59
Alliance 2416808, or equal.
1
N " -
737 | Bag |Bands. rubber, ¥alb. bag, 3" long x 1/8" wide, #32, EXPO0616, STANDARD STATIONERS GENERAL 32 3698 $ 0.59
Alliance 2432808, or equal.
2
. . .
1054 Bag 5;:8(3:5, rubber, ¥ Ib. bag, assorted sizes, #54, Alliance 28548, or STANDARD STATIONERS GENERAL 54 3700 S 0.59
3
2778 Ea Battery, 9 volt, Alkaline, each Duracell PC1604, Panasonic 6AM6, STANDARD STATIONERS PAIRDEER AL-9V 8278 S 074
Energizer EN22, or equal.
4
9163 | 4-Pk E;;t;lry, AA, Alkaline, 4 pack, Energizer EN9L, Energizer B-91BP of | o\ gD sTATIONERS PAIRDEER AL-AA 8274 $ 0.60
5
Battery, AAA, Alkaline, 4 pack Panasonic AM4, Energizer EN92,
6203 4-Pk Energizer E-92BP4, Innovera 11124, or equal. STANDARD STATIONERS PAIRDEER AL-AAA 8275 S 0.55
6
3452 | 2-pk |Battery. C, Alkaline, 2 pack Kodak 6150-C, Panasonic AM2, STANDARD STATIONERS PAIRDEER AL-C 8276 $ 0.98
Energizer 93-BP2, or equal.
7
. . THWEST SCHOOL
2400 2-Pk [Battery, D, Alkaline, 2 pack, Energizer 95BP-2 or equal. SoU ST SCHOOL & Rayovac 813-2 SSS6150D2PK S 1.09
OFFICE SUPPLY
8
#086371, BLACK
#086372, RED
Binders, 2", vinyl, two inside pockets, black & all colors, Acco #086373, BLUE
. HOOL SPECIALTY HOOL SMART .
2307 Ea 368-44, EXP600XX, Samsill 116XX, School Smart 08637XX, or equal. SCHOOL SPEC SCHOOLS #086374, MAROON 2 1.09
#086375, GREEN
9 #086376, WHITE
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
#086378, BLACK
#086379, RED
Binders, 3", vinyl, two inside pockets, black, white & all colors, 4036381 BLUE
225 Ea |Van-Go 88-733X, EXP600XX, Acco/W-J 368-49,Samsill 1180X, SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART ! S 1.70
#086382, MAROON
School Smart 0863XX, or equal.
#086383, GREEN
10 #086384, WHITE
Binders, \{lew, 1" round ring, 2 |n5|de.pockets, black, white & all SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & $SS11051.0BE - Blue,
13721 Ea |colors, Wilson Jones W362-14X, Samsill 185XX, Acco/OD 0571X, or OFFICE SUPPLY Southwest 1105-1.0XX $SS11051.BK - Black, S 0.91
equal. $SS11051.WE - White
11
Binders, view, 2" round ring, 2 inside pockets, black, white & all #086395, BLACK
4264 Ea |colors, Wilson Jones W362-44XX, Samsil 185XX, Acco/OD 0573X or SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #086396, BLUE S 1.14
12 equal. #086394, WHITE
#086398, BLACK
Binders, view, 3" round ring, 2 inside pockets, black, white & all !
375 Ea colors, Samill 185XX, Acco/OD 0574X, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #086399, BLUE S 1.77
13 #086397, WHITE
SSS11001.0BE - Blue,
_ _ o _ _ L Southwest 11001.0BE, BK | >>>+1001-0BK- Black,
Binders, vinyl, 1" ring size, medium weight, 3 ring with inside Wilson Jones 36814NC S$SS11001.0BY -
8474 Ea pocket, double open/close boosters, 8% X 11", black & all colors, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & Southwest 11001 OGN’ Burgandy, $ 0.85
Van Go 88-731-XX, Acco 368-14, EXP600XX, Wilson Jones W?368- OFFICE SUPPLY ) ) $SS11001.0GN - Green, ’
. Wilson Jones 36814NM,
14XX, Samsill 113XX, or equal. Southwest 11001.0RD. WE $S511001.0GY - Gray,
outhwes ORS $5511001.0RD - Red,
SSS11001.0WE - White
14
634027 WHITE
293883 RED
293892 PINK
Board, tag, colored on sides, 22x 28, 145#, 25 shts/pkg, all PACON CORP 293919 ORANGE
2645 Pkg |colors, Pacon Peacock PAC53XX-X (White is PAC5460-7) NO OFFICE DEPOT 160-7 293937 YELLOW S 7.96
SUBSTITUTE 293946 DARK GREEN
293973 DARK BLUE
293982 LIGHT BLUE
15 293838 BLACK
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Board, tag, heavy weight, manila 22x28", ruled, %" spacing 22"
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
2541 | Sheet |way, Southwest 5610-075, American Paper Converters AMT 2208-1, Southwest 5610075 $555610075 S 0.20
OFFICE SUPPLY
16 Pacon 190155, or equal.
Board, tag, manila, 22%2"x28%" NOT RULED, 100 shts/pkg, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
4914 Pkg American Paper 1522MC, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY APC 1522MC S5525603MA > 13.45
17
Board, tag, manila, 22%2"x28%", ruled 1" short way, both sides,
. . . . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
497 Pkg |medium weight 110 Ib., 100 shts/pkg, Riverside 90116, American Pacon 5193 $SS75610-1 $ 17.10
OFFICE SUPPLY
18 AMT2209-1, or equal.
Board, tag, white, 22%:"x28%", 100 shts/pkg, Imperial 5603WE, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
168 Pkg Spartan1522WP, American Paper 1522WP, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY APC 1522WC SS5Z5603WE 2 15.19
19
Book, class record, No. 4A, Tops 41200, ColorFX, Hammond & HAMMOND AND
L SPECIALT .
110 Ea Stephens 0649P, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY STEPHENS, # 083739 083739 2 1.0
20
Book, composition, Grade 3-5, 100 sheets - 200 pages, 9 - %" x 7-
. . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
12960 Ea ([1/2", wide rule, Roaring Springs 84009, OD995490D, Mead 09910, or OFFICE SUPPLY Southwest 11445WM SSS11445WM S 0.69
equal.
21
Book, composition, Grade K-2, 9-3,"x7-3.", 24 |leaves, ruled, ROARING SPRINGS
) ) FFICE DEPOT 1 .
1696 | Doz |paring Springs 77902 (pkg./12) NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE DEPO 77902 350909 > 780
22
Book, composition, side opening, 8¥2x6%", ink paper, ruled 63"
. . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
10331 | Doz |way, 40 leafs - 80 pages, Imperial 1140-40, Brazil SP1510B, SMX Imperial 1140-40 $55114040 S 3.42
OFFICE SUPPLY
23 Spartan SP1510C,(12/pkg.) or equal.
41 H H 1 3 " H 3 "
Book, composition, side opemng, 8Y2x6%4", ink paper, ruled 6% OFFICE DEPOT BRAND
2956 Doz [|way, 20 leafs - 40 pages, Brazil SP1500B, SMX Spartan SP1500C, or OFFICE DEPOT MNT-012 342444 $ 2.64
equal.
24
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Book, composition, side opening, 8¥%x6-7/8", wide ruling, 40 leafs - OFFICE DEPOT BRAND
1 E . FFICE DEPOT 172 .
5300 | Ea g4 hages, Office Depot 172809 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE DEPO MNT-010 72809 2 0.4
25
Book, composition, side opening, 8¥2x6-7/8", wide ruling, 40 leafs | OFFICE DEPOT BRAND
2248 Ea 80 pages, Office Depot 172809 or equal OFFICE DEPOT MNT-010 172809 2 0.46
26
Boxes, storage, letter/legal size with lids, with hand grips .
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & South t P |
837 | Ctn |(12"x15"x10"), light duty, 12 boxes/ctn, Perma P03325Q, Fellows OFFICE SUPPLY ou ;“A’l‘zzgo':”ace SSSZ1441LRG $ 12.60
27 00703, OD 808337, or equal.
_ THWEST SCHOOL
1595 [ Each [Calculator, Hand Held, Casio SL-300SV, Solar or equal, or equal. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & Charles Leonard 39100 SSSLEO39100 S 1.60
OFFICE SUPPLY
28
Cards, index, 3x5", plain, white, medium weight, 100/pkg,
7 Pk X L SPECIALT L T 31
6376 g Highmark C035,Esselte 30, School Smart 088708, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 088708 088708 2 0.3
29
Cards, index, 3x5", ruled, white, medium weight, 100/pkg, Esselte [ SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
10003 | Pkg 31, Oxford 7321XXX, School Smart 088706, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY APC IND3SRL 5551201WE 2 031
30
#088724, BLUE
Cards, index, 3x5", plain, all colors, medium weight, 100/pkg, #088725, CANARY
3476 Pkg Esselte 7320XXX, School Smart 088XXX, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #088726, CHERRY > 0.47
31 #088727, GREEN
#088715, BLUE
Cards, index, 3x5", ruled, all colors, medium weight, 100/pkg, #088716, CANARY
1715 Pkg Esselte 7321XXX, School Smart 088XXX, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #088717, CHERRY » 0.47
32 #088718, GREEN
Cards, index, 4x6", plain, white, medium weight, 100/pkg, Esselte
430 Pkg 40, Oxford 40, School Smart 088712, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 088712 088712 S 0.51
33
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Cards, index, 4x6", ruled, white, medium weight, 100/pkg, Esselte
HOOL SPECIALTY HOOL SMART, # 71 71 .51
918 Pkg 41, Oxford 41, School Smart 088710, or equal. SCHOOL SPEC SCHOOLS , # 088710 088710 ? 0-5
34
Cards, index, 5x8", plain, white, medium weight, 100/pkg, Esselte
1779 Pkg 50, Oxford 50, School Smart 088714, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 088714 088714 S 0.86
35
Cards, index, 5x8", ruled, white, medium weight, 100/pkg, Esselte
HOOL SPECIALTY HOOL SMART, # 71 71 .
1345 Pkg 51, Oxford 51, School Smart 088713, or equal. SCHOOL SPEC SCHOOL S  # 088713 088713 ? 0.86
36
Chalk, colored, 12 assorted colors to box, anti-dust, chalkboard
use, Rose Art 1240AD, Omyacolor 49082, Sanford 10876, Dixon
365 Box 61400, School Smart 084833, or equal. Art and craft material SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 084833 084833 S 0.15
37 requirement must be met.
Chalk, white, 12 sticks to box, chalkboard use, Crayola 50-1402
. . HOOL SPECIALTY RAYOLA LL -1402 4 2
439 Box Art and craft material requirement must be met. NO SUBSTITUTE SCHOOL SPECIA CRAYOLALLC, #50-140 00803 2 0.29
38
THWEST SCHOOL
370 Each |Chart, tablet, 24" x 16", 1 -1/2 ruling, Pacon # 74720, or equal. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & APC APS2415H S§SS552534 S 1.20
OFFICE SUPPLY
39
286 Box Clamps, paper, #1, 12/box, Charles Leonard 401, Office Mate 99966, STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS 1 1249 $ 0.34
Southwest 1295-1, or equal.
40
14" - -
446 | Box |C1amps, paper, #2, 112" long, 50/box, Acosta IDE-2, SMX IDE-2, STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS 2 1250 $ 0.53
Southwest 1295-2, or equal.
41
Cleaner, dry erase surface, 8 0z. spray pump, SAN 81803, DIX WHITEBOARD WIZARD
. TANDARD STATIONER 11 1.01
316 Ea 94008, or equal. Flammable - Not for use in K-6 classrooms. STANDARD STATIONERS 81803 437 2 0
42
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Cleaner, dry erase surface, NON-TOXIC, 22 oz. spray bottle, EXPO | SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
624 Ea 1752229, or equal OFFICE SUPPLY EXPO 1752229 §S51947SP S 4.35
43
Clipboard, legal size, 9x15%", standard, clip, Officemate 83141, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & SOUTHWEST IMPERIAL
988 Ea Southwest Imperial 1272LG, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY 1272LG 555127216 ? 0.68
44
Clipboard, letter size, standard, clip, Universal 40304, Officemate SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & SOUTHWEST IMPERIAL
3959 Ea 83140, Southwest Imperial 1272LR, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY 1272LR 5551272LR 2 0-58
45
743 Box (;(I;S;, binder, 1/4", 12/box, Leonard 50001, School Smart 038221, or STANDARD STATIONERS GENERAL BC10 10066 S 014
46
Clips, binder, 3/8", 12/box, School Smart 032397, Leonard BC02
131 B v ' ' ' ! ! TANDARD STATIONER ENERAL BC2 1 .17
310 ox Office Deport 825182BX, or equal. S S ONERS G €20 >13 2 0
47
1560 | Box |C1IPS: Pinder, 5/8, 12/box, Imperial 1294-050, Leonard BCOS, SCHOOL SPECIALTY | SCHOOL SMART, # 032400 032400 $ 0.36
School Smart 032400, or equal.
48
Clips, binder, 1" small, 12/box, Leonard BC10, School Smart SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
1030 Box 032403, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Imperial 1294100 §551294100 S 0.86
49
. OFFICEMATE INTL/OFFICE
Clips, paper, smooth, #1, 100 per box, 10 box/ctn, EXP40020,
5442 Ctn Officemate/OD10001, SchoolMax PC33, or equal. OFFICE DEPOT DEPOT BRAND 308478 S 1.23
10001
50
. . OFFICEMATE INTL/OFFICE
Clips, paper, smooth, jumbo, 100 per box, 10 box/ctn, Acco 65639,
" FFICE DEPOT DEPOT BRAND .
8318 cn Officemate/OD 10004, SchoolMax PC50, or equal. OFFiC ° cl)OOOZA 308239 > 3.58
51
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME ,
NO. | UsAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
ok Compass w/pencil, 5%" width, 6" measuring arc with 3%" pencil, | SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
52 | 1181 | B2 1iohox, Acosta AC601, SMX ACB01, Southwest 13010, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY SOUTHWEST 13010 55513010 3 0-30
(A#1)
Correction fluid, all purpose, .6 fl. oz., Gillette/PAP/Sanford 28411
5057 Ea NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS PAP SANFORD 28411 5557 S 0.49
53
Correction fluid, bond white, 6 fl. oz., Gillette/PAP/Sanford 56401
398 Ea NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS PAP 56401 4680 S 0.79
54
25 EA :(?J;lecnon fluid, Ledger Buff, .6 fl. 0z., Liquid Paper PAPS66-01, of | or\\narp STATIONERS | PLANET PLEASER 45%00 1758 $ 0.51
55
582 Ea [Correction fluid, pen, .6 fl. 0z., PAP 56201 NO SUBSTITUTE ELGIN Papermate 56201 56201 S 1.23
56
i 3" i -
553 | Ea [|D'SPenser tape, %7, plastic, hand-held, black, SMXTD127, STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS H127 1308 $ 0.20
Southwest 189034, or equal.
57
. 3M CO
256 Ea [Dispenser, tape, %" ,desk top, black, 3M C38BK NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE DEPOT C38-BK 173336 S 1.81
58
Dispenser, tape, plastic, hand-held, smoke, 3M H127 NO 3McCOo
2409 Ea SUBSTITUTE - OFFICE DEPOT H-127 910372 S 0.59
59
Dividers, notebook, clear plastic reinforced edge-one side, 5 Tab-
SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
11088 | Pkg |Clear, 1%" Tab, 28#, KleerFax 05110, Office Depot OD574789, or OEFICE SUPPLY KLEERFAX 05110 SSS1115CR S 0.22
equal.
60
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Dividers, notebook, clear plastic reinforced edge-one side, 5 Tab-
) SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
8610 Pkg |Assorted colors, 1%" Tab, #28, Office Depot 574803, KleerFax KLEERFAX 05119 SSS1115AD S 0.22
OFFICE SUPPLY
05119, or equal.
61
Dividers, Notebook, clear plastic reinforced edge-one side, 8 Tab- | SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
4079 Pkg Assorted colors, 28#, Kleerfax 08119, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY KLEERFAX 08119 5551118AD 2 0.32
62
Envelopes, manila or kraft, 6"x9", 28#, gummed flap with fastener,| SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
454 B . South t 1330055 $SS1330055 4.30
5 ox 100/box, Westvaco C0955, Quality Park 37855, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY outhwes ?
63
Envelope, manila or kraft, 6"x9", Redi-Seal self-adhesive, Quality SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
115 Box Park, 100/box, Southwest #SSS1334-31, or equal OFFICE SUPPLY Quality Park 43167 555133431 2 6.40
64
Envelopes, manila or kraft, 9"x12", gummed flap with fastener, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
2 1 .
169 1 BOX |1 5o/box, SSS 1330090, School Smart 085044 OFFICE SUPPLY Universal 35264 5551330090 > >40
65
Envelopes, manila or kraft, 10"x12", 28#, gummed flap with
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
110 Box |[fastener, 100/box, CEB 03349, Westvaco C0795, Quality Park Southwest 1330095 $SS1330095 S 8.68
OFFICE SUPPLY
37895, or equal.
66
Envelopes, manila or kraft, 10"x13", 28#, gummed flap with SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
. 1 1 .
455 Box fastener, 100/box, Westvaco 78997, Quality Park 37897, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Southwest 1330097 5551330097 2 6.35
67
Envelopes, manila or kraft, 12x15-1/2", 28#, gummed flap with
SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
115 Box [fastener, 100/box, Universal 35270, Westvaco C0910, School Smart Southwest 1330110 $SS1330110 S 8.89
OFFICE SUPPLY
085056, or equal.
68
ke Envelopes, kraft or manila, 6"x9", 28#, Gummed Flap, Without SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
' L ' ' ' lity Park 40767 1344 .
69 | 160 | BOX |r stener, 100/box, Quality Park QUA40767, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Quality Park 4076 5551344055 3 >60
(A#1)
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
520 | Box |ENVElOpes, kraftor manila, 9"x12" 28#, Redi-Seal, 100/box, Quality | - ¢-iq0) speciatty |SCHOOL SMART, # 085018 085018 $ 7.33
Park 43567 or equal.
70
Envelopes, kraft or manila, 10"x13", 28#, Redi-Seal, 100/box, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
136 Box Quality Park 43767, School Smart 085016, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Quality Park 43767 555133437 > 8.73
71
ke Envelopes, white, 9"x12", gummed, no fasteners, 100/box, School| SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
72 12 Box Smart 085033, or equal OFFICE SUPPLY Quality Park 41413 SSS9QUA41413 S 10.46
(A#1)
Envelopes, white, 10"x13", #28, Redi-Seal, 100/box, OFFICE DEPOT BRAND
50 Box MeadWestVaco/Columbian #C0925 or equal. OFFICE DEPOT 77925 331064 > 10.02
73
. CENEVO CORP/QUALITY
Envelopes, white, 10"x13", gummed no fastner, 100/box, Staples
14 B E DE P 2 10.
3 0oX 295840, QUA-41613 or equal OFFIC POT ARK 532053 S 0.85
41613
74
1089 Box Envelopes, white, #10, bond, small rounded flap, 500/box, School SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & Universal 36320 5551326010 S 6.05
Smart 085022, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY
75
Envelopes, white, #10, bond, 500/box, Universal 35210, Columbia SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
2 1 .
224 | BOX |3/8144. Westvaco 78125, School Smart 085022, QUA90020 or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Universal 36320 5551326010 2 645
76
Envelopes, white, #10, window, 500/box, Westvaco 76170
, , ' ) , , S E L
25 Box |Dependable 10P, Quality Park 21326, School Smart 085027, or OUE:\:{C:TSSE:E)YO & Ampad 73221 $S51327010W S 8.30
equal.
77
Eraser, chalkboard, noiseless, felt, dustless, will not scratch
1091 Ea |chalkboard, 5"x2"x1", 12/box, Quartet EA0O5, Leonard 74535, Kraft [ STANDARD STATIONERS CHALKBUSTER 2010 7861 S 0.44
78 2019, or equal.
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME ,
NO. | UsAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
6033 Ea [Erasers, dry erase surface, Sanford Expo 81505 NO SUBSTITUTE ELGIN Sanford 81505 81505 S 1.36
79
Erasers, pencil top, fits all standard pencils, pink, Imperial 13710, | SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
1379 |Gross SMX (Acosta) 1212, Office Depot 54117, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY IMPERIAL 13710 55513710 2 0.9
80
Erasers, pencil, soft pink, 3 dozen/box, SMX (Acosta) 500, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
1514 Box Southwest 213555, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY SOUTHWEST 713555 §SSZ13555 S 1.42
81
Erasers, pink, beveled, soft, latex-free, Pink Pearl by PaperMate
3748 Doz PAP70521, Imperial 13675, or equal. STANDARD STATIONERS EASY ERASE G-100 1258 S 0.65
82
Fasteners, paper, round head, ¥2", 100/box, Classroom Select SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
7011 BOX |59902, Imperial 1390-2, School Smart 059946, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY IMPERIAL 1390-2 55513902 > 0.43
83
3/
969 | Box |-asteners, paper, round head, brass, %", 100/box, Leonard 3RBP, SCHOOL SPECIALTY | SCHOOL SMART, # 059949 059949 $ 0.49
Southwest 1390-3, or equal.
84
Fasteners, paper, round head, 3/8", 100/box, Imperial 1390-1,
HOOL SPECIALTY HOOL SMART, # 2 2 .
292 Box Leonard 1RBP, Southwest 1390-1, or equal. SCHOOL SPEC SCHOOLS ,#00995 00995 > 0.40
85
224 Pkg |Flags, 1", 2pk, Red, Post-It® 680-RD2, or equal. STANDARD STATIONERS POST IT 680RD2 11673 S 2.46
86
137 Pkg [Flags, 1", 2pk, Yellow, Post-It® 680-W2, or equal. STANDARD STATIONERS POST IT 680W?2 11674 $ 2.46
87
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME ,
NO. | UsAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
. . SMEAD MFG CO/OFFICE
Folders, manila, letter size, 1/3 cut, 11 pt, 100/box, Smead
) FFICE DEPOT DEPOT BRAND 1 .
2643 | BOX | opg10838, Universal 12113, Esselte 370-1/3, or equal. OFFICE DEPO © 810838 ° 7
88 810838
Folder, manila, legal size, 1/3 cut, 100/box, SSS141413, Esselte SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
554 Box 37113, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Esselte 371-1/3 S$S5141413 S 6.65
89
Folders, assorted colors, letter size, 1/3 cut, 12/pkg, Classroom SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
374 | PKY |select 49284, Smead 11641, School Smart 001947, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Smead 11641 S551418AD 2 3.40
920
1974 | Box |Tolders, assorted colors, 11"x 8-1/2" sheet size, inside pockets, SCHOOL SPECIALTY | SCHOOL SMART, # 084900 084900 $ 3.71
no rings, 25/box, standard grade, Esselte 57513, or equal.
91
Folders, hanging, letter size, plastic tabs, plastic coated hangers, | SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
14 B E 2-1 14211 .
05 ox 1/5 cut, green, 25/box, Esselte 81602, SmeadVPO133, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY sselte 372-1/5 555 > 2 4.00
92
Folders, hanging, legal size, plastic tabs, plastic coated hangers, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
412 Box 1/5 cut, green, 25/box, Esselte 373-1/5, Smead VPO135 or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Esselte 373-1/5 555142215 2 >-46
93
. . . o #085113, ORANGE
Folders, hanging, letter size, plastic tabs and white inserts, 1/5 SCHOOL SMART #085110, YELLOW
248 Box |cut, all colors, 25/box, Pendaflex 4152-15, Oxford 92500, Esselte SCHOOL SPECIALTY #085012, BRIGHT GREEN #0851i1 RED S 5.43
816XX, Smead 644XXX, or I 109, BLUE !
94 6 orequa #085109, BLU #0865112, PURPLE
Glue stick, washable, lipstick style applicator, non-toxic, .74 oz. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
12362 Ea UHU stick, Saunders 99649 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY SAUNDERS 59649 SS51043WE 2 0.90
95
SxE Glue stick, works on paper, cardboard, photos, washable, non-
96 2906 Ea [staining, lipstick style applicator, non-toxic, .74 oz; Man 99649, or OFFICE DEPOT CRAYOLA LLC, #56-1135 790304 S 0.46
(A#1) Binney & Smith/Crayola 56-1135 NO SUBSTITUTE
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Glue Stick, works on paper, fabric & photos, non-toxic, washable,
rubs on purple or blue-dries clear, .28 0z, 12 to box, UHU SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
142 E . . . DIXON 15089 SSS10428BE 0.16
939 a Stick,Crayola 1228, Dixon 15089, Office Depot 95098-0D, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY ?
97 Art and craft material requirement must be met.
Glue, roll-on, 1.69 oz., plastic bottle with flat side, Prang 1400,
7369 Ea Impe.rlal 10400, Dixon DIX 49899, or equal. Art and craft material SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & IMPERIAL 10400 5510400 S 0.69
requirement must be met. OFFICE SUPPLY
98 Imperial 1041-50 not acceptable.
Labels, address, 1"x 2-5/8", 30 labels/sht, 100 shts/box, 3,000 AVERY PRODUCTS
353 Box |[labels/box, Avery #5160 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE DEPOT CORPORATION 364364 S 17.15
929 5160
Labels, address, 1"x 2-5/8", 30 labels/sht, 250 shts/box, 7,500
323 Box labels/box, Maco ML3000B NO SUBSTITUTE ELGIN Maco ML3000B ML3000B S 17.20
100
SSS1450AD - Assorted,
SSS1450DBE - Dark Blue,
Labels, sheet, pressure sensitive, approximately 9/16"x3- 7/16 ", SSS1450GN - Green,
SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & M FF-LA1, L5, L6, L4, i
155 Box |all colors, 248 labels per box, Avery OD-010X, Z Label 052XX, aco SSS1450LBE - Light Blue, | $ 0.86
OFFICE SUPPLY L2, 11, L3
Maco FF-LX, or equal. SSS1450RD - Red,
SSS1450WE - White,
SSS1450YW - Yellow
101
Laminating film, 1.5 mil, 25" wide, 1" core, 500', 2 rolls/case, GBC ——
LAMINATION DEPOT L D 1-255-1 A4
775 1 €S 13500004, TAM 25500, School Smart 1403528, or equal. ON DEPO amination Depot 01-255-1x ? 30.40
102
Laminating film, 1.5 mil, 27" wide, 1" core, 500', 2 rolls/case, Bryce L
280 Cs 01-275-1C, GBC 3126061, School Smart 1403529, or equal. LAMINATION DEPOT Lamination Depot 01-275-1c S 32.82
103
2 Roll |Laminating Film, 3 mil, clear, 25" wide, 1" core, 250’ LAMINATION DEPOT Lamination Depot 03-253-1c S 20.99
104
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
. 573 Ea Markers, Bulk, Felt Point, All Colors, Crayola 58-7700, AP Certified, NO BID
or equal.
105
(A#1)
Markers, dry erase, broad point, 4-color set, Sanford Expo 83074
9296 Set NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS SANFORD 83074 1392 S 291
106
#1354253, BLACK
Markers, dry erase, broad point, all colors, 12/pkg, School Smart #1354271, BLUE
222 Doz 077XXX, Sanford 921XX, Dixon 921XX, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #1400753, RED 2 .17
#1400752, GREEN
107
Markers, dry erase, chisel point, 4-color set, Avery 24409 NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
2233 Set SUBSTITUTE I OFFICE SUPPLY AVERY 24409 §$S51544004 S 2.28
108
Markers, dry erase, chisel point, 4-color set, non-toxic, Dixon
457 Set (92040 Art and craft material requirement must be met. NO ELGIN Dixon 92040 92040 S 2.38
109 SUBSTITUTE
Markers, dry erase, chisel point, 4-color set, low odor, Sanford
1806 Set Expo 80074 NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS SANFORD EXPO 80074 4888 S 2.35
110
Markers, dry erase, chisel point, all colors, Sanford Expo 8300X,
8636 Doz NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS SANFORD EXPO 8300X 1391 S 8.68
111
Markers, dry erase, chisel point, black, 12/pkg, Avery 24408 NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
1651 Doz SUBSTITUTE — OFFICE SUPPLY AVERY 24408 §SSZ15440BK S 6.23
112
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Markers, dry erase, chisel point, black, 12/pkg, CEB 51113, Avery SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
647 | Doz 159818, Crayola 989626-051, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Dixon 92107 S55215470BK 2 346
113
Markers, dry erase, fine point, Low Odor, 4-color set, SAN86074,
801 Set NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS EXPO 86074 4891 S 2.28
114
SSS715525BK -
Black,
500 Doz Markers, dry erase, fine point, low odor, all colors, BIC-GDE11-XX | SOUTHWEST SCHOOL | Bic GDE11BK, BE, GN, | SSSZ15525BE - Blue, $ 5.01
or equal. & OFFICE SUPPLY RD SSSZ15525GN - ’
Green,
SSSZ15525RD - Red
115
Markers, dry erase, fine point, pen style barrel, for porcelain
4128 Set |boards, glass, metal, and glazed ceramics, 4-color set, Sanford STANDARD STATIONERS SANFORD EXPO 84074 1395 S 2.39
116 Expo 84074 NO SUBSTITUTE
140 Set Markers, highlighter, 4-color set, green, pink, yellow, blue, Avery ELGIN Liqui-Mark 50040 50040 $ 1.20
17752, or equal.
117
471 Set Markers, highlighter, flourescent, 4-color set, green, pink, yellow ELGIN Avery 24063 24063 $ 1.48
and orange, Avery 24-052, or equal.
118
#1298146, YELLOW
. . . . #1298546, PINK
8102 | Doz |Markers, highlighter, wedge tip, all colors, Dixon 470XX, Faber SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #1298547,BLUE | $ 1.55
6432X, School Smart 1298XX, or equal.
#1298549, ORANGE
#1298550, GREEN
119
SSSZ1525BE - Blue,
Markers, permanent, all colors, Dixon 9500X Art and craft material| SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & . SSSZ1525BK - Black,
1080 | Doz | irement must be met NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY Dixon S500X $5571525GN - Green, | >-50
120 SSSZ1525RD - Red
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM
NO.

EST.
USAGE

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

VENDOR NAME

MFGR'S NAME
MFGR'S PART#

VENDOR'S STOCK #

UNIT PRICE

121

1159

Doz

Markers, permanent, all colors, fine point, Sanford Sharpie 3000X
NO SUBSTITUTE

ELGIN

Sharpie 3000X

30001 - Black

30002 - Red

30003 - Blue
30004 - Green
30005 - Yellow
30006 - Orange
30007 - Brown
30008 -Purple

S 5.89

122

273

Doz

Markers, permanent, all colors, ultra fine point, Sanford Sharpie
3700X NO SUBSTITUTE

ELGIN

Sharpie 3700X

37001 - Black
37002 -Red
37003 -Blue

37004 - Green

37005 - Yellow
37006 - Orange
37007 - Brown
37008 - Purple

S 6.17

123

949

Doz

Marker, water, broad tip, all colors, Crayola 58-700XXX, or equal.

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

CRAYOLA LLC, # 58-7700-
051-042-038-044-040-036-
034-007
#220344, BLUE
#220338, GREEN

#220335, BLACK
#220353, BROWN
#220341, YELLOW
#220347, ORANGE

#220356, RED

#220350, VIOLET

S 2.28

124

7845

Set

Markers, water color, conical tip 8-color set, Crayola 7708 Art and

craft material requirement must be met. NO SUBSTITUTE

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

CRAYOLALLC, # 58-7708

008148

S 1.23

125

26

Set

Markers, water color, felt point, 12-color set, Sanford 20072 NO

SUBSTITUTE

OFFICE DEPOT

SANFORD LP
20072

203034

$ 4.67

126

10

Ea

Markers, water color, felt point, all colors, Sanford Mr. Sketch
200XX _NO SUBSTITUTE

ELGIN

Mr. Sketch 200XX

20001 - Black
20002 - Red
20003 - Blue

S 0.54
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Makers, wet-erase, fine tip, 8-color set, Expo vis-a-vis Sanford
157 Set #16078 NO SUBTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS SANFORD 16078 1423 S 498
127
Sk Notebook, spiral, 6"x9", steno white pages, Greg ruled, center
. . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
128 343 Doz |line, I80 sheets, Roaring Spring 12103, Tops 74688, Mead 43080, or OFFICE SUPPLY Tops 8021 $552116080 S 7.00
(A#1) equal.
Notebook, wire bound, 8%2"x11", college ruled, 100 pages, Kejriwal
7257 E . . . HOOL SPECIALTY HOOL SMART, 421 421 7
5 a 29014, Roaring Spring 11015, Cardinal 995560D, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIA SCHOOL SMART, # 085 085 2 0.73
129
Outlet, multiple strip, with Surge Protector, 6 outlets, 6' cord, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
191 Ea Fellows 99012. NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY FELLOWS 95012 55561005 2 11.06
130
Outlet, multiple strip, with Surge Protector, 6 outlets, 15' cord, Kensington Gaurdian
E ! . ELGI 2 14.
609 a SLW EP6SP15, Kensington Guardian, Fellows 99036, or equal. GIN 62668 62668 2 4.95
131
Pad, canary, 8¥%x 11", 3/8" ruled, perforated at top, 16#, 50 sheets,
1279 Doz Tops 99400, Southwest 5970CY11, School Smart 027430, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 027430 027430 S 4.37
132
Pad, easel, white, faint rule, 27"x34", 50 shts/pad
N L) ’ . ’ ’ SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
3387 Ea [Diversafile/OD2734-RL, American Paper APS2709P, Southwest 5535-1 $SS55351 S 414
. OFFICE SUPPLY
133 Imperial(Southwest) 5535-1, or equal.
Pad, easel, white, unlined, 27"x34", 50 shts/pad,
. ) ; . E L
415 Ea [Diversafile/OD2734-PL, American Paper APS2701P, Office Depot SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & Southwest 5535PN SSS5535PN S 4.14
OFFICE SUPPLY
FL2318602, or equal.
134
Pad, post-It, stick on, 1%2"x2", Assorted Colors, 12/pkg, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
238 | Pk9 |5551165AD, 3M 6534, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY SM653AST S551165AD ? 4.24
135
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Pad, post-It, stick on, 1%4"x2", yellow, 12/pkg, 3M #653YW NO
721 Pkg SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS 3M 653YW 11649 S 3.56
136
Pad, post-It, stick on, 1%"x2", yellow, 12/pkg, Highland 6539, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
2177 Pkg School Smart 084874, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Universal 35662 S5SUNV35662 2 0.84
137
Pad, post-It, stick on, 3"x3", 12/pkg., all colors, 3M6534 NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
633 Pkg SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY 3M 654YW SSSZ1166YW $ 9.34
138
2958 Pkg Pad, post-It, stick on, 3"'x3", 12/pkg, all colors, UNV 35668, 3M SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & UNV 25668 SSSUNV35668 $ 195
6549X, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY
139
Pad, post-it, stick on, 3"x3", 12/pkg, assorted colors, pastel, BEAUTONE 11039
22 Pk ; . NDARD STATIONE 1 2.2
6 g School Specialty Highland Brand 1302002 or equal STANDARD STATIONERS (ASSORTED) 3689 2 8
140
Pad, post-It, stick on, 3"x5", 12/pkg., yellow, 3M 655YW NO
376 Pkg SUBSTITUTE — STANDARD STATIONERS 3M 655YW 11655 S 11.23
141
475 Pkg Pad, post-It, stick on, 3"x5", 12/pkg., yellow, School Smart 084879 SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & Universal 35672 SSSUNV35672 s 508
or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY
142
Pad, post-it, stick on, 3"x5", 5/pkg, assorted colors, pastel, School| SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
204 Pkg Specialty Highland Brand 1088480 or equal OFFICE SUPPLY SM635AST SSSMMMESSAST 2 >-71
143
Pad, Post-It, stick on, 4"x6" lined, five assorted colors, 5/pkg, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
146 Pkg MMM660-5PK-AST, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Universal 35616 SSSUNV35616 $ 4.90
144
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Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Pad, white, 5"x8", legal ruled, perforated at top, 16#, 50 sheets, OFFICE DEPOT BRAND
11 Pk ) FFICE DEPOT 1 1.
6 9 |6/PKg Office Depot #480710, or equal. OFFICE DEPO 99438 480710 ? 49
145
Paper, graph, ¥4" squares, 8%"x11" white, 50 sheets/pad, Tops OD| SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
989 Pad 99476, Southwest 59804EA, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY SOUTHWEST 59804EA SSS59804EA 2 0.52
146
Paper, graph, ¥4" squares, 8%"x11", white, 3-hole punched, 50
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
363 |Ream [sheets/pad, 20#, Imperial 5289-Y4, Apego SP311-4, Southwest SOUTHWEST 528914 $55528914 $ 2.44
OFFICE SUPPLY
528914, or equal.
147
Paper, graph, 9x12", manila, ¥4" squared, 50#, Pacon 2852, SCHOOL SMART by APC, #
149 |Ream American Paper, Southwest 528014, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY 085477 085477 2 4.26
148
Paper, graph, 9x12", manila, 2" squared, 50#, Pacon 2853,
1 R . L SPECIALT L T 2
319 eam American Paper, School Smart 085478, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 085478 085478 S 4.26
149
Paper, grid, white, 1/4" squares, 8-1/2"x11", APC811-42S NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
219 Ream SUBSTITUTE - OFFICE SUPPLY APC811-42S 555528814 S 2.44
150
Paper, newsprint, 8%2"x11", clear stock, in cardboard cartons,
L . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
54 Ctn [precision cut, 50 Ib/carton, Imperial 5450-811, APC AUN8501, SOUTHWEST 545008 SSS545008 S 26.90
OFFICE SUPPLY
151 Southwest 545008, or equal.
Paper, newsprint, 8%"x11", ruled short way, 3/8" letterhead, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
633 |Ream Roselle 2603, Pacon 2603, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY ROSELLE 2603 SSSRNO8L1L 2 175
152
Paper, newsprint, 8%2"x11", ruled short way, 1" heading, 1/2" solid
. . . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
213 Ream [lines both sides with 1/4" alternate dotted line, Pacon 2697, PACON 2697 SSS9PAC2697 S 2.00
OFFICE SUPPLY
153 School Smart 085362, or equal.
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Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Paper, newsprint, 8%x11", top half both sides not ruled, bottom
half both sides ruled 8%" way solid lines with dash line midway SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
1 R SOUTHWEST RN0811C4P2 SSSRN0811C4P2 2.25
80 eam between, Story Book 1st and 2nd grades, Roselle OFFICE SUPPLY ?
154 RWNZB3SSW8511, Southwesst RN0811C4P2, or equal.
Paper, newsprint, 11"x8%", 2nd grade, ruled on both sides, skip a
line writing paper, ruled 3/4" solid lines with a 3/8" slotted SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
- . . . P 2635 SSS9PAC2635 1.78
107 | Ream midline, and a 3/8" skip-a-line space. American Paper Converters OFFICE SUPPLY acon 2
155 772, Pacon X2638AD-11980, Pacon X2638AD-11980, or equal.
Paper, newsprint, 11"x8%", 3rd grade, ruled on both sides, skip a
line writing paper, ruled 1/2" solid lines with a 1/4" slotted
SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
578 |[Ream [midline, and a 1/2" skip-a-line space. Package of 500 sheets. OFFICE SUPPLY Pacon 2637 SSS9PAC2637 $ 1.78
Pacon X2638AC-11980, American Paper 773, School Smart 085213,
156 or equal
Paper, newsprint, 12"x9", 1st grade, ruled long way, 3/8" light &
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
83 Ream |heavy rule, Imperial RN129B3, Pacon X2682AD-11980, Southwest SOUTHWEST RN129B3 SSSRN129B3 S 2.51
OFFICE SUPPLY
RN129B3, or equal.
157
Paper, newsprint, 12"x9", ruled, 1st grade ,Imperial RN129B3, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
80 |Ream | selle RWN1293815 M, APC 80, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY IMPERIAL RN12983 SSSRN12983 2 251
158
Paper, newsprint, 18"x12" ruled long way, solid lines alternately
1" & ¥%5" apart with dash line midway between 1" solid lines, top
SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 085217 085217 4.63
53 [Ream |, it unruled, Imperial RN1812A2P1, Pacon X2656AD-11980, or ’ >
159 equal.
Paper, newsprint, 18"x12", ruled long way, 1" spacing with a dash
77 Ream (line midway between 1" solid lines, #1 grade, in cardboard carton, SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 085234 085234 S 4.47
160 Pacon X2656AE-11980, Southwest RN1812A2, or equal.
Paper, notebook, 8¥%2"x11", lined, 3/8" spacing, 3 hole punched on
. . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
3414 | Ream |side, ink paper, APC 130P, SMX 6CWM-C, Southwest RB811F, or OFFICE SUPPLY SOUTHWEST RB811F SSSRB811F S 2.21
161 equal.
Paper, notebook, bond, white, 8%2"x11" , 3-hole punched on side,
. . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
2990 |Ream [lined, %" spacing, ink paper, Apego SP-500CR, Southwest SOUTHWEST RB811FC SSSRB811FC $ 2.30
OFFICE SUPPLY
162 RB811FC, or equal.
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ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Paper, penmanship, 8%x11", white, letterhead, 3/8" spacing, no
SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
960 Ream |holes, ruled shortway, ODOR FREE, Pacon L2403, SMX, American OFFICE SUPPLY Southwest RB811L SSSRB811L S 2.21
Paper 120, or equal.
163
ek . . DIXON TICONDE
384 Ea [Pencil, grease, black, Dixon 00077 NO SUBSTITUTE ELGIN XONTICO ROGA CO, 00077 S 0.35
164 #00077
(A#1)
Pencils, #2 1/2, with eraser, hexagon shape, Dixon 13885 NO
1110 Doz SUBSTITUTE — STANDARD STATIONERS DIXON 13885 6669 S 1.27
165
Pencils, #2 HB, standard writing hexagon, pre-sharpened, Latex
TAEDTLE LTD
11683 | Doz |Free Eraser, 12/box, 72 Bxs/cs, Rally Staedtler #9122, NO OFFICE DEPOT STAEDTLER MARS 960155 S 1.26
I 9122
SUBSTITUTE
166 e
Pencils, #2, high quality, standard writing hexagon, rounded
50153 | Doz |corners, yellow polish, gilt tip with eraser, Dixon 13882. NO STANDARD STATIONERS DIXON 13882 2022 S 1.24
167 SUBSTITUTE
Pencils, #2, standard writing hexagon, rounded corners, yellow
. e . . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
408 Doz |polish, gilt tip with eraser, UNV-55400, Officemate OIC66520, Dixon Dixon 14402 $S515642 S 0.51
12872, or equal OFFICE SUPPLY
168 ! ’
Pencils, beginners, large diameter, smooth lead, Dixon 13080 NO
1907 Doz SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS DIXON 13080 299 S 2.34
169
Pencils, beginners, Ticonderoga laddie with eraser, yellow color, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
1429 1 Doz 1 0n 13304 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY DIXON 13304 55515735 2 2.23
170
Pencils, checking, red & blue, with eraser, Dixon 55T/56T, Sanford #084452, RED
L SPECIALT .
1416 Doz 2404X, School Smart 08445XX, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #084450, BLUE 2 0.64
171
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Term: January 1, 2014 - December 31, 2014

Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Pencils, mechanical, disposable, Papermate 30301 NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
4181 Ea SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY PAPERMATE 30301 $S516050 S 0.20
172
Pencils, medium diameter, without eraser, 6 doz/box, Dixon SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
3698 | BOX | onderoga 13040 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY DIXON 13040 333215715 > 9.25
173
Pens, ball point, fine point, plastic barrels, carbide or stainless
. . . . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & SSS1482FBE - Bl
679 Doz |steel ball with cap and clip, all colors, Bic round Stic, Bic GSF11XX BIC GSF11XX ue, S 0.84
OFFICE SUPPLY SSS1482FBK - Black
NO SUBSTITUTE
174
Pens, ball point, fine point, plastic barrels, carbide or stainless SS1481FBE - Blue,
. . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL
4040 Doz |steel ball with cap and clip, all colors, Gillette/Papermate 33X11 OFFICE SUPP&O & PAPERMATE 33X11 SS1481FBK - Black, S 0.86
175 NO SUBSTITUTE SS1481FRD - Red
Pens, ball point, medium point, plastic barrels, carbide or SSS1481MBE - Blue,
. . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL
4598 Doz |stainless steel ball with cap and clip, all colors, Papermate 33X-11 OFFICE SUPPLY & PAPERMATE 33X11 MBK - Black, MGN - S 0.86
NO SUBSTITUTE Green, MRD - Red
176
Pens, ball point, medium point, plastic barrels, carbide or
. . . . . SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & SSS1482MBE - Blue,
1300 Doz |stainless steel ball with cap and clip, all colors, Bic Round Stic, OFFICE SUPPLY BIC GSM11XX MBK - Black. MRD F:ed S 0.84
177 BIC GSM11XX NO SUBSTITUTE ’
Pens, roller ball, fine point with premium ink, durable metal, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & SSSZ14880FBE - Blue,
. SAN 601 .
872 | Boz | ,ngsten carbide ball, all colors, SAN 6010X NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY 0x FBK - Black, FRD - Red | ° 624
178
#077235, BLACK
#077236, RED
#077237, BLUE
10963 | Doz Pens, felt point, all colors, Sanford 3801X, School Smart 0772XX, or SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #077238, GREEN $ 1.79
equal. #077239, YELLOW
#077240, PURPLE
#077241, ORANGE
#077242, BROWN
179
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Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00

7 day lead time

ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
SSSZ14905BE - Blue
Pens, Gel Ink, Medium, Retractable, All Colors, Papermate SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & ’
265 Doz 1746MXX, NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY PAPERMATE 1746MXX S$SSZ14905BK - Black, S 7.15
SSSZ14905RD - Red
180
Pens, projection marker, fine tip, 4-color set, Sanford 16074 NO
566 Set SUBSTITUTE - STANDARD STATIONERS SANFORD 16074 1422 S 2.42
181
16001 - Black
. . . . 16002 - Red
265 Doz Pens, projection marker, fine tip, all colors, Sanford 1600X _NO ELGIN Sanford 1600X 16003 - Ble $ 263
SUBSTITUTE
- 16004 - Green
182 16008 - Purple
Phone Message Pad, wirebound, four forms per page, canary
. K SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
85 Ea [duplicates, date register on front cover, Avery 50-076 or OFFICE SUPPLY Rediform 50076 SSS9RED50076 S 3.03
183 REDIFORM 50076 NO SUBSTITUTE
Pins, push, clear 1/2" head, 3/8" steel point, 100 pins/box,
691 Box [Officemate 92707, Southwest 1658CR, School Smart 003354, or STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS PPCLR 1296 S 0.37
184 equal.
Pins, T, steel nickel plated, # 16, 1", 100/box, Prym 21610, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
577 Box Southwest 166516, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY SOUTHWEST 166516 S$S5166516 S 1.98
185
Pins, T, steel nickel plated, #20, 1-1/4", 100/box, Prym 21620, SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
55 Box School Smart 021795, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Southwest 166520 555166520 2 0.53
186
Pin, T, steel nickel plated, # 24, 1-%", 100/box , Classroom Select
HOOL SPECIALTY HOOL SMART, #0217 217 .
357 Box 83650, Avantus 87T, School Smart 021795, or equal. SCHOOL SPEC SCHOOLS  #021795 021795 > 0.53
187
Protractor, semi-circular, cut out center, 6" diameter, clear
165 Doz |plastic, beveled outer edges, accurate graduations, Leonard STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS 16231W 1291 S 1.07
188 77106, Southwest 1668-6, School Smart 084410, or equal.
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Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00
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ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME ,
NO. | UsAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Punch, 1 hole, 1/4", plier (ticket punch), SMX OHP-1P, Southwest | SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
319 | Ba 16760, Office Depot 13160, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY SOUTHWEST 16760 55516760 2 0.46
189
32 Ea Punch, 3 hole, heavy duty, black, Southwest School & Office Supply | SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & SOUTHWEST S5516723 p— S e
SSS16723 or equal OFFICE SUPPLY
190
Receipt book, carbonless, consecutively numbered, 3-part, top-
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
168 Ea [bound, 7-5/8" X 11", 2-3/4" x 7-5/8", 100 receipts ea., TC1182 $SS11515 S 3.43
. OFFICE SUPPLY
191 Cardinal/Adams TC1182, or equal.
244 | Box eR(']:gIS’ loose-leaf, 1" diameter, 100/Box, Office Depot 937580, or STANDARD STATIONERS GENERAL BR3 1233 $ 2.86
192
Rulers, brass edge, flexible wood, 18", Aakron110118, Falcon 331-
1 N ! ' ’ ’ HOOL SPECIALTY HOOL SMART, # 081892 1892 .
0 Ea 18, Office Depot ODW-002, or equal. SCHOOL SPEC SCHOOL S , #08189 08189 S 0.30
193
Rulers, plastic to fit ring binder, 1/16" division and metric
1402 Doz |divisions,Ningbo Taida 033843, Southwest 1760CR, School Smart STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS 16220 1279 S 1.18
194 081888, , or equal.
Rulers, wood, 1/16" divisions one side, metric other side, single
1199 Doz |bevel edge, metal strip, Falcon 431-12, Aakron 100210, School STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS KS611 1281 S 1.07
195 Smart 015351, or equal.
1221 Ea |Rulers, wood, 1/8" divisions, plain edge, Aakron 100208, or equal. SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 081898 081898 S 0.10
196
Scissors, 5", children's, for left or right hand, blunt tips, Fiskar FISKARS INC
5661 | Ea 19416 0rB&S 3009 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE DEPOT 9416 >39262 > 084
197
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Office and Classroom Supply Bid #1314-104N

Minimum Order for Free Freight: $50.00
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ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME ,
NO. | UsAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Scissors, 5", children's, sfor left or right hand, pointed tips, B&S FISKARS INC
12336 | & 13510 or Fiskar 9430 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE DEPOT 9430 >02369 > 0-85
198
Scissors, 7", sharp point, heavy duty for all cutting purposes,
3553 Ea Fiskars 9458-7097 NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS FISKARS 9458-7097 7062 $ 2.00
199
698 | Ea |SCiSSOrs, 8", pointed, Acme 10572, Fiskars 3508-7297, School STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS 2000 13693 $ 0.41
Smart 085008, or equal.
200
Sentence Strips, 3"x24", 100#, manilla, ruled, 100/pkg., Southwest SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
2513 Pkg Imperial 5850MA, Pacon 5157, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Southwest S850MA 5555850MA 2 118
201
417 Ea ng\;rener, Pencil, All Metal, Boston/Hunt SSS16454, EPI 1001, or STANDARD STATIONERS ACCU POINT PS8M 11777 S 5.56
202
Sharpener, pencil, heavy duty, Boston Ranger #55 NO
315 Ea SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS BOSTON RANGER 55 541 S 14.98
203
Sheet Protectors, clear vinyl, 5 ga. thickness, 8%"x11", 3-hole SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
4 B .
540 9% |bunched, top load, 100/box, Avery 74100 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY AVERY 74100 5551787100CR 2 9.24
204
Sheet Protectors, clear vinyl, 5 ga. thickness, 8%"x11", 3-hole SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
1112 | BoX | inched, top load, 100/box, CLI62033 NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY CL162033 55517867AM > 799
205
: #084906, BLACK
1239 | Ea |StAMP Pad,size 1, felt, black, red, and blue, Leonard 9241X, SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART #084907, BLUE $ 0.30
Charles Leonard 924XX, School Smart 08490X, or equal.
206 #084909, RED
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ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME ,
NO. | UsAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Staple Remover, chrome steel body with finger grip design,
74 E ) TANDARD STATIONER TANDARDS 32002 1287 1
9 a Spartan AC406, Office Depot 2671, or equal. S S ONERS S 53200 8 ? 0.19
207
Staple Remover, Lever Type, Stanley Bostitch 40000, Swingline
180 Ea 38121, OD 344734, or equal. STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS G2K 12579 S 0.37
208
Stapler, full load, light weight, plastic, black, Bostitch B660,
2 ! TANDARD STATIONER WINGLINE 4 11 2.
09 | B2 |S\w140501,0ffice Depot 75310D, or equal. > STATIONERS SWINGLINE 405 > 2 39
209
171 | Ea irt_aezlue;i full load, metal, black, Bostitch B440, School Smart 038178, o) speciacty  |scHooL smarr, # 038178 038178 $ 1.14
210
Stapler, full load metal, black, staples permanently, Acco/Swingline
2224 Ea #747 NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS SWINGLINE 747 10441 S 8.14
211
Stapler, full load metal, black, staples permanently, Bates/GBC
10 Ea 550C NO SUBSTITUTE STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS 550C 8290 S 2.57
212
Staples, standard point, 1/4" height, full load, 5000/box, Swingline
7232 B ) TANDARD STATIONER TANDARDS STB 7 A
3 ox SF-1, Southwest 18305, Office Depot 6001, or equal. S S ONERS S S STBC 065 2 0.43
213
SSS1848BE - Blue,
. W e $551848GD - Gold,
230 Box Stars, peel & stick, all colors, 1/2", foil, Eureka 824XXX NO_ SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & Eureka 824X0X SSS1848GN - Green, $ 0.89
SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY
- SSS1848RD - Red,
214 SSS1848SR - Silver
Tacks, thumb, # 3, 1/17" long, 100/box, Imperial 1910-3, School
TANDARD STATIONER TANDARDS TT 131 .
274 | BOX g At 050967, SMX TT03, or equal, STANDARD STATIONERS STANDARDS TT3 310 > 0-15
215
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ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Tape, adding machine, white, 2%" wide standard roll, w/red "End
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
689 Roll |of Roll" stripe, 150', CEB20212, P.M. Co. 8024, School Smart PM 8024 $SS5650214 S 0.30
053859, or equal OFFICE SUPPLY
216 ! ’
_ THWEST SCHOOL
534 Roll |Tape, book repair, 1%", 15 yd, 3M845-1-1/2 NO SUBSTITUTE SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & 3M845-1-1/2 S5518601.5 S 3.03
OFFICE SUPPLY
217
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
933 Roll |Tape, book repair, 2", 15 yd, 3M 845-2 NO SUBSTITUTE 3M 845-2 $5518602 S 4.04
OFFICE SUPPLY
218
Tape, cellulose, %."x2592", without dispenser, 3M 5910 3/4"x2592 SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
5 Roll NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY 3M 5910 3/4 S$S5186334 S 2.60
219
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL
2185 Ea [Tape, correction, Tombow 68620 NO SUBSTITUTE & TOMBOW 68620 SSS1962WE S 1.37
OFFICE SUPPLY
220
ok Tape, invisible, individually boxed, %"x1296", CEB 34x36, Universal| SOUTHWEST SCHOOL & .
221 | 15262 | Roll 1g5436, 3m 6200-24°x1296, or equal. OFFICE SUPPLY Universal 83436 535187834 3 0.56
(A#1)
. SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
2939 Ea [Tape, masking, blue, %"x 60, 3M 2090-%" NO SUBSTITUTE 3M 2090-3/4 $551888075 S 2.34
OFFICE SUPPLY
222
Tape, masking, natural color, ¥2"x 60 yds, 3M 2600-Y2 NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
153 Roll SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY 3M 2600-1/2 S$SS1870050 S 0.66
223
Tape, masking, natural color, %"x 60 yds, 3M 2600-%" NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
2461 Roll SUBSTITUTE OFFICE SUPPLY 3M 2600-3/4 $S51870075 S 0.77
224
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ITEM| EST. MFGR'S NAME .
NO. | USAGE UNIT DESCRIPTION VENDOR NAME MEGR'S PART# VENDOR'S STOCK #| UNIT PRICE
Tape, masking, natural color, 1"x 60 yds, 3M 2600-1 NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
1052 Roll SUBSTITUTE —— OFFICE SUPPLY 3M 2600-1 $551870100 S 1.06
225
Tape, masking, natural color, 1%2"x 60 yds, 3M 2600-1%2 NO SOUTHWEST SCHOOL &
454 Roll SUBSTITUTE - OFFICE SUPPLY 3M 2600-1 1/2 S$SS1870150 S 1.62
226
Tape, packing, 2"x 60 yds, clear, 3M/Tartan 36902CRL NO
2370 Ea SUBSTITUTE - STANDARD STATIONERS 3M 3690 12286 S 0.81
227
ok Tape, transparent, self seal, %" x 1296", 12 roll/ctn., Highland 3M CO
228 2128 Ctn 5910, 3M 5910, or equal. OFFICE DEPOT 5910-3/4X1296" 910406 S 7.44
(A#1)
670 Roll [Tape, transparent, with dispenser, %" x 300", 3M 105, or equal. STANDARD STATIONERS TAPE MATE 3300 11451 $ 0.35
229
Transparencies, 8%" x 11, plain paper copiers, write on, 100/bx,
10 Box #No Stripe*, Trans-NS, Southwest 6960 CR, or equal. STANDARD STATIONERS CLEAR COPY PS-11 11478 S 3.66
230
ke 50 Box Transparencies, plain paper copiers, with removable strip, black NO BID
231 on clear, 100/box, ICI PPC1080 or 3M PP2200 NO SUBSTITUTE
(A#1)
5 Box Transparencies, plain paper copiers, without white feed stripe, NO BID
100/box, ICI PPC1000 or 3M 901 NO SUBSTITUTE
232
Transparencies, with paper back, for high speed copiers, 100/box,
NO BID
20| BOX |\ ppC1020 NO SUBSTITUTE
233
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FALCON SAFETY
Wipes, Monitor, Anti-Static, Alcohol Free, 80 wipes, FALCON
76 Ea SAFETY DSCT, NO SUBSTITUTE OFFICE DEPOT PRODUCTS INC 527538 S 4.01
DSCT
234
Yardstick, meterstick, combination, plasticote finish on
73 Ea [hardwood, front scaled in millimeters, back scaled in 1/8" SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCHOOL SMART, # 081901 081901 S 0.78
235 increments, Falcon 97, Aakron 100490, or equal.

Yardstick, wood, metal tip, eyelet hole, 1-1/8"x 5/32", Acme United

HOOL SPECIALTY HOOL SMART, # 081 1 .
553 Ea 10425, Aakron 700420, School Smart 081900, or equal. SCHOOL SPEC SCHOOLS , #081900 081900 ? 0.68
236
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