
 

 

      

 

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM 

AWARDED VENDOR LIST 

(Market Basket) 

                     
BID TITLE: Science Supplies SPONSORING DISTRICT: Del Mar Union S.D. DELIVERY A.R.O: 15 Calendar Days 

 
BID NUMBER: 2026-SCI DISTRICT CONTACT: Marley Nelms MIN QTY FOR FREE FREIGHT: 

$100.00 
   
CONTRACT PERIOD: Jan. 1, 2026 – Dec. 31, 2026 EMAIL: mnelms@dmusd.org 
 

VENDOR 
NAME 

AWARDED 
CATEGORY 

ADDRESS CONACT NAME CONTACT 
INFORMATION 

M/W/DVBE 

School Specialty, 
LLC 

N/A School Specialty, 
LLC 
W6316 Design 
Drive, Greenville, WI 
54942 

Sita Beasley, Territory Sales 
Manager, Phone: 310-200-5778 
 
Sita.beasley@schoolspecialty.com 

Send Orders & 
Correspondence to: 
 
Customer Care:  
(888) 388-3224 
 
Email Orders: 
orders@schoolspecialty.com 
 

 

*MUST REFERENCE “School Specialty Bid Number Q-629415” on your orders. 
 
 
NCEPC BOARD APPROVAL DATE: December 3, 2025 (President’s Approval)                 AMENDMENT NO: 
RATIFICATION & APPROVAL OF PRESIDENT’S AWARD:   February 11, 2026                                          APPROVED AMENDMENT DATE: 



Contract Term: Bid Sponsor and District: Marley Nelms, Del Mar USD

January 1, 2026 to December 31, 2026 Email:

Phone:

LINE #
UNIT OF 
ISSUE ITEM SPECIFICATIONS/DESCRIPTION Manufacturer/Make Model #/Part #

FULL SERVICE  
UNIT PRICE WARRANTY

PERIOD

1 Ea
DUAL HAND LENS - Magnifiers, Dual Hand; 3x and 5x;0.75 and 1.5 in. diameter
lens; Grades K+

Frey Scientific by American Scientific, 3x and 
6x magnification

SSL # 568400 $0.75 Mfg Warranty

2 Ea
PLASTIC MAGNIFIER 3X/6X - Length: 4.5
in. (11cm); Magnification: 3X, 6X; Diameter: 50mm (3X lens); 20mm (6X lens)

Frey Scientific,  sold pk/30, priced per each, 
must order in multiples of 30

SSL # 130-3246 $0.77 Mfg Warranty

3 Ea

STACKABLE BATTERY HOLDERS -
Holder, Battery; EISCO; Stackable; Link together in parallel or series; Extends capacity or voltage; 
Supplied singl

United Scientific, single cell D Mfg # BTHD02, SSL # 1366075 $0.76 Mfg Warranty

4 Pk

RAINBOW SAFETY GOGGLES 6/PK -
Sized just right for students and adjustable for adults; Set of six pairs of goggles in three bright, 
translucent colors (red, blue and green)

Learning Resources Mfg # LER2449, SSL # 082335 $19.55 Mfg Warranty

5 Ea SOIL POTTING 5 LB.
Geoscience, 1lb top soil, sold and priced per 
1lb

Mfg # 583938, SSL # 583938 $2.20 Mfg Warranty

6 Ea

STEREO SCOPE 2X 4X CRDLS -
Microscopes, Stereo; Inclined heads rotate to 360°; Pole-mounted head to view large objects; 
Objectives: 2X, 4X; Dual LED; Rack/pinion focusing; Incl. eye cups, stage clips, frosted, b/w stage 
plates, cover

Frey Scientific by National Optical and 
Scientific Instrument Inc

SSL # 1396244 $345.60 Mfg Warranty

7 Ea
STAR FINDER - Luminous Star Finder, Complete instructions are enclosed with the finder in 
addition to tables that list planet location

No bid No bid No bid No bid

8 Ea
SHEEP BRAIN W/O HYPOPHYSIS -
Specimen, Preserved

Frey Scientific by Ranaco Corp SSL # 596877 $30.35 Mfg Warranty

9 Ea

METRIC/IMPERIAL RULER - Ruler,
Metric/Imperial; SI Metric; One edge has cm and mm measurements, the other has imperial markings Staedtler-Mars Ltd Mfg # 98718-31BK, SSL # 2132092 $6.88 Mfg Warranty

10 Pk

OWL PELLETS 15/PKOWL PELLETS -
Pellet, Barn Owl; Pellets Inc; Large; From natural nesting and roosting sites; Average size: 2.5 to 3.5 
in. long; Heat sterilized; Individually wrapped in foil to ensure quality; 15/pk.

Carolina Biological Supply Co, 1.5" - 3" Mfg # 227882, SSL # 373995 $89.44 Mfg Warranty

11 Ea
ULTRAFLEX RULER 12IN/30CM - Ruler,
SAFE-T; Twist and bend; Transparent plastic; 12 in. / 30 cm; Colors vary; Grades 1-8

Acme United Corp, sold pk/12, priced per 
each, must order in multiples of 12, see 
through acrylic

Mfg # 10562-003, SSL # 1566849 $1.96 Mfg Warranty

12 Pk

ALLIGATOR TEST LEADS 10/PK - Set, Test
Lead; MCM Electronics; w/Alligator clips; Ten 61cm leads; Two each yellow, green, black and red; 
10/Pk.

United Scientific, 12" lead, sold and priced pk/6 Mfg # WAG012-PK6, SSL # 2094324 $10.87 Mfg Warranty

13

Ea

6 INCH SHATTERPROOF RULER - Ruler,
Pocket; SI Metric; Clear; Shatterproof; Calibrated in inches on one edge and mm on the other; 
Length: 6 in.; 1 Ea.

Acme United Corp  Mfg # 10561,  SSL # 1369958 $0.88 Mfg Warranty

14 Ea

JUNIOR RULER - Ruler, Junior; SI Metric; With fine calibrations for more exacting work; 
Calibrated in 0.5cm with numbering at each centimeter on one edge; Calibrated in mm on the other 
edge

Eisco LLC, stainless steel Mfg # PH0072A, SSL # 2022435 $10.12 Mfg Warranty

15 Ea
RING MAGNET - Magnet, Ring; Unpainted; Ceramic; O.D.: 1.14 in. (2.9cm); I.D.: 0.39 in.
(1cm); Thickness: 0.25 in. (0.64cm)

Eisco LLC, sold pk/8, priced per each, must 
order in multiples of 8

Mfg # PH0796N8MPK8, SSL # 
2012020

$1.54 Mfg Warranty

16 Pk

EARTHWORM 10+IN PLAIN 10PK -
Specimen, Preserved; Earthworm; Lumbricus terrestris; Annelida-Segmented Worms, Oligochaeta; 
Garden variety night crawlers; complete intact specimens w/clitellum; Bio- Fresh. 10 in., large, plain

Frey Scientific by Ranaco Corp SSL # 597246 $14.01 Mfg Warranty

17 Ea
SHARK 27IN+ PLAIN - Specimen, Preserved; Dogfish shark; 27 in.+ ; No injection Frey Scientific by Ranaco Corp, sold pk/10, 

priced per each, must order in multiples of 10, 
22-27"

SSL # 596502 $19.34 Mfg Warranty

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
MARKET BASKET BID FORM

Market Basket Bid – The Consortium will choose a grouping of common items related to the commodity being bid. These items must be bid as described. For a vendor to be considered, they must bid at least ninety (90%) percent of items 
listed (45 of the 50 items).

Bid No. 2026-SCI, Bid Title: Science Supplies

DELIVERY A.R.O.:15 Calendar Days
MIN. QTY. FOR FREE FREIGHT: $100.00 mnelms@dmusd.org

(858) 523-6191



18 Ea
GAS LIGHTER EA - Lighter, Gas; Hooded lighter is safe and economical; Hood traps gas,
and protects lighting file

Frey Scientific by United Scientific Corp SSL # 561124 $2.25 Mfg Warranty

19 Ea
BLUE APRON SMALL - Apron; PVC;
Reusable, blue apron with cotton ties at the waist and neck; Size: Small (27 x 36 in.)

GSC Intl Inc, transparent Mfg # APVL27x36-10,  SSL # 1477658 $5.17 Mfg Warranty

20 Ea

HOT-HAND PROTECTOR - Gloves;
Temperature resistant; Hot-Hand protector; Rubber; High-visibility red; Withstands temperatures up 
to 260°C or cold objects down to -57°C Bel-Art Products Inc Mfg # F38000-0000, SSL # 568217 $34.85

Mfg Warranty

21 Pk
PETRI DISH, 90MM X 15MM, PK/10 - Petri
dish; Disposablel; Sterilized dish offers optical clarity, strength; 90mm x 15mm; Pk./10 United Scientific Supplies Inc, sold pk/500, priced pk/10, must order in  multiples of 500Mfg # K1004-J-PK/500, SSL # 563410 $2.23 Mfg Warranty

22 Ea

SCISSORS STRGHT OPERATNG 5.5IN -
Scissors, Surgical; Medco; Straight operating; Closed-shank; Stainless steel; One sharp/one blunt tip; 
5.5 in. Dr Instruments, 4 1/2" dissecting scissors Mfg # 9S/25CS, SSL # 583122 $1.55

Mfg Warranty

23 Ea
PVC APRON 27 X 36 IN - Apron, PVC;
Transparent; Reusable, transparent PVC apron; Cotton ties at the waist; Size: 27 x 36 in. GSC Intl Inc,Vinyl Mfg # APV27X36-10, SSL # 1477658 $5.17 Mfg Warranty

24 Ea
WEIGHT HANGER SS - Hanger, Weight; Troemner; Calibrated to 50g; Accessory for
stainless steel slotted weight set Eisco LLC Mfg # PHZNW050H, SSL # 2023127 $8.90 Mfg Warranty

25 Pk

FB GLV VINYL EXAM PF MD 100/PK -
Gloves, Exam; Vinyl; Powder-Free; Nonsterile; Medical-grade; Smooth finish; Ambidextrous; 
Exceed FDA minimum requirements; Size: Medium Clean Space Project LLC, sold cs/10 box/100, priced per bx/100, must order in multiples of 10 box/100Mfg # CSPBK5MD, SSL # 2127540 $8.67

Mfg Warranty

26 Ea

MAGNIFYING GLASS - Magnifier, Reading Glass; EISCO USA; Metal frame with bakelite handle; 
Chrome plated; Packed in cardboard box; Dia., 2.0 in. (50mm); Focal length, 0.5 in. (12cm); 
Magnification, 3x Eisco LLC,  2 1/2", 2 1/2 x magnification Mfg # PH0510F, SSL # 2022827 $9.38

Mfg Warranty

27 Ea

DC MOTOR 0.5V - Motors and Generators; DC Motor; Simple, compact; American Educational 
Products; Use with One-Hand Generator; Runs on 4.5V or 6.0V DC current; Lead wires inc.; 
Provides the ideal power source for classroom electrical and construction United Scientific Supplies Inc, 1.5 V Mfg # DMOT01, SSL # 2093119 $15.32

Mfg Warranty

28 Ea
6 INCH CLEAR RULER - Ruler; Pocket; SI
Metric; Clear; Calibrated in inches on one edge and mm on the other; Length: 6 in. Acme United Corp Mfg # 10561,  SSL # 1369958 $0.88 Mfg Warranty

29 Ea

CLEARVIEW PROTRACTOR 6 - Protractor,
Plastic; SI Metric; Clearview; Transparent; 180
° shatterproof w/slotted separation; Built in metric ruler; Upper scale reads left-opening angles, lower 
reads right-opening School Smart, sold pk/12, priced per each, must order in multiples of 12SSL # 084410 $0.18

Mfg Warranty

30 Ea

FRICTION CUBE - Cube, Friction; Show how frictional characteristics affect force required to move 
a stationary body; Wood made; Four surfaces: Sandpaper, Vinyl, Paper, Wood; Single Hook for 
towing against inclined panes/surfaces; Size: 2 in. Eisco LLC Mfg # PH1120151, SSL # 2010832 $19.10

Mfg Warranty

31 Ea

BURNER TUBING CLOTH COVERED 4' -
Tubing, Burner; Cloth-covered, flexible rubber tubing; Heavy rubber connection on each end firmly 
attaches to fitting; 4 ft. (121.9cm) Eisco LLC, 3 foot, neoprene Mfg # CH0100B, SSL # 2011786 $24.73

Mfg Warranty

32 Pk

NUTRIENT AGAR PLATE 10/PKNUTR -
Media, Cell Culture; Nutrient Agar; Supplied in disposable plastic Petri dishes 100mm O.D. x 
15mmH; Ready to use; Sterile Frey Scientific by Culture Media and Supplies, sold pk/100, priced pk/10, must order in multiples of 100SSL # 526786 $11.20

Mfg Warranty

33 Pk
LIMESTONE COMPACT 10/PKLIMEST -
Specimen, Rock;  Sedimentary; Limestone, compact, pink to gray; Pack of 10 Geoscience Mfg # 586591_CUSTOM, SSL # 586591 $5.08 Mfg Warranty

34 Ea
SHEEP BRAIN FULLY EXTRACTED -
Specimen, Preserved Frey Scientific by Ranaco Corp SSL # 1496526 $30.88 Mfg Warranty

35 Pk
GLASS STREAK PLATES PK10 - Plates,
Streak; Glass; For mineral identification United Scientific Supplies Inc Mfg # GLP1X2-P. SSL # 1399114 $11.97 Mfg Warranty

36 Pk

BAR MAGNETS W KEEPERS 2/PK -
Magnet, Bar; Eisco; Stamped polarity; Boxed; For classroom experiments; Painted red and blue; 3.9 
x 0.79 x 0.23 in. (10 x 2 x 0.6cm); 2/Pk. Eisco LLC, w/o keepers Mfg # PH0785, SSL # 2022918 $11.68

Mfg Warranty

37 Ea
CAT 18IN+XXX INJ FORM FREE -
Specimen, Preserved; Cat; Fisher-Free; 18+ in.; Triple Injection No bid No bid No bid No bid

38 Ea
PORTABLE 500GX0.1G - Balance, Portable; LCD Screen; Linearity: +/-0.1g; Weighing modes: 
Grams, Newtons; Full tare; Capacity: 500g; Readability: 0.1g; Pan: Round, 120mm dia. Ohaus Corp Mfg # 80251912, SSL # 1400198 $78.46 Mfg Warranty

39 Ea WATER CYCLE MODEL SET EACH Newpath Learning LLC Mfg # 24-7817, SSL # 2087422 $24.24 Mfg Warranty

40 Ea HYD PEROXIDE 30% - 35% 500ML Delta Education SSL # 080-0580 $2.70 Mfg Warranty

41 Ea

BASIC 3 STER SCOPE 2X 4X - Microscopes, Stereo; Binocular; Inclined heads rotate to 360
°; Pole-mounted head to view large objects; Dual illumination; Rack/pinion focusing; W/Halogen 
Lamp type; 20X, 40X
magnification Frey Scientific by National Optical and Scientific Instrument IncSSL # 2137076 $250.20

Mfg Warranty



42 Ea

SCOUT PRO 120GX.001G - Balances,
Electronic Toploading; Ohaus Scout Pro; Capacity: 120g; Readability: 0.001g; Repeatability: 0.003g; 
Linearity: ±0.003g; Pan Size 9.1cm; Modes include g, N, oz., Parts Count; LCD Display; 110V, 4 AA 
Battery Operated Ohaus Corp Mfg # 30253005, SSL # 1540230 $829.23 Mfg Warranty

43 Ea
SNP CIRC. ELEM ED KIT - Snap Circuits Educational Series, Model SC-100R, over 100 
experiments Elenco Electronics Inc Mfg # SC100R, SSL # 050-3985 $47.12 Mfg Warranty

44 Ea

LADYBUG LAND - Ladybug Land; Insect Lore; W/Certificate; Habitat, magnifier dome cap, 
instructions, mail-in certificate for 15-20 larvae and special food; 10L x 7.5W x 8 in. H; Redemption 
fee applied when certificate mailed in; postage/handling fee reqd. Insect Lore Products Inc Mfg # 2122-PPV, SSL # 1015401 $34.99 Mfg Warranty

45 Ea

FSE PORTABLE 150GX.01G - Balance,
Portable; LCD Screen; Linearity: +/-0.1g; Weighing modes: grams, Newtons; Full tare; Capacity: 
150g; Readability: 0.01g; Pan: Round, 120mm dia. Frey Scientific by Ohaus Corp SSL # 531694 $340.21 Mfg Warranty

46 Ea

FSE PORTABLE 300GX 0.1G - alance,
Portable; LCD Screen; Linearity: +/-0.1g; Weighing modes: grams, Newtons; Full tare; Capacity: 
300g; Readability: 0.1g; Pan: Round, 120mm dia. - Frey Scientific by Ohaus Corp SSL # 531696 $186.19 Mfg Warranty

47 Ea
Scalpel Handle, Economy, No. 4, Stainless Steel, Uses Blades No. 20-25 - Stainless-steel handles 
with satin finish. Scalpel Handle No. 4 accepts blades No. 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, and 25. Dr Instruments, Dissection  Kit Mfg # 61PC, SSL # 576867 $7.19 Mfg Warranty

48 Pk Slide, Microscope; Frosted at one end; 3 x 1 in. (76 x 25.4mm); 144/Pk.; 10Pk./Cs. Eisco LLC, sold pk/72, priced pk/144, must order in multiples of 72Mfg # BI0084B, SSL # 2021687 $27.04 Mfg Warranty
49 Cs Applicator; Cotton tip; Wood shaft; Sterile; 6 in.; 1 per envelope; 1000/cs. School Health Corp M fg # 90165, SSL # 1429263 $20.19 Mfg Warranty

50 Ea
Wiper, General-Purpose; Kimwipes; For delicate tasks; Nonabrasive, soft, low lint cellulose fibers; 
Single wiper dispenser; White; 1-ply; 4.4 x 8.4 in. (11.2 x 21.3cm) KimTech Science Mfg # KCC34155,  SSL # 1564853 $3.29 Mfg Warranty



Proposer may add additional categories, if necessary

1) General Supplies: 35/14 % off of catalog price
Please reference Catalog Discount Letter.

2) Chemicals: 35/14 % off of catalog price
Please reference Catalog Discount Letter.

3) Speciments: 35/14 % off of catalog price
Please reference Catalog Discount Letter.

4) Equipment & Lab Furniture: 35/14 % off of catalog price
Please reference Catalog Discount Letter.

5) Exclusions:

All catalogs may contain a 
limited number of items that 
are listed as “Net Price” and 
not eligible for any discounts. 
These items are indicated by 
an “N” or “LN” prefix in the 
item number.  Also excluded 
is any catalog or item(s) that 
bears notation “no other 
discounts apply” or 
customized products.

BID# 2026-SCI - Science Supplies
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