NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE: K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES

BID NUMBER: 2025-14

CONTRACT PERIOD: Jan. 1, 2026 - Dec. 31, 2026
LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Marcos Unified School District
DISTRICT CONTACT: Vicki Capozza, Buyer (760) 290-2374

MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT: $50.00
DELIVERY: 30 Calendar Days ARO

VENDOR NAME

ADDRESS

PHONE/FAX NUMBER
WEBSITE

CONTACT NAME

Pyramid School Products -
include "#2025-14" on
all orders

6510 N 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610

800-792-2644 x240- Toll Fr
800-792-2644 x248- Cust §

Larry Miller, President
biddept@pyramidsp.com
Dispatch PO to: orders@payramidsp.com

School Specialty -
include bid #Q-397328
on all orders

W6316 Design Drive
Greenville, WI 54942

888-388-3224 - Toll Free
310-200-5778 - Sales

Jamie Young, Sr. Bid Contract Coord.
bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com

Sita Beasley, Sales sita.beasley@schoolspecialty.com
Ordering Email: orders@schoolspecialty.com

Southwest School & Office
Supply

1500 S Dupont
Ontario CA 91761

800-227-7159 - Toll Free
909-980-7777 - Direct

Ronald Perez, Bid Analyst
ronald.perez@southwestschool.com
Ordering Email: biddesk@southwestschoo.com

Complete Office Supply

12724 Moore St.
Cerritos, CA 90703

619-654-7454

Sarah Harper
SHarper@complete-office.com

Illusion Commerce

1470 Valley Vista Dr, Ste 111
Diamond Bar, CA 91765

Jingrui Xin
ray.x@illusioncommerce.com

* When placing orders, please reference the numbers under the vendor's name on all purchase orders.




BID TITLE: K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES
BID NUMBER: 2025-14
CONTRACT PERIOD: 01/01/26 - 12/31/26

NCEPC K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES BID - PART 1
MINIMUM FOR FREE SHIPPING $50.00

DISTRICT CONTACT: Vicki Capozza
EMAIL: vicki.capozza@smusd.org
PHONE: (760) 290-2374

LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

DELIVERY: 30 CALENDAR DAYS ARO

CATEGORY: ADHESIVES

ITEM NO.

EST USAGE

UNIT OF
ISSUE

ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION

Vendor

Manufacturer & Mfr. Model
Number

Vendor Stock Number

Price

17,556

Each

Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, plastic bottle, 4 oz, 12/carton, Sanford Elmer's E304,
School Smart 2124032, Staples ST39417, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM
D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

Southwest School Supply, Inc.

Elmer's #£308

405827

1.07

68

Gal

Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, 1 gallon size, 2/carton, Sanford Elmers #E340,
School Smart 2124031, Staples ST39921, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM
D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

Southwest School Supply, Inc.

Staples #5739921

ST39921

483

Each

Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, plastic bottle, POINTED TIP, 8 oz, 12/carton, Sanford
Elmers #E308 School Smart 2124033, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D
4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

no bid

CATEGORY: CRAYONS, MARKERS, PENCILS

ITEM NO.

EST USAGE

UNIT OF
ISSUE

ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION

Vendor

Manufacturer & Mfr. Model
Number

Vendor Stock Number

Price

10,317

Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Primary, 8 assorted colors/box, Crayola 52-0080, Dixon
Prang 51800, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT
REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

School Specialty, LLC

Crayola #52-0080

413440

0.58

400

Box

Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Primary,16 assorted colors/box, Crayola 52-0336, ACMI
AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON
PRODUCT PACKAGING

School Specialty, LLC

Crayola #52-0336

007551

1.59

2,003

Box

Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 8 colors/box, 12 box/carton, Crayola 52-3008, Prang
DIX00000, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT
REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

School Specialty, LLC

Crayola #52-3008

007503

0.29

4,259

Box

Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 16 colors/box, Crayola 52-3016, Prang DIX00100, ACMI AP
SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT
PACKAGING

School Specialty, LLC

Crayola #52-0016

007512

0.45

347

Set

Markers, Classic Colors, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 8
colors/set, Crayola 58-7808, Dixon Prang #80680, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS
TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

School Specialty, LLC

Crayola #58-7808

008196

1.65

10,368

Set

Markers, Classic Colors, NON-WASHABLE, Water Soluble, Water-Based Ink. MADE

IN AMERICA. Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 8 colors/set. Crayola
#58-7708, Dixon Prang #80128, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236"

STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

School Specialty, LLC

Crayola #58-7708

008148

1.40

1,871

Set

Markers, Washable Broad line conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 12 colors/set,
Must wash from skin, clothing and painted walls; Crayola 58-7812, ACMI AP SEAL &
"CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT
PACKAGING

School Specialty, LLC

Crayola #58-7812

024031

2.45

1,015

Set

Pencils, colored 8 assorted colors/set, pre-sharpened, 3.3mm core. Crayola #68-4008,
ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON
PRODUCT PACKAGING

School Specialty, LLC

Crayola #68-4008

008211




Pencils, Colored, 12 assorted colors/set, Crayola 68-4012, Prang #22120, School

12 19,220 Set Smart 245787, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT
REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING School Specialty, LLC Crayola #68-4012 160-1456 S 1.05
Pencils, Colored, 24 assorted colors/set, Crayola 68-4024, Prang #22240, School
13 300 Set Smart 245788, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT
REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING School Specialty, LLC Crayola #68-4012 008220 S 2.08
Pencils, Watercolor, 12 Color Set, Crayola 68-4302, NO SUBSTITUTE, ACMI AP
14 1,044 Set SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT
PACKAGING School Specialty, LLC Crayola #68-4302 008559 S 1.93
CATEGORY: PAINT
UNIT OF Vendor Manufact:lrer & Mfr. Model Vendor Stock Number Price
ITEM NO. | EST USAGE ISSUE ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION umber
Paint, finger, liquid, 16 oz, Crayola 55-1316-XXX, School Smart 20024XX, ACMI AP
SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT
PACKAGING
Black{School Specialty, LLC School Smart #2002420 2002420| S 1.91
Blue|School Specialty, LLC School Smart #2002424 2002424| $ 1.91
15 137 Jar Brown|School Spec?alty, LLC School Smart #2002421 2002421| S 1.91
Green|School Specialty, LLC School Smart #2002416 2002416] S 1.91
Orange| School Specialty, LLC School Smart #2002415 2002415| $ 1.91
Red|School Specialty, LLC School Smart #2002423 2002423| S 1.91
Violet|School Specialty, LLC School Smart #2002417 2002417| $ 1.91
White|School Specialty, LLC School Smart #2002419 2002419| $ 1.91
Yellow|School Specialty, LLC School Smart #2002418 2002418| $ 1.91
Paint, Tempera, liquid, 16 oz, plastic bottle complete with dispensing tops,paint bottle
must have a seal; all colors available, Sunburst #3500-XX, Crayola Arista Il 54-3115-
XXX, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED
ON PRODUCT PACKAGING
Black|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Sunburst #3500BK 24536626| S 1.55
Blue|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Sunburst #3500BE 24536573| S 1.55
Brown|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Sunburst #3500BN 24536568 S 1.55
16 4.901 Jar Green|Southwest School Supply,Inc.  |Sunburst #3500GN 24536601| $ 1.55
’ Magenta|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Sunburst #3500MA 24536599 $ 1.55
Orange|Southwest School Supply,Inc.  |Sunburst #35000E 24536620 $ 1.55
Peach|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Sunburst #3500PH 24536614| S 1.55
Red|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Sunburst #3500RD 24536625| $ 1.55
Turquoise|Southwest School Supply,Inc.  [Sunburst #3500TE 24536616| S 1.55
Violet[Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Sunburst #3500VT 24536611| S 1.55
White|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Sunburst #3500WE 24536598 S 1.55
Yellow[Southwest School Supply,Inc.  [Sunburst #3500YW 24536584| $ 1.55
Paint, Water Color, 8 oval pans, assorted, with brush, 12 sets/carton, Prang #00800,
17 5832 Set Crayola 53-0080/53-1508/53-0525, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D
’ 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING
Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Crayola #53-0525 738104| S 1.52
Paint, Water Color, 8 oval pans, assorted, with brush, 12 sets/carton, Crayola Artista Il
18 4.421 Set 53-1508, NO SUBSTITUTE, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236"
4 STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING
Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Crayola #53-0508 723973| $ 1.65
CATEGORY: PAPER, ART CRAFT ROLL
UNIT OF Manufacturer & Mfr. Model .
ITEM NO. | EST USAGE |  ISSUE ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION Vendor Number Vendor Stock Number Price

Paper, Art Craft, 36" wide x 1000', 50Ib, Duo-Finish. Pacon ArtKraft PO0670XX, Color-
Brite #5560XX




Aqua|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560AQ 24538358| $ 67.97
Autumn Gold|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560GD 24543618 S 72.81
Black|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560BK 24538379| S 60.05
Bright Green|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Color-Brite #5560BGN 24543594 S 79.87
Brown|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560BBN 24543599 $ 60.09
Canary|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560BCY 24538549 S 71.92
Dark Blue|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Color-Brite #5560DBE 24543590 $ 57.18
19 187 Rolls Emerald Green|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Color-Brite #5560EGN 24543590] $ 55.22
Flame|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Color-Brite #5560FRD 24538546 S 75.13
Gray|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Color-Brite #5560GY 24538441| S 73.21
Light Green|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Color-Brite #5560LGN 24538436| $ 72.91
Orange|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #55600E 24538502 $ 72.01
Pink[Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Color-Brite #5560PK 24543615| S 69.63
Purple|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560PE 24543619| S 70.88
Scarlet|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560ST 24543616| S 65.17
Sky Blue|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560SBE 24538458 S 70.88
White|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5560WE 24538466 S 54.19
Paper, Art Craft, 36" wide x 1000', 40Ib, FIRE/FLAME RETARDANT, All colors. Pacon-
Decorol P1012XX, Southwest 5550XX
Black|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon #P101209 306256| $ 89.37
Blue (Saphire)|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon #P101206 826180| $ 96.14
Dark Brown|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon #P101207 833440| $ 99.25
Emerald no bid
Festive Green|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon #P101202 826177| $ 106.01
20 287 Rolls Festive Red|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon #P101203 826178| $ 99.11
Orange no bid
Pink|Southwest School Supply,Inc. [Color-Brite #5550PK 24543596| $ 88.84
Purple no bid
Red|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon #P101203 826178| $ 99.11
Sky Blue|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5550SBE 24543598| $ 88.82
White|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon #P101208 826181| $ 81.61
Yellow|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Color-Brite #5550YW 24543606| $ 90.39
CATEGORY: PAPER, CONSTRUCTION
UNIT OF Vendor Manufact:n:rrnﬁelglfr. Model Vendor Stock Number Price
ITEM NO. | EST USAGE ISSUE ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION
Paper, Construction, 9"x12", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76#
basis, 50% recyled fiber content & recyclable. All colors incl. asstd. (brightness &
range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray P102XXX and P103XXX, Imperial Color-
Brite 5690
Assorted Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Black lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Blue Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Bright Neon Yellow lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Dark Blue Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Dark Brown lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Dark Green lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Festive Green Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Festive Red lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Gold lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Holiday Green lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Holiday Red lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Hot Lime lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Hot Pink Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Light Brown lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75




2 1,739 Pkg Light Green lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Light Yellow lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Lilac Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Magenta lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Orange lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Pearl Gray lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Pink lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Pumpkin lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Purple Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Red lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Royal Blue lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Salmon lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Sky Blue lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Slate Gray lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Tan Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Turquoise lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Warm Brown Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
White lllusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Yellow Illusion Commerce, LLC S 1.75
Paper, Construction, 12"x18", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76#
basis, 50% recycled fiber content and recyclable. All colors including assorted
(brightness and range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray P102XXX and P103XXX,
Imperial Color-Brite 5700
Assorted|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700AD 24538505( $ 3.33
Black [Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700BK 24538442| s 3.33
Blue|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700BE 24538481| S 3.33
Bright Neon Yellow no bid
Dark Blue|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700DBL 24543612( $ 3.33
Dark Brown|Southwest School Supply, Inc. Color-Brite #5700DBN 24543613 $ 3.33
Dark Green|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700DGN 24548445( s 3.33
Festive Green|Southwest School Supply,inc. Color-Brite #5700DFGN 24543614| S 3.33
Festive Red [Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700DFRD 24543602( S 3.33
Gold [Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700DGD 24543604 S 3.33
Holiday Green|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700HGN 24538419( s 3.33
Holiday Red|Southwest School Supply, Inc. Color-Brite #5700HRD 24538420( $ 3.33
Hot Lime |Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700HLE 24543607| S 3.33
Hot Pink [Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700HPK 24543610( S 3.33
Light Brown |Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700LBN 24538462| S 3.33
22 31,364 Pkg Light Green|Southwest School Supply, Inc. Color-Brite #5700LGN 24538535] $ 3.33
Light Yellow |Southwest School Supply, Inc. Color-Brite #5700LYW 24538538( S 3.33
Lilac|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700LC 24538431| s 3.33
Magenta|Southwest School Supply, Inc. Color-Brite #5700MA 24543593( § 3.33
Orange|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #57000E 24538421| s 3.33
Pearl Gray [Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700DPGY 24543597| $ 3.33
Pink [Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700PK 24538432( s 3.33
Pumpkin no bid
Purple|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700PE 24543595( S 3.33
Red [Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700RD 24538440| $ 3.33
Royal Blue|Southwest School Supply, Inc. Color-Brite #5700RBE 24543600 $ 3.33
Salmon|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Pacon #P103042 1388076| $ 3.33
Sky Blue|Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700DSBE 24538478| s 3.33
Slate Gray|Southwest School Supply, Inc. Color-Brite #5700SGY 24538437| $ 3.33
Tan [Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700TN 24538426( S 3.33
Turquoise [Southwest School Supply, Inc. Color-Brite #5700TE 24538484| $ 3.33
Warm Brown |Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700WBN 24543611| S 3.33
White |Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700WE 24538383| $ 3.33
Yellow|Southwest School Supply,inc. Color-Brite #5700YW 24538422| $ 3.33

CATEGORY: MISCELLANEOUS




mEmNo. | EsTusace | Une OF ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION Vendor Manufacturer & Mfr. Model | vendor stock Number Price
Clay, modeling, four 1/4lb sticks/box, permanently pliable, 4 colors red, green, blue,
yellow, individually wrapped sticks,Prang #00740, Crayola #57-0300, School Smart
3 1,317 | Each 15003083, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT
REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING School Specialty, LLC Dixon Prang #00740 221532| $ 1.38
Glitter, 1 Ib, Pacon-Spectra P00917XXX, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM
D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING
Blue|southwest School Supply,Inc.  |Pacon P0091750 409367| $ 6.07
24 167 Each Gold|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon P0091780 477735| $ 6.07
Green|Southwest School Supply,Inc. |Pacon P0091760 409363| S 6.07
Multi| Pyramid School Products Pyramid #91790 91790| $ 6.49
Red|Pyramid School Products Pyramid #91740 91740| $ 6.29
Silver| no bid
Pastels, Oil,12 colors/box, Pentel #PHN12, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO
25 102 Box  [ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING )
Complete Office, LLC PENTAL PENPHN12 S 0.79
Yarn, Acrylic roving, 8 oz, 3 ply, 150 yard (450 foot) skein, all colors, Pacon Trait-Tex
P0007XXX, Imperial Color-Brite 3900XX, Pepperell Braiding JRYBXX
Black{School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB14 2132745| $ 6.98
Brown([School Specialty, LLC no bid
Dark Blue[School Specialty, LLC no bid
Dark Green|School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYBO7 2132746| S 6.98
Hot Pink|School Specialty, LLC no bid
2% 03 Each Lavender[School Specialty, LLC no bid
Light Blue|School Specialty, LLC no bid
Light Green|School Specialty, LLC no bid
Orange|School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYBO4 2132744| S 6.98
Purple|School Specialty, LLC no bid
Red|School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB02 2132740| $ 6.98
White[School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYBO1 2132742| S 6.98
Yellow|School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYBO3 2132741| S 6.98
Royal Blue|School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB12 2132743| S 6.98




NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE: K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES

BID NUMBER: 2025-14

CONTRACT PERIOD: Jan. 1, 2026 - Dec. 31, 2026

LIQUIDATED DAMAGES:

2.5% PER DAY

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Marcos Unified School District
DISTRICT CONTACT: Vicki Capozza, Buyer (760) 290-2374
MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT: $50.00

DELIVERY: 30 Calendar Days ARO

VENDOR NAME

ADDRESS

PHONE/FAX NUMBER
WEBSITE

CONTACT NAME

Blick Art Materials LLC

include reference
#QD20ONCP on all
orders

PO Box 1267

Galesbery, IL 61402-1267

800704-447-8192

800-704-7744 Contracts

purchaseorders@dickblick.com

NOTES

Free shipping over
$69.

Orders under$69
FLAT RATE OF
$11.99

School Specialty -
include bid #Q-619221
on all orders

W6316 Design Drive
Greenville, WI 54942

888-388-3224 - Toll Free
310-200-5778 - Sales

Jamie Young, Sr. Bid Contract Coord.
bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com

Sita Beasley, Sales sita.beasley@schoolspecialty.com
Ordering Email: orders@schoolspecialty.com

S&S Worldwide

75 Mill Street
Colchester, CT 06415

800-642-7354

Jenna Schall
bids@ssww.com

Lakeshore Learning

2695 E. Dominguez St.
Carson, CA 90895

800-421-5354
Fax 800-421-5354
www.lakeshorelearning.com

Johanna Lopez
biddept@lakeshorelearning.com

Nasco Education

901 Janesville Ave

Fort Atkinson, WI 53538

800-558-9595

Tosha Simao

tsimao@nascoeducation.com

Free Shipping over
$199
see exceptions

Southwest School & Office
Supply

1500 S Dupont
Ontario CA 91761

800-227-7159 - Toll Free
909-980-7777 - Direct

Ronald Perez, Bid Analyst
ronald.perez@southwestschool.com
Ordering Email: biddesk@southwestschoo.com

* When placing orders, please reference the numbers under the vendor's name on all purchase orders.
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