












NOTES

Free shipping over 
$69. 

Orders under$69 
FLAT RATE OF 
$11.99

Greenville, WI  54942

www.lakeshorelearning.com

Free Shipping over 
$199
see exceptions

* When placing orders, please reference the numbers under the vendor's name on all purchase orders.

888-388-3224 - Toll Free
310-200-5778 - Sales

800-642-7354
Colchester, CT 06415

S&S Worldwide

School Specialty -       
include bid #Q-619221 
on all orders

Fort Atkinson, WI 53538

75 Mill Street

2695 E. Dominguez St. 800-421-5354
Carson, CA 90895 Fax 800-421-5354

Lakeshore Learning

W6316 Design Drive

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

AWARDED VENDOR LIST

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Marcos Unified School DistrictBID TITLE:  PRE-K-12 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES  

BID NUMBER:  2025-14

CONTRACT PERIOD:  Jan. 1, 2026 - Dec. 31, 2026 

LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT:  $50.00

DELIVERY: 30 Calendar Days ARO

DISTRICT CONTACT:   Vicki Capozza, Buyer  (760) 290-2374

PO Box 1267 

Galesbery, IL 61402-1267 800-704-7744 Contracts

VENDOR NAME ADDRESS
PHONE/FAX NUMBER 

WEBSITE
CONTACT NAME

800704-447-8192 purchaseorders@dickblick.com

biddept@lakeshorelearning.com

tsimao@nascoeducation.com
Southwest School & Office 
Supply

1500 S Dupont 800-227-7159 - Toll Free Ronald Perez, Bid Analyst
Ontario CA 91761 909-980-7777 - Direct ronald.perez@southwestschool.com

Ordering Email: biddesk@southwestschoo.com

Blick Art Materials LLC 

include reference 
#QD20NCP on all 
orders

Ordering Email: orders@schoolspecialty.com

Nasco Education
901 Janesville Ave 800-558-9595 Tosha Simao

Jamie Young, Sr. Bid Contract Coord.
bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com
Sita Beasley, Sales sita.beasley@schoolspecialty.com

Jenna Schall
bids@ssww.com

Johanna Lopez



November 20, 2025 

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium 

San Marcos Unified School District 

255 Pico Avenue, Suite 250 

San Marcos  CA  92069

    Bid Number: 2025-14 

Bid Name: K-12 Elementary Art Supplies 

Opening Date/Time: 11/21/25 3pm

Thank you for the opportunity to submit a bid on the proposal referenced above. We have elected not to respond to the 

line-item section of this offer. Our response to the catalog discount section of this offer is outlined below. Blick is 

pleased to offer a 20% discount to your members.  Attached, you will find our full discount offer terms and exclusions.  

To ensure your discount is properly applied to your orders, please reference discount code QD20NCP at the time of 

order. 

To place an order 

• Phone: 800-447-8192

• Fax: 800-621-8293

• Email: PurchaseOrders@dickblick.com

• Online: www.dickblick.com

Payment Terms: Net 30 Days – all orders are subject to credit approval. 
Delivery: 7-21 DAYS ARO 

If you have questions regarding this proposal, please contact me.  We value this opportunity to offer our support as your 
art supply vendor.  

Sincerely, 

Tamby Peterson 
Institutional Sales Supervisor 
800-704-7744, contracts@dickblick.com

Enclosures 

Force Majeure Statement Regarding Tariffs - Quoted prices reflect known costs and best information available at the time of bid.  Current and 

future tariffs have the potential to increase our acquisition costs for these products. While we at Blick Art Materials will do everything in our power 

to maintain prices as bid or quoted, it is possible resulting orders may require a price adjustment at the time of order placement.  In those 

instances, you will be contacted for authorization before we proceed with the order.  Should tariffs continue to increase, we cannot guarantee 

product shipment of significantly impacted skus.  It is our recommendation to place your order as soon as possible to limit potential price 

adjustments.  

We accept “Future Orders”. POs placed in advance are held until ship dates specified on orders (within same calendar year). No invoice obligation 
until delivery. Future orders can: target delivery timing, improve product availability, minimize backorders, and reduce number of invoices. 

P-Cards Blick Art Materials accepts P-Cards as a form of payment both at the time of order and upon invoice.  There is no convenience fee if the 
card is billed upon shipment.  When P-Cards are applied to invoices, a 3% convenience fee will be applied.

mailto:PurchaseOrders@dickblick.com
http://www.dickblick.com/
mailto:contracts@dickblick.com


The North County Educational Purchasing Consortium is seeking Catalog Bids for Art Supplies & Equpment for

Please state additional conditions or requirements:

List catalogs that apply to discount:

Exclusions:

Date:

2025-14 NCEPC Art Supplies & Equipment Bid, Grades PreK - 12 

Specification Price Sheet

Part 2 - Percentage Discount Off Catalog

CATEGORIES BID PERCENTAGES

FREIGHT PERCENTAGE TO BE ADDED ON ORDERS UNDER $50:

EXCEPTION TO MINIMUN ORDER OF $50 FOR FREE FREIGHT:

EXCEPTION TO LIQUIDATED DAMAGES 2.5% PER DAY:

Number of additional pages submitted:

Company:

EXCEPTION TO DELIVERY 30 CALENDAR DAYS ARO:

K-12 Art Supplies Bid Part 2

Attachment B

All eligible items in Blick's 2026 Materials for Art Education catalog 20% - with exclusions (see below)

Most orders of stock items totaling $69 ore more will ship free. Orders 
under $69 will be billed a flat rate $11.95 shipping. Exclusions apply -
see below. 

Factory-direct, oversized, overweight items do not qualify for free 
shipping terms. See the attached Catalog Discount Terms letter
for complete details. 

Standard FedEx ground delivery for stock items is 10-21 days ARO. 
Many factory-direct items have longer lead times according to the
 manufacturer delivery schedule. Occasionally, there may be stock items 
on backorder. Most backorders deliver within 30 days or order placement.
Contact us for estimated lead times on factory-direct items.

Our discount offer applies to the "each" price as listed in Blick's annual printed catalog, "Materials for Art 
Education". This catalog is updated each year, pricing effective Jan. 1 - Dec. 31. The 2026 catalog will be 
available for download and mailing by mid-December and will be the base price for the catalog discount offer. 

Blick's "Materials for Art Education"

Factory-direct items, quantity pricing, sale catalogs, website prices are not discountable. The catalog discount may
not be combined with any other offer or promotion. See the attached Catalog Discount Terms letter for complete
details. 

Blick Art Materials LLC
11/19/25
1



 

 

 
 

Contract Reference: 2025-14 K-12 Elementary Art Supplies        

Discount: 20%      

Contact:  Tamby Peterson 

Discount Code: QD20NCP  

Email:  contracts@dickblick.com

Offer Terms              
• Discount is applied to the “each” price as listed in Blick’s annual Materials for Art Education annual catalog only.  

Item numbers begin with A in 2025. Letters will change annually between A, B, or C. 

• Free freight on orders of $69 or more after discount See below for exclusions. 
 

Discount Exclusions             
• Sale catalogs 

• Website prices at www.dickblick.com 
You will receive the lower of the web price at the time of order or your catalog discount.  To view discount prices while 
shopping online, select Shop School or Business at the top of the home page and follow the prompts to sign in or authenticate 
your school’s information.  Once authenticated, your adjusted prices will be visible on product pages, in the shopping cart, and 
at checkout.  Note: web prices may fluctuate daily. If you will not place your order immediately, or will place your order offline, 
move your cart contents to a Quick Quote to lock prices for up to 60 days.  Go to https://www.dickblick.com/lists/quick-
quote/ for more information. 

• Quantity pricing    
You will receive the lower of the quantity break, for the quantity ordered, or your discount from the “EACH” price. 

• Drop-ship items     
Any item with the letter F in the catalog item # prefix or noted as factory-direct online. 

• Cannot be used in conjunction with additional coupons or other promotions. 
 

Free Freight Exclusions            
• Orders under $69, flat rate $11.95 shipping 

• Oversized or heavy weight items (i.e. paper rolls, linoleum rolls, printmaking presses, or any item indicating 
additional handling) 

• 50-lb boxes of clay or ANY modeling material totaling 50-lbs or greater in weight 

• Drop-ship items (any item with the letter F in the catalog item # prefix or noted as factory-direct online) 

• When ordering sheets of paper or board larger than 18” x 24” in quantities of less than 10, a per-order handling fee 
applies. Paper or boards may be assorted to reach the quantity of 10. 

 

To place an order             
• Provide discount code on your order or in the promo field when ordering online 

• Phone: 800-447-8192 or Fax: 800-621-8293      

• Email: PurchaseOrders@dickblick.com      

• Online: www.dickblick.com  

Catalog Discount Terms and Exclusions 

https://www.dickblick.com/lists/quick-quote/
https://www.dickblick.com/lists/quick-quote/
mailto:PurchaseOrders@dickblick.com
http://www.dickblick.com/


November 12, 2025 

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium 
C/O San Marcos Unified School District 
Attn: Maribel Suarez, President  
215 Mata Way Bldg. 4 
San Marcos, CA 92069 

RE: Bid No. 2025-14 for K-12 Elementary Art Supplies 

Dear Maribel Suarez and North County Educational Purchasing Consortium Staff,   

Thank you for providing Lakeshore Learning Materials the opportunity to respond to the Bid For K-12 Elementary 
Art Supplies. Lakeshore is dedicated to creating innovative educational materials and furniture that spark young 
imaginations, instill a sense of wonder and foster a lifelong love of learning. With materials, furniture and 
environments for students of all ages, we help each individual reach developmental milestones and achieve 
education goals—while still having fun! 

OFFER 
Lakeshore is pleased to present the following offer to NCEPC: 

• 5% discount on all non-sale items from Lakeshore’s catalogs, website (www.LakeshoreLearning.com) and
retail stores (see attached Store List for locations).

• Free shipping on orders over $50.00 shipping to one location in the contiguous United States. For
orders under $50.00, please estimate freight charges at 15% of the subtotal, with a minimum freight
charge of $6.99.

Must reference “Per Bid #2025-14” on all purchase orders to receive these terms. 

Lakeshore agrees to hold the discount offered in this submission throughout the lifetime of the contract.  
Catalogs and prices are subject to change during the calendar year, and in the event of significant factors  
outside our control, such as government-imposed tariffs or global pandemic; for current prices please visit 
www.LakeshoreLearning.com.  

SAMPLES 
If awarded, Lakeshore Learning Materials will be more than happy to provide samples upon request. 



The North County Educational Purchasing Consortium is seeking Catalog Bids for Art Supplies & Equpment for

Please state additional conditions or requirements:

List catalogs that apply to discount:

Exclusions:

Date:

2025-14 NCEPC Art Supplies & Equipment Bid, Grades PreK - 12 

Specification Price Sheet

Part 2 - Percentage Discount Off Catalog

CATEGORIES BID PERCENTAGES

FREIGHT PERCENTAGE TO BE ADDED ON ORDERS UNDER $50:

EXCEPTION TO MINIMUN ORDER OF $50 FOR FREE FREIGHT:

EXCEPTION TO LIQUIDATED DAMAGES 2.5% PER DAY:

Number of additional pages submitted:

Company:

EXCEPTION TO DELIVERY 30 CALENDAR DAYS ARO:

K-12 Art Supplies Bid Part 2

Attachment B

Art Supplies 5% on all non-sale items from our catalogs, website, and retail stores.

5% on all non-sale items from our catalogs, website, and retail stores.All other Categories Lakeshore Offers

FREE shipping on orders over $50.00 shipping to one location in the 
contiguous United States. For orders under $50.00, please estimate 
freight charges at 15% of the subtotal, with a minimum charge of $6.99.

Not applicable.

Not applicable.

Not applicable.

Must reference “Per Bid #2025-14” on all purchase orders to receive these terms. 

Lakeshore 2025 Elementary Catalog
Lakeshore 2025 Early Childhood Catalog
Lakeshore Online Catalog (www.LakeshoreLearning.com)

Discount not applicable to sale items.

Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC

October 31, 2025

0



The North County Educational Purchasing Consortium is seeking Catalog Bids for Art Supplies & Equpment for

Please state additional conditions or requirements:

List catalogs that apply to discount:

Exclusions:

Date:

2025-14 NCEPC Art Supplies & Equipment Bid, Grades PreK - 12 

Specification Price Sheet

Part 2 - Percentage Discount Off Catalog

CATEGORIES BID PERCENTAGES

FREIGHT PERCENTAGE TO BE ADDED ON ORDERS UNDER $50:

EXCEPTION TO MINIMUN ORDER OF $50 FOR FREE FREIGHT:

EXCEPTION TO LIQUIDATED DAMAGES 2.5% PER DAY:

Number of additional pages submitted:

Company:

EXCEPTION TO DELIVERY 30 CALENDAR DAYS ARO:

K-12 Art Supplies Bid Part 2

Attachment B

Art Supplies & Equipment 0-20%-please see attached for more information

$19.95
Free ground shipping on each separate order totaling $199 or more 
shipping to one location. Free Shipping Exclusions include Truck logo 
items, and items marked excluded from free shipping on website/catalog.
Nasco is not responsible for any excess costs incurred due to the purchase 
of items from other sources when products are unavailable at the time 
of order. Nasco will not be responsible for paying penalty fees or liquidation damages

Backordered items and truck items may require additional delivery time
since they ship directly from the manufacturer.

Please see attached for terms and exclusions

Art Supplies

Please see attached terms and exclusions sheets for more information.

Nasco Education LLC

7
11/3/25



Bid Exception Clarification 

Entity:                                          ________________________
Bid ID:                                         ________________________     
Bid Name:                                  ________________________   
Contract Dates:                         ________________________

• Current prices can be found at nascoeducation.com. Enter your quote number when prompted
to receive your discounted price.

• Free ground shipping does not apply to separate orders less than $199 or excluded items as
listed below:

 Items marked additional shipping charges
 Preserved items
 Items stated on website as being excluded

• Shipping is listed as a separate line item on Invoices. For shipping estimates, please call 800-
558-9595.

• Additional charges apply to:
o Hazardous Material
o Inside Delivery
o Lift gate

• Nasco is not responsible for excess costs incurred due to the purchase of items from other
sources when products are unavailable at the time of order.

• Nasco is not responsible for paying penalty fees or liquidation damages.
• Returns or exchanges are granted only on stock merchandise upon request within 30 days of

date of invoice. Restocking fees may apply. Contact Customer Care by calling 800-558-9595. See
our full Return Policy.

• Warranties vary by product and are based on manufacturer warranty terms.
• Nasco does not give additional discounts for prompt payment of invoices.
• Orders are invoiced once product has shipped. Net 30 payment terms commence at time of

invoicing.
• Nasco does not install, assemble, or remove debris of any kind.

http://www.nascoeducation.com/
https://www.nascoeducation.com/return-policy


Custom Discount For:
Custom Discount Number:
Valid:

Category Discount off current price 

Art Education 20% 

Qualifying orders over $199 (after discount) Free Shipping* 

*Some exclusions apply Please visit nascoeducation.com/shipping for current shipping and delivery terms.
Hawaii and Alaska are not included in free shipping offer. Please call 1.800.558.9595 for shipping rates.
TERMS: Net 30 days, with approved credit
DELIVERY: Approximately 5-10 business days upon receipt of order for in-stock items

PLEASE NOTE: 

Visit us at nascoeducation.com to browse our complete offering or request a catalog. For questions about 
pricing, high-quantity orders, bids and quotes, or help with product selection, contact our customer care 
team at 1.800.558.9595 or custserv@nascoeducation.com. We look forward to serving you! 

Sincerely, 

Michelle Au, Contract Sales Manager 

● Cannot be combined with other offers. Excludes special orders and previously placed orders. Offer
available in the U.S. only. Customers will receive the best of sale pricing, contract
pricing, or promotional discount. Some exclusions apply
● Items marked "Excluded From Discounts" on nascoeducation.com are not discounted.
● An additional small order handling fee of $5.00 will b e applied to orders under $50.00.
● A hazardous material surcharge will be added to items with a black diamond (⧫) or D.O.T. symbol.
● For instructions on how to use your quote online, please visit  nascoeducation.com/how-to-use-
my-quote- number.
● Due to unforeseen increases or operational changes, Nasco Education reserves the right to change
published prices or shipping policies without notice. Please refer to our website for current
pricing and policies.
● Please include your quote number above on all orders.
● IMPORTANT: In the event that international tariffs are imposed by the U.S. government, some
products or parts manufactured outside the United States may incur a tariff surcharge. If this
surcharge applies to your order, you will be notified of any price increase before we process your
purchase order.

https://www.nascoeducation.com/shipping-delivery
https://www.nascoeducation.com/how-to-use-my-quote-number
www.nascoeducation.com
cklingman
Highlight



 

 

Shipping and Handling 
 

Order Total — Some exclusions apply 
Shipping and Handling* 

$199 or More=FREE 
$50–$198.99=$14.95 
Less than $50=$19.95 

 
*Shipping and Handling applies to each separate order shipping within the continental 48 states. 
 
Free Shipping Exclusions 

 Additional shipping charge items, preserved materials, and items marked excluded from free 
shipping. Shipping is calculated for web orders. For non-web orders, please call Customer Care at 
1.800.558.9595. Alaska, Hawaii, Puerto Rico, US Territories, and Distributors-please call Customer Care 
at 1.800.558.9595 for shipping quotes. 
 
International Orders 
Please email international@nascoeducation.com for a shipping quote. Order minimum is $500, and 
prepayment is required. 
 
Shipping & Delivery 
We will ship your order in the most secure and economical way, unless you request a particular 
method of shipment. Most orders within the continental United States arrive within 5–7 business days 
after they ship. 
 
Regular or Small Parcels 
Most orders will be shipped using FedEx or Priority Mail. 
 
♦ Hazardous Handling Surcharge 
Nasco strictly adheres to the U.S. Department of Transportation regulations regarding products 
classified as “hazardous materials.” In following these regulations, you may be assessed a $48.00 per 
carton special handling surcharge for items defined within this category. For your convenience, these 
products are designated in the catalog by a ♦ or D.O.T. classification next to the catalog number. 
Shipping Methods 
 
 
 
 

mailto:international@nascoeducation.com


 

 

Ground Service & Priority Mail 
These are the most economical options and are the default on the shopping cart. 
Expedited Shipping Request (Next Day, Second Day, and Three Day Select) 
These methods refer to business days (Monday – Friday). Please call Customer Care at 1.800.558.9595 
to request a quote. 
  
NOTE: All orders are shipped FOB Origin. Title and risk of loss transfer to the customer upon departure 
from our facility. 
 
Availability Status 
In Stock 
Usually ships in 2 business days, except during peak summer months.  
 
Direct Ship Items (ship directly from Nasco supplier) 
Noted on the product page with the statement, “This item is shipped directly from our supplier. Allow 
extra delivery time.” Estimated delivery dates vary; however, they typically arrive within 4–6 weeks.  
 
Temporarily Out of Stock 
These items ship once Nasco receives them from suppliers. If interested in alternatives, call Customer 
Care at 1.800.558.9595 or send an email to custserv@nascoeducation.com.  
 
Questions About an Order? 
Our Customer Care Representatives are experts at resolving any issues you may have with your order. 
Please follow these 3 easy steps: 

• Please review your packing slip carefully. You may find that changes or substitutions are fully 
detailed. 

• If you need to contact Nasco Customer Care, call 1.800.558.9595 or send an email 
to custserv@nascoeducation.com and have one or more of the following available: Nasco order 
number, invoice number, purchase order number, and/or billing and shipping addresses.  

• For damaged merchandise, order discrepancies, or returns, view our Return Policy. 
 

mailto:custserv@nascoeducation.com
mailto:custserv@nascoeducation.com
https://www.nascoeducation.com/return-policy


 

 

How do I use my discount quote number 
on nascoeducation.com to find pricing? 

If your district has a contract with Nasco Education, we want to make sure you get the discount 
you deserve. Use the methods below to apply your discount quote number on product pages 
or in your cart. 

Not sure if you have a contract? Reach out to us 
at 1.800.558.9595 or quotes@nascoeducation.com  and we’ll be happy to help!   

  

Apply your discount on the product page or 

 

  

 

  

mailto:%C2%A0quotes@nascoeducation.com


 

 

 

Apply your discount right in your cart 

 

  

 



”
““I loved how Nasco Education’s 

custom kit services took so much 
stress off of me and gave me more 
time back to focus on other priorities.

– Melody McGill,  
Modesto City Schools, CA

Ready-made 
individual kits 
•	 Ensure that every student has 

access to the same learning tools 
•	 Learn anywhere — kits travel to 

the classroom, home, after-school 
tutoring, and intervention pull-outs

•	 Prevent germ spread by giving 
each student their own set of 
materials

•	 Save prep time — no more collating 
kits or disinfecting between uses

•	 Choose flexibility and convenience 
•	 Stop spending time researching 

learning tools and materials, 
placing multiple vendor orders, and 
waiting for supplies to arrive

•	 Save prep time — many kits include 
lesson plans or activity guides to 
jump-start learning for you and 
your students

All-in-one 
classroom kits 

Made-for-you 
custom kits 

Volume 12 | Gr. 5

Time: 45-60 mins.

Developed with Kristin Ulrich

LESSON 
PLAN

Learning Standards

Represent division of a unit 

fraction by a whole number 

and the division of a whole 

number by a unit fraction 

such as ⅓   divided by 7 and 

7 divided by ⅓   using objects 

and pictorial models, 

including area models.

Divide whole numbers 

by unit fractions and unit 

fractions by whole numbers.

Math

Introduction

This activity is meant as an introduction to teaching the concepts mentioned above. It 

should be used early on in instruction to give students a visual model of dividing unit 

fractions by whole numbers. Each group needs to have at least eight sets of fraction 

tiles or towers. Students should be working in groups of 4-5 students.

Objectives
Students will be able to…

• Create, construct, and sketch problems that involve dividing whole numbers by unit fractions

• Solve problems that involve dividing whole numbers by unit fractions when given a pictorial 

model

• Create pictorial models that represent various problems that divide whole numbers by unit 

fractions

Materials list

• Fraction Tiles with Tray, 8 sets per group 

(TB15811)

• Complete Set of Fraction Tiles with Trays 

(TB21928)

• Activity Sheet, worksheet, and answer key 

(attached with lesson plan download)

Optional:

• Demonstration Magnetic Foam Fraction 

Tiles Set (TB26299)

Dividing whole numbers  

by unit fractions

•	 Create engaging, hands-on kits 
exactly to your specifications for 
any subject

•	 Take advantage of our huge 
selection and ability to source 
exactly what you need

•	 Save time — we’ll bring together 
all the pieces and organize and 
package everything just the way 
you want

How to order with your quote number
1.	 Go to nascoeducation.com

2.	 In the search bar at the top of the page, type the product 
item number you’re interested and click “enter.”

3.	On the product page, type your quote number into the 
“Discount Quote Number” field found below the price, 
and click the “Apply Quote” button. Pricing will be 
updated to reflect your discount.

4.	Enter your desired quantity and click “Add to Cart.”

5.	Repeat these steps for all items you would like to order.

6.	Submit your order with your preferred method.

1.800.558.9595   |   nascoeducation.com

1.800.558.9595 
Monday – Friday 7 a.m. – 5 p.m. CST

Ordering information
901 Janesville Ave.
Fort Atkinson, WI 53538

nascoeducation.com

orders@nascoeducation.com

1.800.372.1236

Save ordering and prep time with open-and-go kits

•	 Online orders: Complete your order with a credit 
card payment.

•	 Email, fax, or phone orders: Print or save a PDF 
of your cart and attach it to your purchase order. 

Middle School Student Art Kit  
with Sketchbook in Bag

Complete Set of Fraction Tiles 
with Trays

http://nascoeducation.com
http://nascoeducation.com
http://nascoeducation.com
mailto:orders@nascoeducation.com
http://www.enasco.com/p/NE20076
http://www.enasco.com/p/NE20076
http://www.enasco.com/p/TB21928
http://www.enasco.com/p/TB21928














The North County Educational Purchasing Consortium is seeking Catalog Bids for Art Supplies & Equpment for

Please state additional conditions or requirements:

List catalogs that apply to discount:

Exclusions:

Date:

2025-14 NCEPC Art Supplies & Equipment Bid, Grades PreK - 12 

Specification Price Sheet

Part 2 - Percentage Discount Off Catalog

CATEGORIES BID PERCENTAGES

FREIGHT PERCENTAGE TO BE ADDED ON ORDERS UNDER $50:

EXCEPTION TO MINIMUN ORDER OF $50 FOR FREE FREIGHT:

EXCEPTION TO LIQUIDATED DAMAGES 2.5% PER DAY:

Number of additional pages submitted:

Company:

EXCEPTION TO DELIVERY 30 CALENDAR DAYS ARO:

K-12 Art Supplies Bid Part 2

Attachment B

Art Supplies                                                                                            25%

0


0


Not Applicable








www.southwestordering.com






None

Southwest School & Office Supply

11/19/2025

--



White Southwest School Supply,Inc Color-Brite #5700WE 24538383 3.33$  
Yellow Southwest School Supply,Inc. Color-Brite #5700YW 24538422 3.33$  

ITEM NO. EST USAGE UNIT OF 
ISSUE Vendor Manufacturer & Mfr. Model 

Number Vendor Stock Number  Price 

23 1,317          Each

School Specialty, LLC Dixon Prang #00740 221532 1.38$  

Southwest School Supply,Inc. Pacon P0091750 409367 6.07$  
Southwest School Supply,Inc. Pacon P0091780 477735 6.07$  
Southwest School Supply,Inc. Pacon P0091760 409363 6.07$  
Pyramid School Products Pyramid #91790 91790 6.49$  
Pyramid School Products Pyramid #91740 91740 6.29$  

no bid

25 102 Box
Complete Office, LLC PENTAL PENPHN12 0.79$  

School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB14 2132745 6.98$  
School Specialty, LLC no bid
School Specialty, LLC no bid
School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB07 2132746 6.98$  
School Specialty, LLC no bid
School Specialty, LLC no bid
School Specialty, LLC no bid
School Specialty, LLC no bid
School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB04 2132744 6.98$  
School Specialty, LLC no bid
School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB02 2132740 6.98$  
School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB01 2132742 6.98$  
School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB03 2132741 6.98$  
School Specialty, LLC Pepperell Braiding #JRYB12 2132743 6.98$  

White

Royal Blue

Light Green
Orange
Purple

24

CATEGORY: MISCELLANEOUS

ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION

Clay, modeling, four 1/4lb sticks/box, permanently pliable, 4 colors red, green, blue, 
yellow, individually wrapped sticks,Prang #00740, Crayola #57-0300, School Smart 
2003083, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT 
REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING
Glitter, 1 lb, Pacon-Spectra P00917XXX, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 
4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

Yarn, Acrylic roving, 8 oz, 3 ply, 150 yard (450 foot) skein, all colors, Pacon Trait-Tex 
P0007XXX, Imperial Color-Brite 3900XX, Pepperell Braiding JRYBXX

167             Each

26 93               Each

  Blue
Gold

Green
Multi
Red

Pastels, Oil,12 colors/box, Pentel #PHN12, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM 
D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING

Black
Brown

Dark Blue
Dark Green

Hot Pink
Lavender
Light Blue

Red

Silver

Yellow
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