
February 11, 2026 

To: NCEPC President, Member and Associate Member Districts  

From: Cajon Valley Union School District, Dawn Vega Bid Administrator 

RE: AMENDMENT #1 - PE Supply Bid, #1677N

DISCONTINUED ITEM

Line item #101 – Deluxe Mesh Pinnie, Multiple Colors Available, Champion MPAOR has been discontinued 
by the manufacturer. School Specialty has provided a supporting letter from the Manufacturer: Heavyweight 
Nylon Pinnies will be provided as a direct, in-line replacement at the same cost:

Champion Sports:
NP1BL: blue, 
NP1GD: gold, 
NP1GN: green, 
NP1OR: orange, 
NP1PR: purple, 
NP1RD: red, 
NP1WH: white

CORRECTION TO PART NUMBER 

Line item #63 - Soccer Foam Ball: The description was originally listed as 9" but this is an 8" ball.The part numberis 
corrected to RS75.  

SUPPLIER SKU NUMBERS

Vendor Award, Itemized Line Item sheet has been updated to include School Specialty's part numbers 

RECOMMENDATION 

Please approve revisions to lines #63 and 101 as presented. 

~.11 North County Educational 
, .,,. Purchasing Consortium 



North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

BID TITLE:   PE Supplies SPONSORING DISTRICT:   CAJON VALLEY UNION SCHOOL DISTRICT DELIVERY A.R.O.:  10 Business days
BID NUMBER:   1677N DISTRICT CONTACT:  Dawn Vega MIN QTY FOR FREE FREIGHT: None
CONTRACT PERIOD:   01.01.26 - 12.31.26 E-MAIL:  vegad@cajonvalley.net

ADDRESS CATALOG DISCOUNT

W6316 Deisgn Drive
Greenville, WI 54942 35% discount

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

2
 BADMINTON RACKET 26" Length

ea 220
Carlton/Dunlop Aeroblade 
3000

1507804
 $                                                         7.15 1,573.00$                      

3
Shuttlecocks set of 6, Yellow

Set 625 Carlton T800 Yellow 8723
 $                                                         8.25 5,156.25$                      

4
MAVIS Badminton Shuttlecocks set of 
6, Yellow 

Set 400 Yonex Mavis 350, 
Yellow

5
Tournament shuttlecocks set of 6, 
white

set 20
Carlton F2 Tournament 
T900WHBL

004015
 $                                                         9.48 189.60$                           

6
Plastic Wiffle Baseballs set of 12, size 
9", white

set 10
Champion Sports Plastic 
Baseball Set PLBB

1503870
 $                                                         6.50 65.00$                             

7
All-Synthetic Baseball Glove 13”L, 
select hand Left or Right

ea 10
Rawlings RSB Synthetic-
Leather P-RSB130GB No Bid

8
Bat, aluminum, size 29”

ea 3
Easton Havoc YSB22HAV10 
29/19

2004831
 $                                                      47.19 141.57$                           

9
Bat, aluminum, size 31”

ea 3
Easton Havoc YSB22HAV10 
30/20

2004832
 $                                                      41.23 123.69$                           

10

Bat, aluminum, size 32” 
ea 3

Easton ESD4HML25 - 
ESD4HML HAMMER 12 LOAD 
25

2051527
 $                                                      41.23 123.69$                           

11
Basketball adjustable portable court 
system (44" backboard)

ea 15 Lifetime Pro  90690
No Bid

School Specialty  
REFER TO BID #1677N ON ALL PO'S

Phone:   310-200-5778
Fax:         888-388-6344

Sita Beasley
sita.beasley@schoolspecialty.com

National Brand Line Items

Removed by Addendum

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
 AWARDED VENDOR LIST

VENDOR NAME
PHONE/ 

FAX NUMBERS
CONTACT NAME

NCEPC Board Approval Date: 12/3/2025 Page 1 of 9
Amendment No: 1

Approved Amendment Date: 2/11/2026



North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

National Brand Line Items

12

Basketball, Cross Court, 
indoor/outdoor, composite, official 
size

ea 25 Spalding Excel TF-500 2120813

 $                                                      20.97 524.25$                           

13

Basketball net, heavy duty anti-whip
ea 55 Champion Sports #400 9521

 $                                                         1.68 92.40$                             

14
Net, basketball, heavy cord, 
polyethylene outdoor

ea 35
3mm, 12 loop, braided 
polyethylene, outdoor

Spalding-
8235SR

15
Basketball Rims/goals 12 loop heavy, 
double rim

ea 15 Bison BA37N 2023925
 $                                                   150.13 2,251.95$                      

16
Basketball, indoor/outdoor, rubber 
covered, size 29.5" 

ea 594
Mikasa BX1000 Series Rubber 
BX1000

633487
 $                                                      11.95 7,098.30$                      

17

Basketball, intermediate size 28.5", 
rubber covered waterproof ea 594

Wilson NCAA Legend 
Intermediate Basketball 
WZ2007601XB6

2092318
 $                                                      24.02 14,267.88$                    

18
Basketball, intermediate size, 28.5", 
composite leather 

ea 15 Spalding TF1000 2932174784 2121256
 $                                                      78.07 1,171.05$                      

19

Basketball, junior size 27.5", rubber 
covered waterproof

ea 600
Spalding Varsity TF-150 
Rubber Basketball SPA010X

022363
 $                                                         8.50 5,100.00$                      

20

Basketball, official size #7, 29.5", 
rubber covered waterproof

ea 594
Spalding Varsity TF-150 
Rubber Basketball SPA010X

022360
 $                                                         8.50 5,049.00$                      

21

Basketball, official size 29.5", 
composite game ball ea 30

Spalding Top Flite Excel TF 500 
Compbasketball 768178

2120813
 $                                                      20.97 629.10$                           

22
Basketball, official size,29.5"  
composite leather

ea 5 Spalding TF1000 2932174783 1611768
 $                                                      78.07 390.35$                           

23
Men's Basketball, official size 7, 29.5", 
composite covered

ea 15
Wilson Evolution Official 
Basketball 1013900

006892
 $                                                      94.58 1,418.70$                      

24
Women's Basketball, size 28.5", 
Intermediate

ea 30 Spalding TF-150 2932173762 022362
 $                                                         8.85 265.50$                           

25
Women's Basketball, size 6, 28.5", 
rubber covered

ea 30
Mikasa BX1000 Series Rubber 
BX1000

633488
 $                                                      11.95 358.50$                           

Removed by Addendum
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North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

National Brand Line Items

26

Basketball, junior size 5, 27.5", rubber 
covered, rainbow/assorted colors, set 
of 6

set 32 Champion Sports RBB2SET

2216570
2216573
2216575
2216574
2216571
2216572  $                                                      36.19 1,158.08$                      

27
Basketball Size 6

ea 100
WILSON EVOLUTION BSKB 
NFHS 28.5"

006893
 $                                                   106.41 10,641.00$                    

28
Basketball Size 7

ea 100
WILSON EVOLUTION BSKB 
NFHS 29.5"

006892
 $                                                      94.58 9,458.00$                      

29
Ball Locker up to 30 balls ea 30

Champion Sports Ultimate 
Ball Locker 1568538

1568538
 $                                                   417.94 12,538.20$                    

30
Discatcher Pro Disc Golf Target, 
Portable Mount

ea 5 Innova DCPRO28-Port 2125391
 $                                                   500.00 2,500.00$                      

31
Traveler Disc Golf Target ea 10

Innova Traveler DISCatcher 
Portable Disc Golf Target 
DCTRAVXX

030565
 $                                                   133.33 1,333.30$                      

32
Golf Discs, COMPETITION PLASTIC 
DISC, SET OF SIX, 125 G 

set 10 Champion Sports FD125SET 2217634
 $                                                      16.11 161.10$                           

33
Frisbee, tournament quality pro size 
10.75", 130g

ea 52
Frisbee Pro Classic Wham-O 
Wham-O 8110

2216538
 $                                                         4.55 236.60$                           

34

Football, Game Ball,  official size, 
leather ea 10

FOOTBALL WILSON LEATHER 
Wilson Mfg # WF1007601IBOF

022539
 $                                                   111.06 1,110.60$                      

35

Football, intermediate size, rubber 
covered

ea 447 Wilson NCAA Composite 
Football WTF1662XB 2216998

 $                                                      17.02 7,607.94$                      

36
Football, junior size, rubber covered ea 85 Wilson NCAA Composite 

Football WTF1663X 2216997
 $                                                      17.02 1,446.70$                      

37
Football, official size, 29.5", weight 
rubber covered

ea 5 Mikasa F5000 8040900510 633490
 $                                                      10.02 50.10$                             

38
Football, official size, leather ea 10

Wilson GST NCAA 1003 
3F1003

002539
 $                                                   108.70 1,087.00$                      

39
Youth GST Game Football, size 9

ea 100 Wilson WTF1320IB 022540
 $                                                      84.70 8,470.00$                      

40
Flag Football Belts, 6 pack, various 
sizes and colors

Set 300 Champro A105-A1056-A106
No Bid

NCEPC Board Approval Date: 12/3/2025 Page 3 of 9
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North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

National Brand Line Items

41
Hockey Puck, Vinyl, Shield Soft ea 10

Shield Soft Shot Vinyl Floor 
Hockey Puck GY262P

2002867
 $                                                         3.06 30.60$                             

42

Hockey Set, 12 sticks with 42” 
aluminum shaft, 2 replacement 
blades, 2 hockey balls, 2 plastic pucks 
and instruction booklet

set 10
Shield Aluminator Basic 
Hockey Set 1057XXXX

027063

 $                                                   194.13 1,941.30$                      

43

HOCKEY STICK SET, 36" L SHAFT, Set 
12 sticks, two pucks and two 
replacement blades

Set 10
HOCKEY STICKS LIFETIME SET 
INDOOR 36 INCH Shield 888

1321032

 $                                                   104.00 1,040.00$                      

44 Lacrosse Ball, orange, soft-vinyl plastic ea 20 STXball 10-735 2217676  $                                                         5.08 101.60$                           

45
PICKLEBALL PADDLE

ea 200 ONIX RECRUIT V3 214000
 $                                                      32.50 6,500.00$                      

46
Pickleball paddles, junior ea 75

Pickle-Ball Rally Meister 
60886604511

2120888
 $                                                      10.61 795.75$                           

47

Pickleball Paddle Set, 2 paddles and 2 
balls, 2 player

set 15
Franklin Activator Pickleball 
Paddle Set 52742

2121077
 $                                                      22.19 332.85$                           

48
Pickleball Paddles set 75

Franklin Aluminum Pickleball 
Paddle 2572544110

2149525
 $                                                      29.95 2,246.25$                      

49 Pickleballs dzn 75 Franklin X-40 Outdoor 2572545989

50

Dura Fast-40 Pickleballs, 12 pack
Dzn 50

ONIX DURA FAST-40 Sampler 
pack – assorted neon colors, 
set of 12

2121086
 $                                                      29.11 1,455.50$                      

51

OUTDOOR PICKLEBALL BALL, 12 pack
Dzn 200

FRANKLIN X-40 OUTDOOR 
PICKLEBALLS DZN

2216501
 $                                                      22.56 4,512.00$                      

52

Pickleball Net, Portable, Regulation 
size 22' wide, Rhino Pickleball ea 5

 Champion  Sports PORT-A-
NET SET 20 INCH  PA20SET 

2004722

 $                                                   140.00 700.00$                           

53
Junior Rugby Ball, Polyester, size 4

ea 30 Mikasa 1507814
No Bid

54
Rugby Ball, Polyester, size 5

ea 30
No Bid

Removed by Addendum
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North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

National Brand Line Items

55 Rugby Ball, Polyester, Jr.  size 4 ea 30 Mikasa 1507814 No Bid

56
Soccer Ball, size 5 ea 30

Nike Academy Soccer Ball 
BO8QVS No Bid

57
Soccer ball, official size #4, rubber

ea 1308
BALL SOCCER SIZE 4 
WHITE/BLACK Mikasa SS40

1282628
 $                                                      11.88 15,539.04$                    

58

Soccer ball, official size #5, rubber 
covered waterproof ea 287

SOCCERBALL 5 RUBBER 
Mikasa  S3000

633485
 $                                                         8.98 2,577.26$                      

59
Soccer ball, official size #4, synthetic 
leather, BLUE

ea 781
Champro Sports Renegade 
SB504RY No Bid

60

Soccer ball, size 5, synthetic leather, 
BLUE ea 99

NCAA VANTAGE SOCCER 
Wilson WS3004005XB05

2125258
 $                                                      18.22 1,803.78$                      

61 Soccer ball, size #5, 32 panel nylon ea 287 Champro Sports 2217623  $                                                         8.98 2,577.26$                      

62

Soccer Ball, White/Black, size 5, 
composite ea 10

WC647929 - SPALDING TF-
5000

2121108
 $                                                      41.60 416.00$                           

63

Soccer foam ball, size 5,  9" 8" 
diameter

ea 10 Champion Sports Rhino 
Skin RS76 RS75 2216860

 $                                                      19.34 193.40$                           

64

Soccer ball, size 5, rubber covered, 
rainbow/assorted colored, set of 6

set 39
Mikasa Soft Soccer Ball Set - 
Assorted colored Mikasa-
SS50SET

1507819

 $                                                      80.21 3,128.19$                      

65
NCAA  Soccer Ball, size 5

ea 100
VEZA GAME SOCCER BALL
Wilson WS1001501XB05

2025181
 $                                                      76.47 7,647.00$                      

66
Soccer goal 4'x6'x2' with net

ea 4
GOAL SOCCER PORTABLE 
ULTRA PRO II Mylec 646

022239
 $                                                      83.20 332.80$                           

67

Soccer Goal, Pop Up 6’, set includes 2 
goals, pegs and carrying bag

ea 46
Pugg 6ft. Portable Soccer 
Goals (pair) PUGG

2121179
 $                                                      71.88 3,306.48$                      

68
Soccer Goal, steel, 4” heavy duty mesh 
netting, 6’H x 12’W x 4’D

ea 10 Pro Style Soccer Goal W8577 025079
 $                                                   124.80 1,248.00$                      

69

COATED HIGH-DENSITY FOAM 
SOCCER BALL, Indoor Quite Ball, Size 4

ea 10 Champion Sports SFC 704881
 $                                                      12.98 129.80$                           

NCEPC Board Approval Date: 12/3/2025 Page 5 of 9
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North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

National Brand Line Items

70 Futsal Ball ea 100 Champion Sports FTS3 2217624  $                                                      16.75 1,675.00$                      

71

Softball, sponge center and rubber 
cover, size 12” dzn 13

Champion Sports softball, dz 
ST12

1568502
 $                                                      64.98 844.74$                           

72
12″  NFHS FASTPITCH SOFTBALL – 12 
PACK

Dzn 100
Dudley Softballs  THUNDER 
HEAT- 12 pack

2216593
 $                                                   121.68 12,168.00$                    

73

Tennis ball, heavy duty optic yellow for 
practice (3/can), no blemishes

can 10
Wilson All-Court Practice 
Tennis Balls T1029

006449
 $                                                         5.55 55.50$                             

74

ALUMINUM TENNIS RACKET, Midsize 
27" L

ea 50 Champion Sports ATR30 2122772
 $                                                      22.36 1,118.00$                      

75

Tetherball, official size 7 weight rubber 
covered rope well 15’ nylon braided 
rope

ea 333
BALL TETHERBALL SOFT 
TOUCH Mikasa T8000S

029854

 $                                                      14.98 4,988.34$                      

76
Tetherball, Super SoftTouch Cushion ea 346

Mikasa Soft Shell Tetherball 
Mikasa-T8000S 

029854
 $                                                      14.98 5,183.08$                      

77
100ft Hank Natural White. 1/4 inch, #8, 
Cotton/Polyester cord/rope

pack 30 Seaco ROC310
No Bid

78

Volleyball- Black/Red
ea 200

VOLLEYBALL - NFHS 
APPROVED - SIZE 5 OFFICIAL 
SIZE RED/WHITE/BLACK
Mikasa VQ2000CAN

1569077

 $                                                      35.49 7,098.00$                      

79

Volleyball in at least four different 
colors ea 75

BALL VOLLEYBALL 
COMPOSITION Mikasa 
VQ2000-NAV

020890
 $                                                      31.55 2,366.25$                      

80

Volleyball, synthetic leather, official 
size & weight #5, 18 panel ea 60

WILSON PRO TOUR 
SYNTHETIC LEATHER 
VOLLEYBALL Wilson 

2088438
 $                                                      17.36 1,041.60$                      

81

Volleyball net, top grade ply or nylon, 
32 x 3, white binding with steel cables

ea 21
Champion Sports Deluxe 
Volleyball Net  CSIVN700

2216592
 $                                                      89.73 1,884.33$                      

82
Pair of portable heavyweight volleyball 
standards w/ poles

pair 20
Jaypro Easy Play Game 
Standard Set EZ-55

015260
 $                                                   252.00 5,040.00$                      
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North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

National Brand Line Items

83

Playground, size 6” diameter, rubber, 
red

ea 517 Champion Rhino PG6RD 2217627
 $                                                         4.98 2,574.66$                      

84

Playground ball, weather resistant, 
natural rubber cover w/nylon windings, 
7" nylon rope, RED

ea 149 Champion Rhino PG7RD 2217628
 $                                                         4.37 651.13$                           

85

Playground ball, weather resistant, 
natural rubber cover w/nylon windings, 
8.5" nylon rope

ea 2573
BALL PLAYGROUND RED 8.5
Champion PG8.5-RED

722221
 $                                                         4.98 12,813.54$                    

86

Playground ball, weather resistant, 
natural rubber cover w/nylon windings 
10" nylon rope, RED

ea 559 Champion Rhino PG10RD 2217629
 $                                                         4.98 2,783.82$                      

87

Playground ball, weather resistant, 
natural rubber cover w/nylon windings, 
13" nylon rope, RED

ea 779 Champion Rhino PG13RD 2217630
 $                                                      11.02 8,584.58$                      

88

Playground ball, weather resistant, 
natural rubber cover w/nylon windings, 
16" nylon rope, RED

ea 40 Champion Rhino PG16RD 2217631
 $                                                      14.08 563.20$                           

89

Playground Utility ball 8 ½” Heavy duty 
1216 high impact rubber with nylon 
winding, yellow

ea 23 Champion Max  RMX85 2217632
 $                                                         7.95 182.85$                           

90

Playground utility ball 10" Heavy duty 
1216 high impact rubber with nylon 
winding, yellow

ea 150 Champion Max  RMX10 2217633
 $                                                         7.95 1,192.50$                      

91

All Terrain, Open Playground Cart, 52" x 
24" x 65"

ea 6
Duracart All Terrain 
Playground Cart 
842569026738

024786
 $                                                   316.67 1,900.02$                      

92

Ladder toss game set with 6 soft rubber 
bolo ball 

set 90

Triumph All Pro Series Press 
Ladder Toss - Includes 6 Soft 
Bolas and Carry Case 35-7307-
2

2120580

 $                                                      55.35 4,981.50$                      

93

SCOOP BALL, SET OF SIX, Rainbow 
Colors

ea 10 Champion Sports SBS1SET 025031
 $                                                      27.82 278.20$                           

94
NYLON JUMP ROPE, Various Lengths ea 300 Champion Sports SR7 394559

 $                                                         2.63 789.00$                           
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North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

National Brand Line Items

95

PLASTIC HOOPS, 36" D, Dozen per Set, 
6 colors dzn 25

HOOPS PLASTIC DELUXE 36 
INCH SET OF 12 Pull-Buoy Mfg 
# 8003D

022350
 $                                                      57.79 1,444.75$                      

96

PLASTIC HOOPS, 30" D, Dozen per Set, 
6 colors dzn 25

HOOP DELUXE 30 IN SET OF 
12 Pull Buoy 8002D

009560
 $                                                      53.95 1,348.75$                      

97

PLASTIC HOOPS, 24" D, Dozen per Set, 
6 colors dzn 25

HOOP DELUXE 24 IN SET OF 
12 Pull-Buoy 8001D

009559
 $                                                      49.34 1,233.50$                      

98 Foam floor mat, 48"x24"x1/2" ea 12 ExerFit Pro foam mat 67-826

99

YOGA MAT, 68" L, Blue, 3Mil Thickness
ea 50

CANDO PER YOGA MAT - BLUE 
- 68 IN X 24 IN X 1/6 IN 
Fabrication Enterprises 30-
2400B

1507021

 $                                                      15.00 750.00$                           
100 Stopwatch, Digital ea 50 Champion Sports 910RD 2217635  $                                                         6.28 314.00$                           

101

DELUXE MESH PINNIE, ADULT, 
Multiple Colors Available, dozen

dzn 10

Champion Sports MPAOR 
NP1BL: blue, 
NP1GD: gold, 
NP1GN: green, 
NP1OR: orange, 
NP1PR: purple, 
NP1RD: red, 
NP1WH: white

2216866

 $                                                      69.11 691.10$                           

102

Vest scrimmage, numbered 1-12, 
youth size all colors dzn 60

PINNIES NUMBERED RED SET 
OF 12 Champion NP2RD

025733
 $                                                      34.58 2,074.80$                      

103
Whistle, pea-style dzn 624

Acme Thunderer 
84256904012

007804
 $                                                      30.48 19,019.52$                    

104
Whistle, pealess, 3 chamber

dzn 10
FOX 40 CLASSIC WHISTLE – 
BLACK

1319279
 $                                                      38.04 380.40$                           

105

Whistle, pealess, assorted colors, with 
mouth guard & lanyard

ea 10
Fox 40 Classic Pealess 9603-
XXXX

2019998

 $                                                         4.68 46.80$                             

106

SAUCER FIELD CONE, SET OF 48 IN SIX 
ASSORTED COLORS, Holder Included

Set 20 Champion Sports SCXSET 006835
 $                                                      28.39 567.80$                           

Removed by Addendum
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North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
Market Basket Bid No. 1677N - PE Supplies

REVISED 1/28/2026

LINE ITEM 
NUMBER Description UOM

Historical 
Usage Manufacturer and Model #:

Awarded Vendor 
Part Number  Bid Price 

 Extended Price based on 
Historical Usage x UOM Price 

National Brand Line Items

107

6"H HIGH-VISIBILITY FLEXIBLE VINYL 
CONE, ORANGE

ea 50 Champion Sports C6OR 2122319
 $                                                         2.79 139.50$                           

108

12"H HIGH-VISIBILITY FLEXIBLE VINYL 
CONE, ORANGE

ea 50 Champion Sports C12OR 2122241
 $                                                         7.55 377.50$                           

109

Ball Bag, Nylon, Heavy-duty, 4" square 
mesh, Drawstring
(Holds up to 10 basketballs) 

ea 50 Champion Sports BC10 2217625
 $                                                         3.63 181.50$                           

110
MESH EQUIPMENT BAG, 48 X 24, 
Colors may vary

ea 50 Champion Sports MB22BK 2217626
 $                                                         3.88 194.00$                           

Vendor:

The percentage discount may be used by districts to order any PE Supplies available from the awarded 
vendor. Although store or generic brand alternatives were not awarded as specific line items, the 35% 
discount off list price applies to all national and store/generic brand PE Supplies that School Specialty 
offers.

Free Shipping

School Specialty, LLC
(Award Recommendation: Total Bid)

Category: % Discount off List Price

Freight Charge for orders under $50.00:

National Brands 35%
Store or Generic Brands 35%
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